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Bids and Awards Committee
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, 2600 Baguio City
EXCERPTS OF MINUTES OF MEETING
7 June 2019 9:14 A - 1:35 PM
Chancellor's Board Room

Presiding:
Members:

Also Present:

VCA lessica K. Carifio, BAC Chair
Prof. Joel M. Addawe, Member
Prof. Jocelyn Rafanan, Member
Prof. Areflano A. Colongon, Jr

Ms. Gloria Q. Rodriguera, Member
Ms. Cecile G. Dangawen, TWG

Mr. Rodolfo T. Suyat, TWG

Ms. trene J. Enriquez, Head Secretariat
Mr. Mar P. Viernes, Secretariat
Ms. Segrid Yan A. Bucagan, Secretariat

Ms, Maxinne Charisse R. Guinto, State Auditor

Agenda: I. Opening of bids for the Supply, Delivery, and Instaltation of Various Gym
Equipment for UP Baguio

The meeting was called to order by Prof. Jessica K. Carifio at 9:14 AM.

1 Opening of bids for the Supply, Delivery, and Installation of Various Gym Equipment

for UP Baguio

There are Three (3) bidders who bought bid documents and submitted their bids. The following
were present during the opening of bids:

Name of Bidder Official Receipt Number Date and time of Representative
Submission

Johnson Health Tech- Matrix | 0320912 dated 6 June 2019 | 7 June 2019 at 8:00 AM | Elaine Guzman

Fitness Intelligence Trends 0320916 dated 7 June 2019 | 7 June 2018 at 8:03 AM | Ericson Antonio

E-sports RK International 0320038 date 24 May 2019 | 7 June 2019 at 8:28 AM | Earl Lilam

Ryan Bartolome

Ms. Enriquez informed the body about the following details of the Project:

mpepow

2019;

=@

Approved Budget of the Contract is Php 7,514,4000.00;
Bid Reference No. is UPB BID-2019-018;
PhilGEPS Reference No. is 6193022;

Pre-procurement Conference was conducted on 8 May 2019 at 10:00 AM;
The profect was posted on 16 May 2019;
Notice of Meeting was distributed to the BAC members, TWG, and Observers on 16 May

The Pre-bid Conference was conducted on 24 May 2019 at 9:00 AM;
Pre-bid Conference minutes was posted in the UPB website on 28 May 2019; and

i, Addendum No. 2019-04 about the amendments of technical specifications, change of time
and date of submission bids and opening of Bids was posted in PhilGEPS on 28 May 2019.

The BAC Chair informed the body that the project will be bidded out per item to prevent faiture of
bidding. The whole project consists of Fifty Seven {57) items and will be evaluated per item. The BAC
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componenits shall be considered for the opening and evaluation of financial documents.

Eligibility and Technical Documents

Name of bidder

Remarks

Fitness Intelligence Trends

Eligible and Complying

E-sports RK International

Eligible and Complying

Johnson Health Tech-Matrix

Eligible and Complying

Financial Documents

will open the submitted envelopes starting with the eligibility and technical documents. The BAC will
determine the presence or absence of the required documents to determine eligibility and
compliance of the bidders. Only bids that are found eligible and complying for the technical

Name of Bidder Remarks

Fitness Intelligence Trends Compliant

E-sports RK International Compliant

Johnson Health Tech-Matrix Compliant

FITNESS JOHNSON
INTELLIGENCE E-SPORTS RK HEALYH TECH-
ltem Description TRENDS, INC INTERNATIONAL MATRIX

1 POWER SLED 27,000.00 NO OFFER
2 | LANDMINE BARBELL ATTACHMENT 5,775.00 NO OFFER 5,334.00
3 | OLYMPIC BAR, 28mm 49,875.00 2 ) 70,448.00
4 OLYMPIC BAR,25mm 35,000.00 48,120.00
5 | BARBELL COLLAR NO BID 6,000.00 .
6 BARBELL HOLDER NO BID NO OFFER
7 BARBELL FOAM PAD 5,400.00 NO OFFER
8 | DUMBBELL SET WITH 2- TIER RACK 84,0 150,000.00
9 KETTLE BELL SET WITH RACK NO BID NO OFFER
10 | MEDICINE BALLS WITH RACK NOQ BID NO OFFER
11 | STABILITY HALF BALL 16,500.00 NO OFFER
12 | EXERCISE BALL NO BID NO OFFER
13 | EXERCISE BALL 8,880.00 NO QOFFER
14 | AGILITY LADDER NO BID NO OFFER
15 | JUMP ROPES 3,520.00 NO QFFER
16 | AB WHEELS NO BID NO OFFER
17 | SUSPENSION TRAINER 24,000.00 NO OFFER
18 | RESISTANCE BAND NO BID NO OFFER
19 | RESISTANCE BAND NO BID NO OFFER
20 | RESISTANCE BAND NG BID NO OFFER
21 | RESISTANCE BAND NO BID NO OFFER
22 1 AGILITY CONE SET NO BID NO OFFER
23 | ARTIFICIAL GRASS TURF NO BID NO OFFER
24 | BATTLE ROPE WITH ANCHOR 9,440.00 NO OFFER
25 | BATTLE ROPE WITH ANCHOR 8,640.00 NO QFFER
26 | FOAM ROLLER 14,400.00 NO OFFER
27 | SPEED HURDLES NO BID NO OFFER
28 | TRAP BAR 28,800.00 NO OFFER
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29 | OLYMPIC WEIGHT SET 134,400.00 NO OFFER
30 | PLATE RACK NO OFFER NO BID
31 | Utility Bench 100,000.00 93,796.00
32 | PLYOMETRIC BOX SET NO BID 69,600.00
33 | TIRE FLIP MACHINE NO BID NO OFFER NO BID
34 | POWER RACK 157,500.00 £0,000.00 176,170.00
35 | TREADMILL 860,000.00 970,698.00
36 | ELLIPTICAL MACHINE 400,000.00 371,198.00
37 | SMITH MACHINE 140,000.00 170,149.00
38 | LAT PULLDOWN/ LOW ROW MACHINE 130,000.00 109,799.00
39 | LEG EXTENSION/LEG CURL MACHINE 150,000.00 109,799.00
40 | ABDUCTOR/ ADDUCTOR MACHINE 97,500.00 NO OFFER g
Higher than the
41 | SPINNING BIKE ABC 270,000.00 178,497.00
42 | PECFLY/ REAR DELT MACHINE 150,000.00 100,699.00
43 | CABLE CROSSOVER MACHINE 300,000.00 188,699.00
44 | HACK SQUAT MACHINE WITH PLATE SET NO OFFER 227,035.00
45 | RECUMBENT BIKE 103,850.00 NO OFFER 100,349.00
46 | GLUTE HAM RAISE BENCH NO OFFER 131,998.00
Higher than the B
47 | FLAT BENCH PRESS 36,850.00 ABC 60,000.00 28,849.00
DECLINE BENCH PRESS WITH HORN AND PLATE o
A8 | SET £8,800.00 60,000.00 46,685.00
1 INCLINE BENCH PRESS WITH HORN AND PLATE
49 | SET 78,400.00 60,000.00 42,785.00
50 | 45 DEG LEG PRESS 37,500:00 170,000.00 215,549.00
51 | SHOULDER PRESS BENCH 84,000.00 160,000.00 70,099.00
STANDING PREACHER CURL WITH BAR, PLATE ,
52 | SET, AND COLLARS 112,000.00 NO OFFER 54,223.00
53 | VERTICAL KNEE RAISE WITH BENCH 50,250.00 35,000.00 56,349.00
54 | BENCH ABS 3 35,000.00 43,999.00
55 | FLAT BENCH 47,775.00 NO OFFER 0
56 | ADJUSTABLE DECLINE BENCH 85,600.00 NO OFFER
57 | ABS CRUNCH BENCH 180,000.00 NO OFFER

Johnson Health Tech-Matrix, E-sports RK International, and Fitness Intelligence Trends are subject to

closer evaluation and post-qualification to determine responsiveness to the University’s project
requirements and the project’s technical specifications.

The meeting was adjourned at 1:35 PM,

Prepared by:

Segr,
BAC,

an A. Bucagan
cretariat

Jors

Jessica K. Carifio
BAC, Chairman



