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28 July, 2020

CHARRIE AROMIN
Manager

Republic of the Philippines
UNIVERSITY O TIIE PIHHILIPPINES BAGUIO
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice to Proceed

ACED SCIENCELAB CORPORATION
ACED Bldg. No. 9 Socarro Street Mindanao Avenue
Ext. Brgy. Talipapa Novaliches, QC

Tel. No:02.935.8417

Dear Ms. AROMIN:

Notice is hereby glve]n‘ to ACED SCIENCELAB CORPORATION, represented by its Manager, CHARRIE AROMIN
I

that work may comme
on

ce on the Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Reagents for Office of the Chancellor effective
or calendar day/s after the receipt of this notice.

Upon receipt of this natice, you are responsible for performing the services under the terms and condition of the
agreement and in accordance with the implementation schedule.

Please acknowledge reg

eipt and acceptance of this notice by signing both copies in the space provided below. Keep

one copy and return the other to the University of the Philippines Baguio.

Very truly yours,

J< |
'tw%mu DO D. ROVILLOS

Chancellor

I acknowledge receipt pf this Notice on: AUG 15

Name of Representativie of Bidder: :ME -

Authorized Signature:
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Appendix 61

UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City, Benguet, CAR, PH
VAT Reg. TIN: 000-864-006-00007

PURCHASE ORDER

Office of the Chancellor
Supplier ACED SCIENCELAB CORPORATION P.O. No. » SPMO.GF.20.07.141 (1332)
Address ACED Bdg. No. 9 Socorol Street Mindanao Avenue Ext. Brgy. Talpapa Novalches, QC Date : 28 JUIY, 2020
Contact#/Email 02.935.8417| Mode of Procurement NP - Small Value Procurement
TIN 007-567-919-000 PR No. 12652
Gentlemen:

Please furnish this office the following articles subject to the terms and conditions contained herein:

Place of Delivery :

Supply & Property Management Office, UP Baguio

Delivery Term FOB -Destination

Contact Person

James Benedict E. Bagsic

Payment Term . 20 calendar days

Contact Address

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City, PH

Date of Delivery w30 calendar days

Contact #/Email

074.442.3484 / spmo.upbaguio@up.edu.ph

“wpon receipt of Purchase Order

STOCKINP:OPERTY UNIT DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST AMOUNT
L |Glycerine 5 \ 195.00 975.00
-uxax Nothing Follows mnx-
|
Canvass no. PC20.06.087
(Total Amount in Words): Nine HTndred Seventy Five Pesos 975.00

every day of delay shall be impx

psed on the undelivered item/s.

Conforme:

In case of failure to make thL: full delivery within the time specified above, a penalty of one-tenth (1/10) of one (1) percent of

Very truly yours,

% s—

RAYMUN D. ROVILLOS

Signature over Printed Name of Authorized Official

Chancellor

Designation

Funds Cluster 01 101101

()

Funds Available

MiC ( tonD-4)

ORS/BURS No. : 02. {
Date of the ORS/BURS .

7 2
A

s

O~ - 5 - 4 r .-
ANGAWEN Amount : THE v -~ L
Sunting Officel

sdeb ‘

LY Ve

CLMENT T FICE (O J)
U.P BAGUIG
7
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/deb

02 July, 2020

CHARRIE AROMIN
Manager

ACED SCIENCELAB C(
ACED Bldg. No. 9
Avenue Ext. Brgy. Tali
Tel. No:02.935.8417

Dear Ms. AROMIN:

We are happy to notify

Republic of the Philippines
INIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

DRPORATION
Socorro Street Mindanao
papa Novaliches, QC

you that your bid for the execution for the Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Reagents

for Office of the Chancellor is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to One Thousand Nine

Hundred Fifty Pesos ¢

You are hereby requi
Award.

Very truly yours,

m

Chancellor

Conforme:

only (Php 1,950.00).

red to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of

ame of Rep i
Date: JUL HJE
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Republic of the Philippines
T UNIVERSITY OF TIIE PIHILIPPINES BAGUIO
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

i Procee

28 July, 2020

EMILY MANANSALA

Sales Coordinator

STARLAB MEDICAL AND SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY
Bl L7 Caimito Rd. Extension, Justinville
Subdivision, Bacoor, Cavite

Tel. No:046.471.8707

Dear Ms. MANANSALA:

Notice is hereby given to STARLAB MEDICAL AND SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY, represented by its Sales
Coordinator, EMILY MANANSALA that work may commence on the Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Reagents
for Office of the Chancellor effective on or calendar day/s after the receipt of this
notice.

Upon receipt of this notice, you are responsible for performing the services under the terms and condition of the
agreement and in accordance with the implementation schedule.

Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by signing both copies in the space provided below. Keep
one copy and return the other to the University of the Philippines Baguio.

Very truly yours,

e —
YMUNDO D. ROVILLOS

Chancellor

Authorized Signature:

I acknowledge receipt of this Notice on: QA - 0"\ -0 N
Name of Representative of Bidder: AL A\ 0N A

Zdeb page 1of 1



Appendix 61

UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City, Benguet, CAR, PH
VAT Reg. TIN: 000-864-006-00007
PURCHASE ORDER
Office of the Chancellor
Supplier STARLAB MEDICAL AND SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY P.O. No. : SPMO.GF.20.07.140 (1333)
Address B1 L7 Caimito Rd. Extension, Justinville Subdivision, Bacoor, Cavite Date : 28 July, 2020
Contact#/Email 046.471.8707 Mode of Procurement : NP - Small Value Procurement
TIN 115-735-600-000 PR No. : 12652
Gentlemen:

Please furnish this office the following articles subject to the terms and conditions contained herein:

Place of Delivery : Supply & Property Management Office, UP Baguio

Contact Person James Benedict E. Bagsic

Contact Address Governor Pack Road, Baguio City, PH

Contact #/Email 074.442.3484 / spmo.upbaguio@up.edu.ph

Delivery Term
Payment Term
Date of Delivery

: FOB -Destination
: 20 calendar days
. 30 calendar days
upon receipt of Purchase Order

STOCK/NF:!OPERTY UNIT DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST AMOUNT
N
X Hydrogen Peroxide 3% (1vol), per bottle i | 480.00 480.00
-rax Nothing Follows mxx- \
Canvass no., PC20.,06.087
(Total Amount in Words): Four Hundred Eighty Pesos 480.00

In case of failure to make the full delivery within the time specified above, a penalty of one-tenth (1/10) of one (1) percent of

every day of delay shall be imposed on the undelivered item/s.

Woronpha
Fmily Vs Maman cala

Conforme:

Very truly yours,

e o

RAYMUNDO D. ROVILLOS

Slgnaturé over printed name of supplier

o2~ 04 20 W

Signature over Printed Name of Authorized Offlcia'-g

Chancellor

Date

Designation

Funds Cluster n4 1nesns M ( LOVID Q)

Funds Available

¢ a gann

i 12 2020

ORS/BURS No. :02 11014104.4020 . 03.655

Date of the ORS/BURS : e _ .
1
Amount : 490 ]
v 1

/deb

MANAGLMENT OFFICE (o J]
u.p am;g;ﬁé
1



/dcb

Republic of the Philippines
UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

No of Award

02 July, 2020

EMILY MANANSALA

Sales Coordinator

STARLAB MEDICAL AND SCIENTIFIC APPARATUS SUPPLY
Bl L7 Caimito Rd. Extension, Justinville
Subdivision, Bacoor, Cavite

Tel. No:046.471.8707

Dear Ms. MANANSALA:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the execution for the Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Reagents
for Office of the Chancellor is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to Four Hundred Eighty

Pesos only (Php 480.00).

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of

Award.

Very truly yours,
I

YMUNDO D. ROVILLOS
Chancellor

Conforme:

T\ L Mmanca,,

(Name of Repfesentative of Bidder)

Date: m_nq s V020
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Canva

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF

5S no. PC20.06.087

ITEM
NO.

Qry

UNIT

PARTICULARS

JAYYAM
ENTERPRISES

STARLAB
MEDICAL AND
SCIENTIFIC
APPARATUS
SUPPLY

Date: 02 July, 2020

ACED
SCIENCELAB
CORPORATION

BELMAN
LABORATORIES

3% Hydrogen Peroxide, 200 mL

500.00

MO BID

OFFER:

Hydrogen Peroxide 3% (1vol), per bottle

bt

Absolute Alcohol, 100%, 2.5lit/bot

2,787.30

NO 81D

OFFER:

Absolute Alcohol,100%, 2.5lit/bot, Chem Supply

bt!

Absolute Ethanol, pure, 99.9%, 2.5L

2,787.30

OFFER:

Absolute Ethanol, pure, 99.9%, 4L, JT Baker

btl

Ammonium sulfate, 500g, reagent grade, with no less that
3yrs expiration date from the date of purchase

OFFER:

4,250.00

935.00

Ammonium sulfate, 500g, reagent grade, with no less that
3yrs expliration date from the date of purchase, HI Medla

990.00

bt

Benzoic acid, 500g,with no less that 3yrs expliration date
from the date of purchase

NO B0

6,500.00

1,375.00

btl

Blood Agar base, 500g

3,720.25

kg

Borax

OFFER:

2,500.00

A

i)

1,500.00

Borax, Technical

btl

Bovine serum albumin, 25g, heat shock fraction, pH 7,
298%,with no less that 3yrs expiration date from the date
of purchase

OFFER:

Bovine serum albumin, 10ml, heat shock fraction, pH 7,
298%,with no less that 3yrs expiration date from the date
of purchase, per Vial

930.00

Bovine serum albumin, 50g, heat shock fraction, pH 7,
298%,with no less that 3yrs expliration date from the date
of purchase, Si-Al #A9647

bt

Castor OIl (500mi/btl)

NO BlD

340.00

10

N

pck

Citric acid (500g/pack)

NO BID

920.00

21,360.00

NO 81D

770.00

OFFER:

Citric acld (500g/pack), Food Grade

11

btl

Coconut OIl (500mL/btl)

12

cby

Denatured alcohol, 20L carboy

180.00

950.00

2,400.00

1,800.00

13

bt

Diethyl ether, 2.5L, with no less that 3yrs expliration date
from the date of purchase

NO BID

14

NI W N[N

cby

Ethanol, 95%, technical grade, carboy

4,008.75

m
o 810 Iy

15

Glycerine

O BID

OFFER:

419800700

2,500.00

i

1,467.00

Glycerine, Technical

380.00

btl

Hydrogen Peroxide 30%,500m|/bot

MO 81D

NO BID

3,700.00

OFFER:

Hydrogen Peroxide 3%, 1L/bot

950.00

btl

LB Broth with Agar, 2509

MO BID

OFFER:

LB Broth with Agar, 250g, Si-Al #2897

18

bt

Mcconkey Agar, 500g

3,350.00

OFFER:

100}

Mcconkey Agar, 500g, Titan Media

2,180.00

19

btl

Napthaleen Acitic Acid

NO BID

OFFER:

Napthaleen Acitic Acid, 100g

2,420.00

btl

Nuclelc aclid stain (non-carcinogenic), 1ml tube

NO BiD

NO BID

btl

Nutrient Agar ,500g/bot

3,925.00

NO BID vﬂ(

o=

TB50700.

OFFER:

Nutrient Agar ,500g/bot Titan Medla

2,255.00

btl

Olive Oil (500mL/btl)

650.00 [/

/deb

CERTIFIED
OF THE

44500001

TRUR copy
ORIGINAL

NO BID
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Canva

!

SS 19, RC20.06.087

ITEM

NO.

UNIT

PARTICULARS

JAYYAM
ENTERPRISES

STARLAB

MEDICAL AND ACED
SCIENTIFIC SCIENCELAB
APPARATUS CORPORATION

SUPPLY

Date: 02 July, 2020

BELMAN
LABORATORIES

23

bt

Petroleum ether, reagent grade, 4L, with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase

NO BID

OFFER:

Petroleum ether, reagent grade, 4L, with no less that 3yrs
expiration date from the date of purchase, JTB

4,450.00

Petroleum ether, reagent grade, 4L, with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase, Labscan

24

bt!

Phenol Detached Crystals-500g, crystalline form, with no
less that 3yrs expiration date from the date of purchase

NO BID

NO BID MO BID

OFFER:

Phenol Detached Crystals-500g, crystalline form, with no
less that 3yrs expiration date from the date of purchase,
Loba Chemie

25

bt

Phenolphthaleln solution (60ml/bottle)

NO iD

OFFER:

%’,‘ﬂ/ ﬂaﬂ“o 3
(ERREI R i 5

260.00

Phenolphthaleln solution (100ml/bottle), SI-Al #219236

2,775.00

26

kg

Potassium carbonate

1,085.00

OFFER:

Potasslumcarbonate, Technical

Potassium carbonate, 500g

975.00

27

kg

Potassium Hydroxide Solution

OFFER:

Potassium Hydroxide Flakes

Potassium Hydroxide Solution, 100mI

00060]

28

bt

Potassium lodide, 500g, with no less that 3yrs expiration
date from the date of purchase

4,990.00

OFFER:

R

200.00

Potassium iodide, 500g, with no less that 3yrs explration
date from the date of purchase, Labscan

29

Propylene glycol

NO BID

30

bt

Sodium bicarbonate, reagent grade, 500g, with no less that
3yrs expiration date from the date of purchase

5,170.00

480,01 1,925.00 o

NO 8ID

OFFER:

.

i

Jy

Sodium bicarbonate, reagent grade, 1 kg, with no less that
3yrs expliration date from the date of purchase, Labscan

1,375.00

31

11

btl

Sodium hydroxide pellets,500g, with no less that 3yrs
expliration date from the date of purchase

NO BID

NO

L

OFFER:

Sodium hydroxide pellets,500g, with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase, Technical

380.00

Sodium hydroxide pellets, 1 kg, with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase, Labscan

32

kg

Sodium Lauryl Sulfate

OFFER:

950.00

Sodium Lauryl Ether Sulfate Tech

480.00

Sodium Lauryl Sulfate, Loba Chemle, 500g

33

bt

Sodium Nitrite-500g, reagent grade with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase

NO BID

NO BID

OFFER:

1,050.00

Sodium Nitrite-500g, reagent grade with no less that 3yrs
expiration date from the date of purchase, Loba Chemie

34

kg

Stearic acld

OFFER:

4,400.00

Stearic acid, Technical

950.00

Stearic acld, Loba Chemle

1,700.00

35

kg

Stearyl Alcohol

387.00

OFFER:

Stearyl Alcohol, Technical

Stearyl Alcohol, Si-Al #0709

36

bt

6,932.00

r LIL, = '
with no less that 3yrs expiration date from the date of

nurcha

o8I0 2,800.00

OFFER:

Sulfuric acld-concentrated, 2.5L, 95-98%, reagent grade,
with no less that 3yrs expiration date from the date of
purchase, Labscan

btl

Triethanolamine (500mL/btl)

NO BID

OFFER:

Triethanolamine (500mL/btl), Technical

175000}

/dch
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