Supply & Property Management Office
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
VAT Reg. TIN: 000-864-006-00007

PURCHASE ORDER

VERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

Human Kinetics Program
Supplier : F-Lira General Merchandise PO No.: SPMO-GF-20-10-227
Address : A. Luna St., Poblacion North, Solano, Nueva Vizcaya Date: 19-Oct-2020
Telephone No.: (0926) 451-2153 Mode of Procurement:
E-mail: flira_genmdse @yahoo.com NP - Small Value Procurement
TN: e PR No.: 13036
Gentlemen:

Please furnish this Office the following articles subject to the terms and conditions contained herein:

Place of Delivery:

Supply and Property Management Office (SPMO), UP Baguio

Delivery Term:

Contact Person: James Benedict E. Bagsic E.0.B. - Destination (UP Baguio)
Contact Address: ~_Governor Pack Road, Baguio City Payment Term:
20 calendar days
Contact#/Email: _(074) 442-3484/jebagsic@up.edu.ph Date of Delivery:
30 calendar days after receipt of P.O,
Stock/ : P :
Pmp;:y No. | Unit Description Qty. Unit Cost Amount
Supply and Delivery of Photographic and Audio Equipment
of the Institute of Management
pc  |Tripod 1 £ 9,500.00 #9,500.00
pc__ |Wireless microphone 1 #9,500.00 #9,500.00
***Nothing Follows***
Canvass Nos.: PC-20-10-189
(Total Amount in Words): Nineteen Thousand Pesos £ 19,000.00

Conforme:

In case of failure to make the full delivery within the time specified above,
day of delay shall be imposed on the undelivered item/s.
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a penalty of one-tenth (1/10) of one percent for every

Very truly yours,

/ et
RAYMURDO D. ROVILLOS,

Signature over Printed Name of Supplier
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Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.upb.edu.ph

Notice to Proceed

October 19, 2020

Franzell Lira G. Habon

Proprietor

F-Lira General Merchandise

A. Luna St., Poblacion North, Solano, Nueva Vizcaya
(0926) 451-2153

Dear Ms. Habon:

Notice is hereby given to F-Lira General Merchandise represented by its Proprietor,
Franzell Lira G. Habon, that work may commence on the Supply and Delivery of

Photographic and Audio Equipment effective on or day/s after
the receipt of this notice.

Upon receipt of this notice, vou are responsible for performing the services under the terms
and conditions of the Agreement and in accordance with the Implementation Schedule.

Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by signing both copies in the space
provided below. Keep one copy and return the other to the University of the Philippines
Baguio.

Very truly yours,

R(M . -
YMUNDO D. ROVILI ( )i‘K

Chancellor

Conforme:
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(Name of Representative of Bidder)

Date: NOV 06 2020
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- 1y BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR THE
PH RAPHIC AND AUDIO E NT OF B 0
Canvass no. PC-20-10-189 Date: 13 October 2020
Item X Tarilja Ulytech F-Lira General Rynav
No. PARTE 8 Uit Coss Enterprises Trading Merchandise | Enterprises
QTY | UNIT
Supply and Delivery of Photographic and Audio Equipment
(RFQ No. 1749)
1 1 set | 3200K-BB500K LED Video Lighting kit with batteries and Remote 25,000.00 35,000.00 18,000.00 no bid
Offer:
LED Video Lighting w/ Batteries and Remote, Set includes: 2 pes
Yongnuo LED video lights; 2 pes Battery Charger of NP-FE50 24.990.00
Battery; 4 pes Battery NP-FS50; 2 pe Light Stand 6ft.; 1 pe Jenbei ‘N
Bag for Video Lights
2 1 set |Mirrorless Digital Camera with 15-45mm lens 40,000.00 38,600.00 no bid
Offer:
Mirrorless Digital Camera with 15-45mm lens, Fuji X-T200 48,995.00
Mirrorless Digital Camera with 15-45mm lens, Fuji X-T100 39,990.00
3 1 pc |Triped 15,000.00 9,600.00 no bid
Offer:
Tripod, Benro TMA37A, 16 kgs max load 10,4985.00
Tripod, without ball head, Benro TMA47AL Long Series 4 14.990.00
Mach3 Aluminum Tiipod i i
4 1 pc |Wireless microphone 18,000.00 19,896.00 9,600.00 no bid
Offer:
Wireless microphone, Rode Wireless Go Compact Wireless 14,995.00
Microphone System i
Delivery Period 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
ACTION TAKEN:

For items 1-4, F-Lira General Merchandise is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder as to requirements, technical specifications and as per written

recommendation from the UP Baguio BAC Technical Working Group.

.
Committee on Bids and Awards:

T

JESSICA K. CARIN,
Chair
0S8 48! 0. DACANAY
ice Chair
—
Oé M. ADDAWE
Member
Action of Head of the
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D. ROVILLOS
Chancellor
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