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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR THE
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF LABORATORY GLASSWARES, SUPPLIES
AND CHEMICALS FOR UP BAGUIO
Q Canvass no, PG-22-03-081 Date: 14 March 2022
I Chemline Starlab Medical
tem CULAR : . Aced Sciencelab | and Scientific Mt. Zion _ Serine Belman Labotech
XNo., PARTI S Unit Cost Sdenhl?c Corporation Apparatus Scientific, Inc. JERR Marketing Enterprises Laboratories Trading
Corporation
Supply
QTY | UNIT
Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals
(RFQ No. 2388)
100mL beaker, borosilicate glass, with thermal shock resistance and :
1 1 i ' * ] 2,580.00 no bid
pox mechanical strength, 12/pck 5000.00 N :
Offer: T
100mL beaker, Pyrex #1000, per piece R22.00 N
100mL beaker, borosilicate glass, per piece "o ,
100mL beaker, Pyrex #1000, per pack . 2,860.00 « |
C 100mL beaker, Pyrex #1000-100, low form, double scale, N 3.000.00
- graduated, 100 ml, per pack ) ’
Beakep, griffin, low form wy spout, borosilicate glass, 100ml, Class N 8C.00
A Borosil, per piece \
| Beaker, low form, 100ml, Cordial, per pack 1,057.45 ~
2 100 re_ |10mI/ec clear glass vial with rubber stopper/cover 20.00 . nobid 40.00 no bid no bid no bid <, 1o bid
Offer: _ N\ '
10mlL/ce Ampicillin bottle w/ rubber septum 250.00 , |
Glass vial 8 ml w/ rubber lined screw cap - kimax N 49.00 , I , .
3 100 D¢ |R0mI/ce clear glass vial with rubber stopper/cover 30.00 no bid \ 50.00 « no bid nobid no bid no bid
Offer:
. R0mb/cc Armnpicillin bottle with rubber septum 380.00 | ]
Glass vial 16 m] (21 x 70mm) w/ rubber lined screw cap - kimax N\ 54.00 \ |
80mL beaker, borosilicate glass, with thermal shock resistance and ‘ .
4 1 ! ' . 2,500.00 no bid
g pok mechanical strength, 18/pck 5000.00 0.0 .
Offer:
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Canvass no. PC-22.03-081

Date: 14 March 20R2

Item
No.

PARTICULARS

Unit Cost

Chemline
Scientific
Corporation

Aced

Starlab Medical
and Scientific

Corporation

Apparatus
Supply

M4, Zion
Scientific, Inc.

JERR Marketing

Serine
Enterprises

Belman
Taboratories

Labotech
Trading

QTY

UNIT

Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals

B0ml: beaker,Scharlay 0033550204, 12 pes/ pack

2,900.00,

" 50mL beaker,Pyrex, per piece

Y

81,00

50mL beaker,Pyrex, per pack

2,900.00

50mL beaker, Pyrex #1000-50, low form, double scale, graduated,
50 ml, per pack

3,000.00

Beaker, griffin, low form w/ spout, borosilicate glass, 50ml, Class A
Borosil, per piece

Beaker, low form, S0ml, Cordial, per pack

DO

1,269.18 _

100

50mlL/ce clear glass vial with rubber stopper/cover

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid no bid

Offer:

Glass vial 32 ml (R5 x 95mm) w/ rubber lined screw cap - kimax

56.00

30

Laboratory Wipes (Kimwipes) :Single Fly, Lint-free; Size- 4 1/2 in. x
8 1/R in. :280 sheets/box

200.00

R09.00

300.00

no bid

no bid

no bid.

Offer:

Laboratory Wipes, Kimtech, Size- 4 1/2 in. x 8 1/3 in.

260.00

330.00

Laboratory Wipes, Kimtech, Size- 4.83in. x8.4in. (11.0xR1.3
cm), 1 ply

10

btl

Mueller Hinton Agar :M173-500G :500g/btl

3 500.00

1 nobid

Offer:

Mueller Hinton Agar :M173-500G :500g/btl, Hi Media,

3,375.00

Mueller Hinton Agar :M173-500G :500g/btl, Titan

Mueller Hinton Agar :Merck Sigma Cat#1038720500

4,320.00 _

5,493.00,

3,499.00

Mueller Hinton Agar, Dehydrated Culture Media, Titan Media, 500
g

N\

®,550:00

btd

Mueller Hinton Broth No. & :500g/btl

550000

no bid

no bid

pobid no bid

Offer:

Mueller Hinton Broth No. &: 500g/bt]; Hi Media

Mueller Hinton Broth No. 2: 500g/btl; Titan

Mueller Hinton Broth No. 2: 500g/bt]; Condalab

 10,340.00N

bil

Nutrient Agar :MOO1-500G :500g/btl

3,500.00

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Nutrient Agar :MOO1-500G :500g/btl, Hi Media

3,450.00

3,450.00 ~

3,495.00

L’
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Canvass no. PC-22-03-031 ' Date: 14 March 2022

1 : Chemli | stariab Medica1
Item ARTICULAR . J Aced Sciencelab and Scientific Mt, Zion o Serine Belman Labotech |
No. PARTI s - UnitGost cf uzn:.::n Corporati App .} -Scientific, Inc. JERR Mar & Enterprises ‘Laboratories “Trading
)] T
F : Supply

QTY ] ONIT ) ] 4
’ Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals ) | ) . )

Nutrient Agar :MOOL-800G :500g/bt), Titan Egie

= - "y - - v - - N = - — 7
10 ‘50 box Surgical Face Mask :3-Ply Filter :175mm x 95mim :At least 110.00 130.00 130.00 140:00 1o bid no bid nobid

50pes/box i} N

Offer: ] ] ; B

Surgical Face Mask :3-Ply Filter :175mm x 95mim :At least
~R50.60
B0pcs/box, Iadoplas \ |

Surgical Face Mask :3-Ply Filter :175mm x 95mm :A$ least
50pcs/box, Aldelai

10 bid wbid ] nobid no bid

11 5 pe | VLG Column with G3 {15-40 microns) porosity Fritz, fabricated 8,000.00 no bid — no bid no bid
- :1-153 mm i

:Inner Diameter-42 mmn

:Outer Diameter: 48 mm :Thickness- 3 mm

12 2 - pck  |Yellow Pipette tips, 1000 pes/bag, Q00uLs capacity 1 so00000 700.00 1,500.00\1 ~ 1,150.00 no bid

: Offer: i \ \ . \ ‘.... =
Yellow Pipstte tips, 1000 pes/bag, 200ul, capacity, Tarson SR1OLH] 1 o ‘

v

b1

Yellow Pipette tips, 1000 pes/bag, R00uLcapacity, Biclogix,
~Cat#2100200

1:650.00 |

3

S . S

95000

Pipette tips,-200ul. bulk, non-sterile, Rnase & Dnase Free, yeliow,
1000 tips/ bag, Biologix

. Tabopette, NCOR 200w, 1000 pos/ bag, yellowtip, Short 6ip 1 I . ] — \ ] os168
13 15 pe  |borosilicate glass funnel, 60 degree angle, shor} stem 20000 | ] 40000_ ] 52500 ] nobid nobid

JOffer: o AN

T Glass Funnsl, 66mm ahort stem, Pyrex # 6180 T T 11 s46.00 ' ' 1 i _ . A
- .] - Glass.Funnel, 90mm diameter, China_ _ .. .___ . ’ . N ~ _ BB0.00N ] .

‘borosilicate glass funnel, 60 degree angle, short stem, 65 mm -
Borosil

borosilicate glass funme), 60 degree angle, short stem, 75 mm -

_ 221.00
Borosil

N

*35.00

borosilicate-glass funnel, 80 degree angle, shert stem, 100 mm - | 1 ) 1 ' ; f
Borosil

borosilicate glass funnel, 1504 60 mm, short stem ; » ] 1 CEl TIFIF-[n(?r}l:/' HE 1 19220

JCORY
=

OF /-VHE ORIGINAL -




Canvass no. PC-22-03-031 .

Date: 14 March Q0R2

ine Starlab Medical
Item . A o Aced Sciencelab | and Scientific Mt, Zion ) Serine Belman Labotech
No. PARTICULARS Unit Cost Scientific Corporation Apparatas Scientific, Tne, JERR Marketing Enterprises Laboratories Trading
Corporation
Supply
_ QTY | UNIT
Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
) Chemicals y
‘ T working ‘ ) 1 7-20 working
Delivery Term: 45-60 wor 30 days 30days 0 days 30 days S0days | oW 30 dags
days days
Documentary Requirements: ~
Mayor's/ Business Perrnit |  comply comply comply comply comply comply comply comply
PhilGEPS Registration Classification Platinom Red. Flatinum Red Platinum Platinum Platinum Platinum
PhilGEFS Registration Number 60821 249447 263873 6247 1073 L6377 R291L 168502
Omnibus Sworn Statement (for ABCs above Php 50,000)
Mode of Procurement: Small Value Procurement
PhilGEPS Refersnce No.: 8439428
C}‘Ca.nvas'seti by: Bri Lumague
- RECOMMENDATION:
Ly
For items J},/ 7-9, Aced Sciencelab Corporation is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
[
For iterns 2,3,5, forreview of technical -specifications.and approved budget for the items.
rd
Foritems 4, 15, 1{ Belman Laboratories is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
/
For ems 6,10, Labotech Trading is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder,
e .
“For item 11, Mt. Zion Scientific, Inc.s:the sole and respensive bidder.
CERTIFIE E COPY M
- OF 17 ORIGINAL
- (1;(23, e e s - S S o e
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Canvass no, PC-22-03-031 Date: 14 March 2022
Starlab Medical
. Chemline
Item CULAR . o Aced Sciencelab | and Scientific _ Mt Zion . : . i Belman Labotach
No. PARTI s Unit Cost Scxt\x%c Corporation Apparatus Scientifie, Inc. JERR Marketing Enterprises Laboratories Trading
Corporation
Supply
QTY | UNIT .
~ Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
s -
[ Chemicals
Committee on Bids and Awards:
SANTOS JOSE 0. DACANAY III
Chair
-~
EL M. ADDAWE GEGILIA FE S.N/A\.BALOS
Vice Chair Member

g, Afmrmns

ORIA Q. RIGU

C"; Memi erj
}

Action of Head of the Procuring Entity:, A ROVED

osa oy

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor

Sgure. . TTRYTY

Maa 29 202 i&

OF THE ORIGINAL b?’ BAGUIO
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Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.upb.edu.ph

i

I | ,
i ; Notice of Award
|

March 14, 2022

k:\lick Sqn D. Jara

Authorized Representative

Belman Laboratories

Belman {Builcing, 78 Cordillera St. cor. Quezon Avenue
Quezon {City, Metro Manila

(:02) 712-0201/ (0917) 190-1907

I i

I:Dear Mr, Jara:

|

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the execution for the Supply and
_peliveriv of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and Chemicals is hereby awarded
‘0 you at a contract price equivalent to Four Thousand Eight Hundred Thirty

T

Pesos (Php 4,830.00).

You are! hereby required to enter into the contract within ten (10) calendar days upon
receipt of this Notice of Award.

Very truly yours,

CEAHNL

CORAZON L. ABANSI

Chancelior
(Mr.) Ni; %on Jara

(Name of Representative of Bidder)

Conforme:

Date:, MAR Zl! nn

léigt
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Governar Pack Road, Baguio City
VAT Reg. TIN: 000-864-006-00007

PURCHASE ORDER

D

.. UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO
A Supply & Property Management Office

Sﬁppliur :
Address:
Telephone Nou

Belman Laboratories

PO No: SPMO-TF-22-04-042 (2517)

Telman Building 78 Cordillera St cor. Quezan Avenue, Quezan Clly, Metro Minila

Date:  5-Apr-2022

(02) 712-0201

Motle of Procurement:

NP - Small Valuc Procurement

E—:mail: ! yomeol130@gmail.com

TIN: ! 000-391-662-000 PR No: 15818
7 . :
lGentlemen: :

| Please l"\:xrnish thiS‘[ Office the following articles subject to the terms and conditions contained herein:

l?lace of Dcl:ivcry:

lSup}:ly and Properly Management Office (SPMO), UP Baguiv

Delivery Term:

{iionlaut Per:son: Briun D, Lumague EO.B. - Destipation (1P Baguia).
Gontact Address: ‘Governor Puck Road, Baguio City Payment Term:
i i ’iﬂ ['ﬂ!ﬁﬂdﬂl' f“”!f'
Contact #/ Email:  _(074) #42-3484/ bdlum ague@up.cduph Date of Delivery:
! | Z-2Qwarking days ofterreceint of L.O..
1 Stock, i .
,,f,:,:z:ly/ N, | ORIt Description Qty. Unit Cost Anmiount
i Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares and Supplies
! Tor DOST-PCIEERD (Arabica)
i Beaker, griffin, low form w/ spout, borosilicate glass, 50ml, Class N
PE A porosil, per piece  KBG1000D12 12 P 60.00 $720.00
! ) Pipette tips, 200ul. bull, non-sterile, Rnase & Dnase Free, yellow, ) .
; Va8 000 1ips/ bag, Biologix KB20-0200 2 b 660.00 P 1,320.00
: A cacilieate glass fi , egrec angle, § - stem, 65 -
| E e borosilicate glass funnel, 60 degree angle, short stem, 65 mm 15 186,00 P 2,790.00

Borosil KBG6140069

1 ¥Nothing Follows™*
[

Canvass no. PC-22-03-031

{"M'otal Ampunt

P 4,830.00

i
n Words): Four Thousand Eight Hundred Thirty Pesos
!

i In cuse of failure to imake the full delivery within the time specified abave, a penulty of one-tenth (1/10) of one perzent for every duy of delay

sh‘[a[l be imposed on the

|

i

I

|
Conforme:

ndelivered item/s.

(Mr.) Nj on Jara

Signature over Printed Name of Supplier

April 25, 2022
Date

Very truly yours,

L]
ROLm}\{IIPOL%‘
Assistant Vice Chancellor for ACadbardc Affairs

: i
I;u nd Cluster:
funds Available:

07 308603  DOCT PCIEERD

(HipoL jRABICA )

ORS/BURS No:  92~308G03- b2 - ol [£2.
Date of the ORS/BURS: — DU-1{-2p22.
pAmount;, “ERTY 4, £€30:0D

AR~ A

i CECILE DAN(?AVEN o ¥ " \
‘ Chief, Atthunting Office 42 ‘14 l A?R 19 2922 &
! t - L S "UQ
e APR 20 2022 QH« &M Vagolof 2
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Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice to Proceed

April 05, 2022

Nick Son D. Jara

Authorized Representative

Belman Laboratories

Belman ;Building, 78 Cordillera St. cor. Quezon Avenue
Quezon City, Metro Manila

(02) 712-0201/ (0917) 190-1907

Dear MrE. Jara:

Notice 1s hereby given to Belman Laboratories represented by its Authorized
Represe;ntative, Nick Son D. Jara, that work may commence on the Supply and
Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and Chemicals effective on
or day/s after the receipt of this notice.

Upon receipt of this notice, you are responsible for performing the services under the
terms and conditions of the Agreement and in accordance with the Implementation
Schedule.

i
Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by signing both copies in the
space pl;'ovided below. Keep one copy and return the other to the University of the
Philippines Baguio.

[
Very tru‘ly yours,

ROLAND M. HIPO
Assistant Vice Charc&Hfor for Academic Affairs

(Mr.) N%ara

(Name 'of Representative of Bidder)

Conforme:

Date: April 25, 2022

1edgt



