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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR THE
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF LABORATORY GLASSWARES, SUPPLIES
AND CHEMICALS FOR UP BAGUIO
O Canvass no, PC-22-08-031 Date: 14 March 2022
Item Ghemtine Aced Sciencelab s?:;a:c?:n?nc:l Mt Zion Serine Belman Labotech
No, PARTICULARS Unit Gost Sﬁmﬁﬁc Lorporation Apparatus Scientific, Inc. JERR Marketing (- Enterprises Laboratories Trading
Corporation Supply
QTY | UNIT
Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals
(RFQ No. 23388)
1 1 ol 100mL i_:eaker, borosilicate glass, with thermal shock registance and 3,000.00 2,560.00 no bid
N mechanical strength, 12/pck N
Qffer: —
100mL beaker, Pyrex #1000, per piece R22.00 \ i
100mL beaker, berosilicate glass, per piece ] %ﬁ%@: ]
100nL beaker, Pyrex #1000, per pack i 2,880.00 | | ]
C 100mL beaker, Pyrex #1000-100, low form, double scals, N 500000 |
e graduated, 100 ml, per pack .
Beaker, griffin, low form w/ spout, borosilicate glass, 100ml, Class ) B80.00 ]
A Borosil, per piece \
| Beaker, low form, 100rml, Cordial, per pack . 1,057.45 ~J
2 160 cc_ |10mI/ec clear glass vial with rubber stopper/cover £20.00 no bid 40.00 no bid no bid no hid s, 1o bid
Offer: | \
10ml/ce Ampiciltin bottle w/ rubber septum 250.00 |
Glass vial 8 ml w/ rubber lined screw cap - kimax » 49.00 , . . L ,
3 100 Dc | R0mly/cc clear glass vial with rubber stopper/cover 30.00 no bid \ 50.00 ~ no bid no bid no bid no bid
Qffer:
. ROmEy/ec Armnpiciliin battle with rubber septum 380.00 | |
Glass vial 16 ml (21 x Y0mm) w/ rubber lined screw cap - kimax AN 54.00 v | | s/
80mL beaker, borosili ith thermal X i e an .
4 1 pok mecmzical sép‘t;ngm, ;:Zze) iass, with therma, shock resistanc d 300000 2,500.00 nobid CERTIFI‘ copy
) Offer: ' IGINAL
/
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Canvass no. PC-22-03-081

Date:

14 Mazreh ROR2

Item

PARTICULARS

Unit Cost

Chemline
Scientiffe
Corporation

Aced Sciencelab
Corporation

Starlab Madical

and Scientific
Apparatus
Supply

& Zion
Scientific, Inc.

JERR Marketing

Serine
Enterprises

Belman

“aboratories

Labotech
Trading

QTY

UNIT

Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals

BOmlL beaker,Scharlay 0033550204, 12 pes/ pack

2,900.00,

" B0l beaker Pyrex, per piece

N

81,00

50mL heaker,Pyrex, per pack

8,800.00

50mL beaker, Pyrex #1000-50, low form, double scale, graduated,
80 ml, per pack

8,000.00

Beaker, griffin, low form w/ spout, borosilicate glass, 50ml, Clagss A
Borosil, per piece

Beaker, low formn, 50ml, Cordial, per pack

1,269.18 _

100

50mL/cc clear glass vial with rubber stopper/cover

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Qiffer:

Glass vial 32 ml (5 x 85mm) w/ rubber lined screw cap - kimax

56.00

30

Laboratory Wipes (Kimwipes) :Single Ply, Lint-free; Size- 4 1/Rin. x
8 1/2 in. :280 sheets/box

200.00

209.00

300.00

no bid

no bid

no bid.

Offer:

Laboratory Wipes, Kimtech, 8ize- 4 1/2in. x 8 1/R1in,

260.00

5350.00

Laboratory Wipes, Kimtech, Size- 4.5 in. x84 in. (11.0x21.3
cim), 1 ply

10

btl

Mueller Hinton Agar :M173-500G :5008/btl

3 500.00

no bid

Offer;

Mueler Hintor Agar :M173-500G :500g/btl, Hi Media,

3,575.00

Mueller Hinton Agar :M173-500G :500€/btl, Titan

4,340.00

3,493.00,

Mueler Hinton Agar :Merck Sigma Cat#1038720500

3,499.00

Muetler Hinton Agar, Dehydrated Culture Media, Titan Media, 500
g

N

2,550:00

btl

1Mueller Hinton Broth No. 2 :5008/btl

Z,500.00

"4.700.00_

no bid

no bid

no bid

~ no bid

Offer:

N

Mueller Hinton Broth No. 2;: 500g/t]; Hi Media

4,320.00 o

Mueller Hintor: Broth No. 2: 500g/btl; Titan

N,

Mueller Hinton Broth No. 2: 500g/bt]; Condalab

10,840.00~

bl

Nutrient Agar :MOD1-500G :500g/btl

3,500.00

3,500.00

no bid

no bid

, hobid

Dffer:

VAV

Nutrient Agar :MOO1-500G :500&/bsl, Hi Media

3,450.00

3,450.00 ~

3,495.00

)
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Canvass no. PC-22-03-031

Date: 14 March 2022

PARTICULARS

- UnitLost

Chemline
Scientific
Corperation

Aced Sciencelab
Corporation

] starlab Mediosl

and Scientific
Apparatus
Supply

] -Seientific, Inc.

Mt Zion

JEBRR Marketing |

Serine
Fnterprises

‘Belman

Laboratories 7

{:.abatech
“Trading

QTY

ONIT

Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals

Nutrient Agar :MOOL-800G :500g/btl, Titan

10 80

Ysurgical Face Mask :3-Fly Filter :175mm x 95mm :At least

B0pes/box

110.00

130.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Surgical Face Magsk :3-Fly Filter :175mm x 98mim :At least
S0pcs/box, [ndoplas

~250.00

Burgical Face Mask :3-Fly Filter :175mm x 95mm : At least
80pes/box, Aidelail

11 5

VLG Columnn with G3 { 15-40 microns) porosity Fritz, fabricated

9.000.00

no bid

no bid

nobid  f

- :ir153 mm

no bid

no bid

no hid

no bid

;Inner Diameter-42 mmn

:Outer Diameter: 48 mm ;Thickness- 3 mm

12 2

Yellow Pipette tips, 1000 pesfbag, 200ul capacity

2.000.00

700.00

1,150.00

no bid

Joster:

ellow Pipstte tips, 1000 pes/bag, 200ul capacity, Tarson S21O1H:|

v

b

1:650.00

Yellow Pipette £ips, 1000 pes/bag, R00uLcapacity, Biclogix,

| Cat#2100200

95000

Plpette tips,-200ul. bulk, non-sterile, Rnase & Dnase Free, yeliow,

1000 $ips/ bag, Biclogix

Labopette, NCOZ 200ui, 1000 pes/ bag, yellowtip, short $ip

951.83

13 15

400.00

no bid

nobid

borosilicate glass funnel, 50 degree angle, short stem

10fer

Glass Funnel, 88mm ahort stem, Pyrex # 6180

546.00 _

. Glass.Funnel, 90mm diameter, China_ _ .

borosilicate glass funnel, 60 degree angle, short stem, €5 mm -
Borosil

borosilicate glass funnel, 60 degees angle, short stem, 75 mm -
Borosil

221.00

borosilicate-glass funnel, 60 degree angle, shert stem, 100 men -
Borosil

o

R35.00

7

borosilicate glass funnmel, 1504 60 mm, short stem

Liam s P AAAs

CE

AririEniey

192.20
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Canvass no. PC-22-08-031. Date: 14 March R0OR2

ine Starlab Medical
Ttem , 1 Ghemiin Aced Sciencelab | and Scientific Mt, Zion _ Serine Belman Labotech
No. PARTICULARS Unit Cost 1 Scientific Corporation Apparatas Scientific, Tac, JERR Marketing Bnterprises Laboratories Trading
| Corporation
. Supply
) QTY | UNIT _ .
Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and E
) Chemicals 1 ' A
5 5 N -7 9 _30 .
Delivery Term: 45-60 working 30 days 30days 30 daysa 30 days 50 days "B w g 30 days
days days
Documentary Requirements: B 4
Mayor's/ Business Perimit 1  comply comply comply | comply comply | comply comply | comply
PhilGEPS Registration Classification Flatinom Red. Platinum Red Flatinum FPlatinum Platinum Flatinum
FhilGEFS Registration Number 60821 240447 | 263873 | &Rr47 1073 263772 ] 2281 168502
Qmnibus Sworn Statement {for ABCs above Php 50,000)
Mode of Procureraent: Smalt Value Procurement
PHIGEPS Reference No.: 8439428
C}'Ca.nvassed oy:  Bri Lumague
BECOMNMENDATION:
Ly
Hop it.emssl/, 7-9, Aced Sciencelab Corporation is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
e
For iteras &,3,5, forreview of technical specifications.and approved budgdet for the items.
7
Foritems 4, 15, 18,/ Belman Laboratories is the lowest caleulated and responsive bidder.
b
For tems 6,10, Labotech Trading is the lowest caloulated and responsive bidder,
e
“Fopr item 11, Mt. Zion Scientific, Imc.-is:the sole and respensive bidder.
CERTIFIE E COPY S
OF 7 ORIGINAL
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Canvass no, PG-82-03-031 Date: 14 March 2022
. Starlab Medical
Item CULAR ’ , Chemlin Aced Sciencelab |  and Scientific _ Mt Zion N Serine Belman Labotech
No. PARTI 5 Unit Cost Sc.lcn‘l:u%c Corporation Apparatus Scientifie, Inc. JERE Marketing Enterprises Laborataries Trading
Corporation
Supply
QTY | UNIT .
~ Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
[ Chemicals | -
Committee on Bids and Awards:
SANTOS JOSE 0. DACANAY III
= /O
—
EL M. ADDAWE GEGII.I.A FE S.l\{b\A_.BALOS
Vice Chair Member
L]
p-d/(l‘-M L
ORIA Q. @mm
C Y Mem SI'J
3
=l
Action of Head of the Prgcuring Entity:, A ROVED
CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor
'5'_.”'"" . . TTRTY

R »E

- —————,

ﬁ% MAR 20 2022 | |

CERTIFIER T COPY Fa A REENT OFFICE (SPMO)
OF THE ORIGINAL 1.2 BAGUIO
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i : Republic of the Philippines
<s-:4 University of the Philippines Baguio
AL Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

!\i’Iarch 14, 2022

Pearl P, Cabajes

Sales Admin

Labotech Trading

Unit F 3rd Floor 854 Sta. Catalina Street Valley 1 Paranaque City
(02) 7215-6795, (02) 7744-3513

| i :

Dear Ms, Cabajes:

| !

We are fimppy to notify you that your bid for the execution for the Supply and
Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and Chemicals is hereby awarded
to you at a contract price equivalent to Eleven Thousand Four Hundred Sixty One
f"esos a;nd Twenty Centavos (Php 11,461.20).

You are :hereby required to enter into the contract within ten (10) calendar days upon
receipt of this Notice of Award. .

|

Very truly yours,

cpaks

ORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor /5—

o)

Conformfe:

i
I -
S;TEEK{NI'&; . LASPONAS

(Name of Representative of Bidder)

3
i

ore: | MARZ4 202

Jédgt
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58

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
VAT Reg TIN: 000-864-006-00007

PURCHASE ORDER

APR TS T pyg oM

UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIFPINES BAGUIO
Supply & Property Management Offic

e

(fice of the Vice Chancellar for Academic Affuirs.

Supplier;

Labotech Trading

PO No: SPMO-TF-22-04-043 (2518)

Address

Unit F 3rd Floor 854 Sta. Catalina Street Valley 1 Paranaque City

Date:  5-Apr-2022

Telephone No.:

{02) 721.5-6795, (02) 7744-3513

Mode of Procuremens:

E-mail:

labotech sales3@gmail.com, labotechtrading@yahoo.com

NP - Small Value Procurement

TIN:

263-271-192-000

PR No. 15859

Gentlemen
Please fu

rnish thisjOffice the following articles subject to the terins and conditions contained herein:

Place of Delivery:

E'prnb/ and Property Management Office (SPM0), UP Baguio

Delivery Term:

Cuontact Person:

Brign D, Lumague

L.Q.B. - Destinotion (UP Baguiq)

Contact Addlrcss:

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

Payment Term;

30 calendar days.

!
Contact #/ Email:

(074) 442-3484/ bdlum ague@up.eduph

Date ol Delivery:

15-20 calendur days after receipt of PA.

vr:;:z:;{mn . Unit { Description Qy. Unit Cost Amount
: Suppl) and Delivery of Laboratory Supplics for Project 6
! ; v ) , )
| box Laboratory Wipes, Kimtech, Size- 4,3 in. x 84 in. (110 x 21.3 10 P 198.89 $ 5,966.70
cm] 1ply .
2 tace Mask ¢3-Ply Filter 1175 c At least
box Surgical Face Mask :3-Ply Filter :175mm x 95mm At leas 50 » 109.89 .. P 5,494.50

50pcs/box, Aldelai

] *¥Nothing Followst*

Canvass no, PL-22-03-031

(‘otal Amounkin Words):

P11,461.20

Eleven Thousand Four Hundred Sixty One Pesos and Twenty Centavos

In case of failure to fma!ce the full delivery within the time specified above, a penally of one-tenth (1/10) of one percent fur every day of delay

shall be impo

Conforme:

sed on the indelivered item/s.

STEMASPONAS

: Signature over Printed Name of Supplier

Very (ruly yours,
*

nm\ﬁmou);‘(—

Assistant Vice Chancellor Jor AAdbrie Affairs

4/26/2022 .
; Date
i
Fund Cluster: o7 308608  DOST PROJECT G BALANG COD ORS/BURS No:  02-208G03. -‘2022 -0 1y
Funds Available: : Date of the ORS/BURS: Qg: [_[_
‘ o _‘_Qt{u?unl gl °?O
' A NOp e " =
‘ CRLILEA DA!‘@AWEN ,_-m. e g
Chief, Avcbunting Office ; CoE "\ A/'*' {} (\\;?,s.
‘\5 [ oy FFICE \v"""‘)\'
e L paBUC Tagod of 1

A

APR 20 2022 gl ol
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Republic of the Philippines

. University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.ypb.edu.ph

Notice to Proceed

|

|

!
April 05, 2022

Pear! Pi Cabajes

Sales Admin

Labotech Trading

Unit F 3rd Floor 854 Sta. Catalina Street Valley 1 Paranaque City
i(02) 7215-6795, (02) 7744-3513

iDear Msf. Cabajes:

;Notice iSi hereby given to Labotech Trading represented by its Sales Admin, Pearl P,
iCabajesi, tha: work may commence on the Supply and Delivery of Laboratory
‘Glasswares, Supplies and Chemicals effective on _or day/s after

the receipt of this notice.

Upon refceipt of this notice, you are responsible for performing the services under the
terms and conditions of the Agreement and in accordance with the Implementation
Schedule.

{

Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by signing both copies in the
space provided below. Keep one copy and return the other to the University of the
Philippines Baguio.

Very ‘crljly yours,

ROLAXID M. HIPO

Assistar.:]t Vice Cha lor for Academic Affairs
i

Conforme:

i .
STEFMSPONAS

(Name fof Representative of Bidder)

Date: | 4/26/2022

Jedgt




