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Republ ¢ of the Ph:lfpplnes

University of the Phillppines Baguio

4 Governor Pack Road, Bagule City
“Telefax No, 442~ ,38881442 3484

R  Notige of Award

Indanqo Avenue, Quezon <l
(02} 99@,(0973/ (02) 935-841

@ Bre:h appy to nohify you that your b bld for the executiﬂn for the ___g,p,nj,x_st_gg.
; ory. pplies and Chamicals Is hereby awarded

ntract price equivalent to ’I’wcnty Four Thousand Pcsos (Php

-You areghereby requiredto gnte nio @ cc'ntract within ten (10‘} caiendar days upen
e receipt oF thfs Notice of Award Z N
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(‘ij Canvass no. PC-22-03-031

AT . BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

“aji‘gg’ University of the Philippines Baguio
Z A
G Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATICN FOR THE
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF LABORATORY GLASSWARES, SUPPLIES
AND CHEMICALS FOR UP BAGUIO

Date: 14

March 8022

Item
No.

Starlab Mecical
and Scientific
Apparatus
Supply

Chemline
Scientific
Corporation

Mt. Zion
Scientific, Inc.

Aced Sciencelab

Unit Cost Lorporation

PARTICULARS

JERE Marketing

Serine
Enterprises

Laboratories i

Belman

Labatech
Trading

QTY

UNIT

Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals

(RFQ No. 2388)

1100mL beaker, borosilicate glass, with thermal shock resistance and

3,000.00 R,560.0
mechanical strength, 12/pck A ° ~'\

no bid

Offer:

222.00 |

100mL beaker, Pyrex #1000, per piece
ooy

100mL beaker, borosilicate glass, per piece )
. 2,860.00 _ |

100mL beaker, Pyrex #1000, per pack
10CmL beaker, Pyrex #1000-100, low form, double scale, 1 . 3
graduated, 100 ml, per pack

3,00C.00

Beaker, griffin, low form w/ spout, borosilicate glass, 100ml, Class
A Borozil, per piece

1,057.45+

E

100 |

Beaker, low form, 100ml, Cordial, per pack ‘
10mL/ce clear glass vial with rubber stopper/cover 2000 . no bid : %
B | S

no bid

no bid

no bid

:, 1o bid

Ofer:

10mL/ce Ampieillin bottle w/ rubber septum 250.00

Glass vial 8 ml w/ rubber lined screw cap - kimax N . 48.00

nobid

no bid

no bid

- 100

20mL/ce clear glass vial with rubber stopper/cover 30.00 no bid \

no bid

Offer:

20m/ce Ampicillin bottle with rubber septum 380.00 |
S

Glass vial 16 ml (21 x 70mm) w/ rubber lined screw oap - Kimax | 5400 <

A

13

50mL beaker, borosilicate glass, with thermal shock resistance and
mechanical strength, 12/pck

3,000.00 ,500.00

no bid
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{anvass no. PC-22-03-031

Date: 14 Mareh 2022

Item

PARTICULARS

Unit Cost

Chemline
Scientific
Corporation,

Aced Sciencelab
Corporation

Starlab Madical
and Scientific
Apparatus
Supply

ML Zion
Scientifie, Inc.

JERR Marketing

Berine
Enterprises

Belman
T.aboratories

Labhotech
Trading

QTY

UNIT

Supply and Delivery of Labaratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals

gl

50mL beaker,Scharlay 0053550204, 12 pes/ pack

2,900.00

" BOmL beaker, Pyrex, per piece

81.00

B50mL beaker, Pyrex, per pack

2,800.00

B0mL beaker, Pyrex #1000-50, low form, double scale, graduated,
50 ml, per pack

3,000.00

Beaker, griffin, low form w/ spou, borosilicate glass, 50m}, Class A
Borosil, per piece

Beaker, low form, 80m), Cordial, per pack

1,269.18 \

100

50mly/ec clear glass vial with rubber stapper/cover

no bid

no hid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Glass vial 32 ml (25 x 95mm) w/ rubber lined screw cap - kimax

56.00

30

Laboratory Wipes (Kimwipes) :Single Fly, Lint-freg; Size- 4 1/2in. x
8 1/2 in. ;280 sheets/box

200.00

208.00

no bid

no bid

no bid.

Offer:

Laboratory Wipes, Kimtech, Size- 4¢ 1/2in. x 8 1/2 in.

260.00 .

330.00

Laboratory Wipes, Kimtech, Size- 4.3in. x 8.4 in. (11.0x 21.3
cm), 1 ply

10

bt

Mueller Hinton Adar :M173-500G :500g/btl

3,800.00

. nobid

Offer:

=

Mueller Hintor Agar :M173-500G :500g/btl, Hi Media

3,575.00 _

Mueller Hinton Agar :M173-500G :500&/bt], Titan

Mueller Hinton Agar :Merek Sigma, Cat#1038720800.

4,320.00

Mueller Hinton Agar, Dehydrated Culture Media, Titan Media, 500
g

3,489.00

8,950:00
o

i

E

_|Muslier Hinton Broth No, 2:500g/btl -~~~ -~ -

RN

“Eobid |

" “no'bid

T hobid T

T Hobid

Offer;

~

B

Mueller Hinton Broth-No. & 500g/bt); ¥i Media,

4,320.00_

Mueller Hinton Broth Ne. & 500g/btl; Titan

R

Mueller Hinton Broth No. 2: 500g/bt]; Condalab

10,340.00

btl

Nutrient Agar :MO01-500G :500g/btl

3600.00

no bid

nobvid

oo bid

Qfer:

3,50000 . |
~

24

Nutrient Agar :M001-BODG :500g/btl, Hi Media

5,450.00N,

%,495.00 , g
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Canvass no. PC-22-03-081

Date:

: 14 March 2082

Item |

PARTICULARS

- UnitLost

Chemline
Seientific
Corporation

Aced Sciencalab
Corporation

] 8tarlab Medical
and Scientifie
Apparatus
Supply

Mt Zion

J Scientific, Inc.

JERR Marketng

Serine
Enterprises

Belman
Laboratoriex

Labotech
“Trading

QTY

ONIT |

N

Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals

| Nutrient Agar :MOO1-500G :500g/bil, Titan

10

1surgical Face Mask :3-Fly Filter :1756mm x $5mm :At Jeast

50pes/box

110,00

130.60

130.00

no bid

oo bid

nphid

W

‘Tofer:

Surgical Face Mask :3-FPly Filter :175mm x O95mrn :At least
50pes/box, Indoplas

~R250.60

Yy,

Surgical Face Mask :5-Fly Filter :175mm X 95mim :4% least
B0pds/box, sidelai

VLG Column with G3 {15-40 microns) porosity Fritz, fabricated

800000

no bid

no bid

1,183 mm

nobid .

no bid

1o bid

no bid

no bid

| .:Inner Diameter-48 mm

:Quter Diameter: 48 mm :Thickness- 3 mm

12

Yellow Pipette tips, 1000 pes/bag, 200ul capacity

2,000.00

1,150.00

no bid

|ofier;

Tellow Pipe‘t.te Hips,-1000 pes/bag, 200uL capasity, Tarson 5R101H-

4

2

Yellow Pipette tips, 1000 pes/bag, 200ul capacity, Biclogix,

) _ﬁCat#.?lDOBDO

L
Ai
3

Pipatte tips, 200ul, bulk, non-sterile, Rnase 4= Dnase Free, yellow, ]
1 1000-4ips/ bag, Blologix

"Labopette, NCOZ 200ul, 1000 pes/ bag, yellowtip, short tip

13

is

borositicate glass funpel, 80 degree angle, shert stem

1o bid

| Odfer:

Glass Funnel, 65mm short stem, Pyrex #8180 .

1. Glass Funnel, 90mm diameter, China.

borosilicase gass funnel, 60 dsgree angle, short ‘stern, 65 mm -
Borosil

horosilicate glass MI, 60 degdoee angle, short stem, 75 mm - = . 4 l
Borosil - ‘ . ] ‘ %1.00\
borositicatedlass funnel, B0-degree angle, shert stem, 100 mm - T 3 i - -
Boerosil | / e
J | h ) N
borosilicate glass furmel, 1504 60 mm, short stem _ q ] s L ]
CERTIFI RUE COPY
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4
Canvass no, PC-22-03-031. © Date: 14 March 2022
Starlab Medical
Item . T Chemline Aced Sclencelab | and Scientific Mt. Zion Sering 7 Belman Zabotach
P CULAR. J entifi, . .
No. ARTI o Unit Cost Sctentific Corporation Apparatus Selentific, Ing, |TEonMarketing | o, prises | Daboratories Trading
Corporation
Supply
QTY | UNIT BN N
. i Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and 7 .
A e - .
— 1 - — ] _ _ ] . 4
{Delivery Term: ] 4860 working 30 days 30days 20 days 30 Gays 30 days 7-30 working 50-dags
] days i . days
I Documentary Requirements: ] )
‘] 1 Mayor's/ Business Permit ] comply corrply | comply | comply 1 comply | comply comply comply
PhilGEPS Registration Classification Platinum 1 Red Platinum ) Red Flatimim Platinum Flatinum Platinum
FhilGEPS Registration Number ‘ 60821 R4va4avy ] =63BY3 624?' 1073 RBZ7IR ] R0l 168502
1 Omnibus Sworn Statement {for ABCs abave FPhp 50,000) ]
IMode of Procuremient: 8mall Value Procurement.”

PhilGEPS Reforence No: 8439428

Ca.hve.sseﬁ“by: Bri Tumagne

émcommm&nom 7

Bor. mms-%) 7-8, Aced Sciencelab Corporation s the lowest-ca.lcula,bed and respozsive bidder.
For items 2,,3(511’01' Teview of sechrical -specifications and approved budget for the-items,
Foritems i:&é, i 3,/ Belman Laboratories.is the lowest calenlated and responsive bid:i.er:
Foritems 6/,-10‘ Labotech Trading is the lowest caltulated and responsive bidder.

-
B, -Foritem 11, Mt. Zion Scientifie, Inc.-iswthe sole and-pespensive bidder.- - -

CERTIFIEB/RUE COPY
. CF THE 6RIGI
n R— : MAD--A-spss— . (.02 ' : : = NAL
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Capvass npo, PC-22-03-031 Date: 34 March 2022
Item PARTICULARS Uit Cost i | #cea sciencetan ® ana Selemmime. Mt zion | . Serine Belman Labotech
Na. Corporation Corporation A:i;;a:s Scientific, Inc. JERR Marketing Enterprises Laboratories Trading

QTY | UNIT

Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Glasswares, Supplies and
Chemicals

Committee on Bids and Awards:

SANTOS JOSE O, DACANAY ITT

CORAZOIN L. ABANWSI
Chanceillor

OSSR ¥ ¥ W Wil B G 5o Uy o SO 3

CEGIL'I.A FE S.EATBALOS

Member

el
RIA Q. BT
,M'ém_sr‘/
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ORIGINAL ..

K ANAGCHENT OFFICE (SPMO)
LB BAGUIO




