Republic of the Philippines
" UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

02 May, 2022

ANTONNETTE CEDENO

Project and Design Consultant

FILCRAFTERS INCORPORATED

484 G. Araneta Avenue, Brgy. Dona Imeida Quezon City
Tel. N0:74.533.2656

Dear Ms. CEDENO:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the Supply and Delivery of Various Office Furnitures for College of
Science under RFQ No. 2444 dated 23 March, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to
Three Hundred Twenty Two Thousand Four Hundred Ninety Pesos (Php 322,490.00) as follows:

QUANTITY UNIT PARTICULARS UNIT COST AMOUNT

Office Chair, Black Mesh Backrest and Headrest, T- 8,475.00 144,075.00
Armrest, Nylon base

Office Table, Nixon Table Metal Legs, 160cm x 60cm x
75cm with Fix Pedestal

17 un

17 un 10,495.00 178,415.00

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of
Award.

Very truly yours,
2279

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor

Conforme: [/L(,Z /\/\{

[hie - fibronedie Cecle

(Name of Rﬁresfatlve fBldder)
Date:




" BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF

Canvass no. PC22.04.074 (RFQ No. 2444)

VARIOUS OFFICE FURNITURE

Date: 05 April, 2022

ITEM

No. | @Y

UNIT

PARTICULARS

UNIT PRICE

PHILFOAM
FURNISHING
INDUSTRIES

INC.

PENITON
TRADING

FILCRAFTERS
INCORPORATED

un

Computer /Office Chair, Dimension: W76xD58XH110-115cm;
Color: Black ; metal : chrome

1 9,000.00

NO BID

OFFER:

Computer /Office Chair, PT-SP6310-1

di8i000,00°

Computer /Office Chair, Black Mesh back Rest, Black
Fabric Seat Rest, -Aluminum base

8,950.00

un

Office Chair Midback with Head Rest Adjustable leather head
rest. Specifications (WDH): 620mm x 600mm x 975mm;
Height Adjustable up to: 940mm

6,000.00

NO BID

OFFER:

Office Chair Midback with Head rest, PT-M8012G-F

6,000.00

Office Chair Midback with Head rest, Black leatherette,
Padded Aluminum Armrest, Aluminum Base

5,990.00

un

Office Chair, black, Measurements: W64xD62xH120 -130 cm,
Seat height: 45-54 cm, Backrest, Injection mould PP Plastic
backrest, with fixed lumbar support covered with mesh
fabric., Seat: 12 mm thick plywood with 50 mm, thick new
foam covered with 220g/1m gsm fabric., Gas Lift: 100 mm
length black gas lift with polypropylene (pp) plastic cover,
Arm: Injection mould polypropylene (pp) plastic, Star Base:
310 mm length Nylon plastic, Wheel Caster: 50 mm nylon
wheel caster, 3 Position Synchronous mechanism,
Ergonomically designed, Seat height adjustment, Swivel 360
degrees

8,500.00

NO BID

OFFER:

Office Chair, PT-16680

8,350.00

Office Chair, Black Mesh Backrest and Headrest, T-
Armrest, Nylon base

un

Office Table, W160xD60xH75 cm, Panels: Walnut, Metal leg:
Black, Materials: Made of Melamine laminated on Particle
board, 25 mm thick top panel with 0.8 mm thick PVC edging,
16 mm thick front panel with 0.8 mm thick Pvc edging, 18
mm thick drawer front, side & back panel with 0.45 mm thick
PVC edging, 75 mm dia. plastic wirehole cap., 16" full
extension drawer slide mechanism, 1.2 mm thick stamped
metal sheet Legs in powdercoated finish with 38mm
adjustable foot glider

10,500.00

NO BID

OFFER:

Office Table, PT-1601

10,300.00

Office Table, Nixon Table Metal Legs, 160cm x 60cm x
75cm with Fix Pedestal

-rnx Nothing Follows nxx-

Delivery Terms:

NOT APPLICABLE [30CD

30CD

Documentary Requirements:

Mayor's/Business Permit

NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED

COMPLIED

Philgeps Registration Number

145568 198307

86887

Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement

NO SUBMISSION [COMPLIED

COMPLIED

Mode of Procurement:
PhilGEPS Ref. No.

Canvassed by:

RECOMMENDATION:

NP - Small Value Procurement
8553387

For Item 1, PENITON TRADING Is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
For Itéem 2, no award, for review of technical specifications and approved budget for the contract.

For Items 3 & 4, FILCRAFTERS INCORPORATED is the most responsive bidder as to requirements and specifications.

Committee on Bids and Awards:

SANTOS JOSE O. DACANAY II
Chair

CECILIA FE S. ABALOS
Member

<
' osi M. ADDAWE
g M — /\{ i
GLORIA Q. RODRIGUERA |
ber

Action of the Head ofthe Procuring Entity:

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor
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