Appendix 61

= UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City, Benguet, CAR, PH
VAT Reg. TIN: 000-864-006-00007

PURCHASE ORDER
Museo Kordilyera

Supplier : HEXACOM ENTERPRISES P.0. No. : SPMO.TF.22.05.067 (2575)
Address ©  Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City Date : 04 May, 2022
Contact#/Email : 74.442.0198 Mode of Procurement : NP - Small Value Procurement
TIN : 941-765-748-000 PR No. : 16107

Gentlemen:

Please furnish this office the following articles subject to the terms and conditions contained herein:

Place of Delivery : Supply & Property Management Office, UP Baguio Delivery Term . FOB -Destination
Contact Person : James Benedict E. Bagsic Payment Term : 30 calendar days
Contact Address : Governor Pack Road, Baguio City, PH Date of Delivery : 30 calendar days
Contact #/Email : 074.442.3484 / spmo.upbaguio@up.edu.ph upon receipt of Purchase Order
STOCK/
PROPERTY No. | UNIT DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST AMOUNT
pc  [Voice Recorder, Sony ICD UX570 2 7,350.00 14,700.00

-anx Nothing Folows mnx-

Canvass no. PC22.04.075

(Total Amount in Words): Fourteen Thousand Seven Hundred Pesos 14,700.00

In case of failure to make the full delivery within the time specified above, a penalty of one-tenth (1/10) of one (1)
percent of every day of delay shall be impgsed on the undelivered item/s.

Conforme: Very truly yours,

ROLAND M. HIPOLA™

%awwwmﬁ%b?l&ﬁgum Cl[y Signature over Printed Name of Aithdrized Official

TeleFax: (074) 442-0198 Assistant Vice Chancellor for Academic Affairs
Date £ /ILB / 2 Designation
Funds Cluster : 07 308603 DOST™ DRCP (Apgre=0 Y ORS/BURS No. : 06 -0¢(o03- 022 - NS -2[2
Funds Available Va1 . PR & ate of the ORS/BURS : DS-0G. 2027
: i /
CEM@WMI 12 2“22 AY 11 21]22 Amount : Il‘h TDOUD
Chief, Acdouriting Office
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Republic of the Philippines
UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO
Governor Pack Road, Bagulo City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice to Proceed

04 May, 2022

MALOU YUSONGCO

Sales Executive

HEXACOM ENTERPRISES

Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City
Tel. N0:74.442.0198

Dear Ms. YUSONGCO:

Notice is hereby given to HEXACOM ENTERPRISES, represented by its Sales Executive, MALOU YUSONGCO  that
work may commence on the Supply and Delivery of Audio Equipment for Museo Kordilyera effective on
or calendar day/s after the receipt of this notice.

Upon receipt of this notice, you are responsible for performing the services under the terms and condition of the
agreement and in accordance with the implementation schedule.

Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by slgning both copies in the space provided below.
Keep one copy and return the other to the University of the Philippines Baguio.

Very truly yours,

3
RO D M. HIPOL
Assistant Vice Cha»@)r/for Academic Affairs

1 acknowledge receipt of this Notice on:

Name of Representative of Bidder:
Authorized Signature: He I Hdha? B]dg gﬁﬂﬁaeié Stq Ba(lUlO C]ty

ee ax:

ttf/}u/fn
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Zdeb

04 May, 2022

MALOU YUSONGCO

Sales Executive

HEXACOM ENTERPRISES
Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City
Tel. N0:74.442.0198

Dear Ms. YUSONGCO:

Republic of the Philippines
~ UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.upb.edu.

Notice of Award

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the Supply and Delivery of Audio Equipment for Museo Kordilyera
under RFQ No. 2454 dated 23 March, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to Fourteen

Thousand Seven Hundred Pesos (Php 14,700.00) as follows:

QUANTITY

UNIT

PARTICULARS

UNIT COST

AMOUNT

2

pc

Voice Recorder, Sony ICD UX570

7,350.00

14,700.00

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of

Award.

Very truly yours,

CORAZON L. ABAN

Chancellor

%
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VIDEO EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES

Canvass no. PC22.04.075 (RFQ No. 2454)

Date: 07 April, 2022

ITEM

No. | Q7Y

UNIT PARTICULARS

UNIT PRICE

RYNAV
ENTERPRISES

ULY TECH
TRADING

HEXACOM
ENTERPRISES

DSLR camera, 24.1 Megapixel APS -C CMOS sensor
(featuring an improved Dual pixel CMOS AF); Digic 8
image processor, supporting ISO 100-25600
(expandable to 51200) (additional specs attached)

unit

55,000.00

NO BID NO BID

OFFER:

DSLR Camera, Canon EOSM50

Ring Light, size: 18 inch ring klight ; 240 LED beads,
dual phone position; Free ring light bag, dual tone(
white light and warm light) Stepless dimming

unit

3,500.00

NO BID NO BID

Teleprompter, Compatible tablet : under 8 inch package
size: 26.5%23.5%10.5cm/10.4*9.3%4.1 Inches; Package
weight: 1470g/3.2Ibs (additonal specs attached)

unit

6,500.00

NO BID NO BID

OFFER:

Teleprompter, Best View T2

Video/Photography lighting set, Light power: 45W color
temperature: 2700k/5500K; Brightness: stepless
adjustment ;Input voltage: DC 24v; Softbox size: 50*%70
cm/20 *28in

set

10,000.00

NO BID NO BID

OFFER:

Video/Photography Lighting Set, 3 x 50 x 70 cm Soft
Box, 3 x 45W Cold Light Bulb, 3 x 200 cm Light, Bag

Backdrop green screen, size: 2*3m/6.66*10 ft, enough
for home and studio use. color: green; Material: polyster
cotton fabric ( additional specs attached)

set

7,000.00

NO BID NO BID

Audio controller - Cool LED breathing lamp; Bluetooth
wireless accompaniment; works as a USB sound card
plus mixing station. (additional specs attached)

unit

7,000.00

NO BID NO BID

Voice Recorder, built-in Lithium Battery. 4GB built-in
memory, built-in microphone, calendar search, LCD
backlight, 199 max files per folder, 5k max files, pc
connectivity, LPCM/MP3 recording and recording format,
usb connection charging

7,500.00

NO BID NO BID

OFFER:

Voice Recorder, Sony ICD UX570

-uxx Nothing Follows xxx-

Delivery Terms:

NOT APPLICABLE |NOT APPLICABLE [30CD

Documentary Requirements:

Mayor's/Business Permit

COMPLIED COMPLIED COMPLIED

Philgeps Registration Number

274767 163904 52877

Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement

NO SUBMISSION [COMPLIED COMPLIED

NP - Small Value Procurement
8553735 -~

Mode of Procurement:
PhilGEPS Ref. No.:

.

Canvassed by; James Be i f gsic

RECOMMENDATION:

ForItems 1,2, 3,4,5& 7, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES Is the sole and responsive bidder.

For Item 6, no award, for recanvass.

Committee on Bids and Awards:

SANTOS JOSE 0. DACANAY II
Chair
CECILIA FE S. AB[:;S

Member

Action of the Heag of thesProcuring Entity:

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor

N/&M'w-"

\_&A)RIA Q. RO GUERA4
ember

APPROVED

/dcb

-

OELéM. ADDAWE

Vice Chair
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