Repuhlic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Bagiiio
Governor Pack Read, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www,upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

May 24, 2022

Josie V. Cruz
Sales Representative
Chemline Scientific Corporation

28 Law St., Victoria Subd., Tandang Sora, Quezon City
(02) 984-1198/ (02) 984-1201

Dear Ms, Cruz:

We are happy to notify you that your hid for the execution for the Supply and
Delivery of Laboratory Supplies and Glasswares under Abstract of Quotations No.
PC-22-05-106 dated May 05, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price
equivalent to Forty Five Thousand Seven Hundred Forty Pesos (Php

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within ten (10) calendar days upon
receipt of this Notice. of Award,

Very truly youfs,

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor /

Conforme:

JOSIE/V\CRUZ  SALES & MKTG. MANAGER
(Name of Representative of Bidder)

Date: May 26, 2022
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- BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Fhilippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR THE
LABORATORY SUPPLIES AND GLASSWARES FOR UP BAGUIO

Canvass no. PC-22-05-106

Date: 5 May 2022

Mars
Chemline )
Ttem PARTICULARS Unit Cost Selentific Laboratory Serine
No. c Hon Instruments Enierprises
orpard Centor
QTY | UNIT
Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Supplies and Glasswares
(RFQ No. 2486)
1 z o lOOII-lL glass graduated cylinder,-io.smb tclerance, with detachable 1,200.00 1o bid
plastic hexagenal base and plastic collar
Offer:
100mi. glass graduated cylinder, 0.8l tolerance, with
detach able plastic hexagonal base and plastic collar , Pyrex # 1,050.00
70075
na -+ i (3
2 2 o SOmI.J glass graduated cylinder, __0. 5mlL tolerance, with detachable 850,00 o bid
plastic hexagonal base and plastic collar
Offer:
50mL glass graduated cylinder, +0,5mL tolerance, with
detachabls plastic hexagonal base and plastic collar, Pyrex # 960.00
70075
Bottle brush, nylon head on steel/wire handle, head dlameter: at .
6 ! ! 150.00 no hid
s P& leagt 1.5", total length; 10-12" ah
Offer:
Bottle brush, nylon head on steel/wirg handle, head diameter: at
least 1.58", total length: 10-12", Loeal
Bottle brush, nylon head on steel/wire handle, head diameter: at 1.040.00
least 1.5 total length: 10-12", VWR U
4 200 Do Clear glass vials, with rubber stopper or plastic screw-cap, 20ml 45.00 no bid no bid
Offer:
Clear glass vials, with rubber stopper or plastic screw-cap, 20m!i ,
Kimax 74504-320 "
B 4 box |Disposable gloves, nitrile and powder free, large size, ~ 100pes/box 1,800 00 1,100.00 1,000.00
Offer:
Disposabla gloves, nitrile and powder free, large size,
~100pes/box, Glomed
5] B box |Disposable gloves, nitrile and powder free, small size, ™ 1C0pes/box 1,800.00 1,100.00 1,000.00
Offer:
bisposa.b]e gloves, nitrile and powder free, small size,
~100pes/box, Glomed
7 30 gal |Ithyl Aleohol 95% 850.00 1,080.00 no bid
8 ¢] pck  [Microtube with 1id (1.8 L), 500pes/pek 650.00 ne bid no bid
60-90 15-80 18-B0
Delivery Term working da..ys calendar calendar
after receipt days after days after
of P.O. receipt of P.O. | receipt of P.Q,
Documentary Requirements:
Mayor's/ Business Permit cornply comply comply
PhilGEPH Registration Classification Flatinum Platinum Platirum
PhilGHPS Registration Number 80821 5132 263772
Omnibus Bworn Statement (for ABCs above Php 50,000) comply did nct comply |did niot comply
Mode of Procurement: WP - 8mall Valus Procurement
Phil3EPS Reference No.; 8528218
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Canvass no. PC-22-05-106

Date: 5 May 2082

Mars
Chemline
Item 4 N Laboratory Serine
No. PARTICULARS Unit Cost smnuﬁ_c i ot Bitaipiass
Corporation
Center
QTY UNWIT
Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Supplies and Glasswares

RECOMMENDATION:

For items 1-3,5-7, Chemline Scientific Corporation is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.

For item 4, Chemline Scientific Corporation is the sole and responsive bidder.

For item 8, for re-canvass.
Committee on Bids and Awards:

ﬁs JQSE O, DACANAY
Chair
"% Tl B
Gl Bt I
o M. ADDAWE CECILIA FE S5.M. ABALOS
Vice Chair Member
G CKLAY \j"DRIA QR QRIG'U’ERA
ber Member
Action of Head of the Procuring Entity: AP PRAOAYTET)
CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor
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