10 May, 2022

MALOU YUSONGCO

Sales Executive

Republic of the Philippines

UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

HEXACOM ENTERPRISES
Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City
Tel. No:74.442.0198

Dear Ms. YUSONGCO:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the Supply and Delivery of Various IT Equipment and Accessories for
the University under RFQ No. 2481 dated 08 April, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to
Eight Hundred Thirty Nine Thousand Two Hundred Ninety Pesos (Php 839,290.00) as follows:

QUANTITY UNIT PARTICULARS UNIT COST AMOUNT
Desktop Computer, Apple iMac 24", M1 Chip, 8 Core

. un CPU, 7 Core GPU, 8GB, 256GB 87,200.00 82,200.00

10 pc External Hard Drive, Transcend, 1TB, Shockproof 4,350.00 43,500.00

1 un Laptop Computer, Apple Macbook Air, M1 74,625.00 74,625.00

Laptop, HP Victus i7-11800H, 16GB, 1TB, 3050 T1,

2 pc Windows 11, Office 2019 84,200:00 | ' 168,400.00

pc Pencil for Tablet, Apple Pencil 2 8,790.00 61,530.00

pc Printer, Workforce Pro WF-C5790 19,895.00 59,685.00

1 pc Scanner, Fujitsu iX1600 51,850.00 51,850.00

5 pe z:tdaltétéslePad Air 4, Wifi + Cellular, with Screen Protector 58,500.00 292,500.00

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of

Award.

Very truly yours,

CORAZON L. ABAN

Chancellor

Conforme:

SHeR O W

%

(Name of Repres%b(tative of Bidder)
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF

VARIOUS IT EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES

Canvass no. PC22.04.099 (RFQ No. 2481) Date: 25 April, 2022

ITEM

No. | QY

UNIT

NIU.COM DATACORE
PARTICULARS UNIT PRICE COMPUTER TECHNOLOGIES
SHOP INC.

HEXACOM
ENTERPRISES

un

Desktop Computer; 24-inch 4.5K Retina display; M1
chip 8-core CPU, 7-core GPU; 8 GB unified memory; 88,000.00 NO BID NO BID
256 GB storage

OFFER:

Desktop Computer, Apple iMac 24", M1 Chip, 8 Core .
CPU, 7 Core GPU, 8GB, 256GB

pc

External Hard Drive Type: External HDD Capacity: At
least 1 TB Form Factor: at least 2.5" interface: at least
USB 3.0 Features: at least shockproof or with shock
proof

5,200.00 NO BID 4,500.00

OFFER:

External Hard Drive, Transcend, 1TB, Shockproof

un

Laptop Computer; 13.3-inch LED-backlit display; M1
chip 8-core CPU, 7-core GPU; 8 GB unified memory
(configurable to 16 GB); 256 GB storage (can be
upgraded to 1 TB)

76,080.00 NO BID NO BID

OFFER:

Laptop Computer, Apple Macbook Air, M1 . 75,000.00 | 74,

pc

Laptop Sleek, Performance Laptop Profile Processor at
least 4C/8T or 6C/12T, 3-8MB cache, upto 3-4Ghz
Memory at least 16GB DDR4 Storage at least 512GB
SSD M.2 PCIe 3.0 NVMe or 256GB SSD+1TB HDD

85,000.00 NO BID NO BID

OFFER:

Laptop, Acer TravelMate P215-53G-79ES, i7-1165G7,

16GB, 1TB, 15.6", Windows 10 Pro 85,000.00

Laptop, Dell Inspiron 3511, i7-1165G7, 16GB,
512GB, 15.6", MX350 2GB, Windows 11, Office 2019 72,500.00
H&S .

Laptop, Dell Vostro i7-11390H, 16GB, 512GB, 15.6",
windows 11, Office 2019 82,500.00

Laptop, HP Victus i7-11800H, 16GB, 1TB, 3050 T1, i '§ aﬁg
Windows 11, Office 2019 el

pc

Pencil for Tablet (Branded) Length: 6.53 inches (166
mm) Diameter: 0.35 inch (8.9 mm) Weight: 0.73 ounce
(20.7 grams) Connections Bluetooth Other Features
Magnetically attaches and pairs

10,000.00 NO BID NO BID

OFFER:

Pencil for Tablet, Apple Pencil (2nd Generation) 9,000.00

Pencil for Tablet, Apple Pencil 2

pc

Printer Type: All-in-One, Print, Scan, Copy, Fax, Color
Inkjet w/ ADF, CISS Print Speed: at least upto 33ppm 23,000.00 NO BID NO BID
(black) / 20ppm (color) for Draft A4

OFFER:

Printer, Workforce Pro WF-C5790 20,000.00

pc

Scanner Scanner Type: ADF, Duplex Scanning Modes:
Color, Grayscale, Monochrome, Automatic Image
Sensor: CIS (contact Image Sensor) x 2 (front /back) 53,000.00 NO BID NO BID
light Source: 3 color LED (red/green/blue) optical
resolution: 600 dpi

OFFER:

Scanner, Fujitsu iX1600

pc

Tablet (Branded) Finish: 1 Space Gray, 1 Starlight, 1
Pink, 1 Purple, 1 Blue Capacity: 64gb Size and weight:
247.6mm x 178.5mm USB-C Charge cable 20W USB-C
Power Adapter With Screen Protector and Case

58,500.00 NO BID NO BID

OFFER:

Tablet, iPad Air 4, Wifi + Cellular, with Screen o %5‘
Protector and Case . rks

-rxx Nothing Follows xxx-
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?
+ Canvasg no. PC22.04.099 (RFQ No. 2481)

Date: 25 April, 2022

NIU.COM DATACORE
I
TEM | oty | uner PARTICULARS UNIT PRICE COMPUTER | TECHNOLOGIES | _ HEXACOM
NO. ENTERPRISES
SHoOP INC.
Delivery Terms: NOT APPLICABLE |30CD 30CD
Documentary Requirements:
Mayor's/Business Permit NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED COMPLIED

Philgeps Registration Number

84481 322539 52877

Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement

NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED

COMPLIED

Income/Business Tax Return

NO SUBMISSION |[NO SUBMISSION

COMPLIED

Mode of Procurement: NP - Small Value Procurement

PhilGEPS Ref. No.: 8568379 . T
Canvassed by: James Bei edict BJ Bagsic
RECOMMENDATION:

For Items 1, 7 & 8, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES is the sole and responsive bidder.
For Items 2, 3, 4,5 & 6, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES is the lowest calculated and r

Committee on Bids and Awards:

SANTOS JOSE O. DACANAY III

A )
Chair w
" GLORIA Q. RIGUERA
&/v\/‘ 2% 'i /6\ &/ ember‘l
CECILIA FE S. ABALOS
Member

APTPRW TR

Action of the Hegd of the Procuring Entity:
%MC( gy

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor

esponsive bidder.
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