BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION ON PRICE FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF
VARIOUS CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

Canvass no. PC 22.05.107

May 13, 2022

Item
No.

PARTICULARS

ABC PER ITEM

WIAL
CONSTRUCTION
BUILDERS

ALU GENERAL
MERCHANDISE

WILCONSTRUCT
ENTERPRISE

UNIT

pc

3/16 Metal Drill Bit

70.00

110.00

115.00

no bid submission

pc

ADAPTOR; Universal

70.00

60.00

no bid submission

offer:

ADAPTOR; Universal, Surface mounted

80.00

pc

Cleaning Cloth

20.00

no bid submission

offer:

Cleaning Cloth, Stopa

20.00

Cleaning Cloth, Stopa per kg

96.00

un

EXTENSION CORD ; heavy duty ; maximum current
15 A ; 4 ways extension socket ; with 4 pcs separate
switch ; at least 5 meters long ; with overload
protection

1,000.00

no bid submission

offer:

EXTENSION CORD ; heavy duty ; maximum current
15 A ; 4 ways extension socket ; with 4 pcs separate
switch ; 1.63 meters length; with overload protection,
Omni

900.00

Epoxy Catalyst

300.00

no bid submission

Epoxy Primer GRAY

300.00

no bid submission

offer:

Epoxy Primer GRAY with 1/4 liter catalyst

240.00

Epoxy Primer GRAY, Canadian

250.00

Epoxy Reducer

500.00

240.00

no bid submission

offer:

Epoxy Reducer, gallon

536.00

Extension cord with 5 Universal Outlets and
Individual Switches, 2500W, 104, 250V, 5gang,
1.83m cord length

750.00

750.00

no bid submission

sht

Flat GI Sheet Plain, Size: 3mm thickness; 3'x8'

3,000.00

680.00

no bid submission

offer:

Flat GI Sheet Plain, Size: 5omm thickness; x3'x8', No
paint

592.00

pek

Nylon Cable Tie, M3.6 M3 X 6" (150mm),
100pces/pek, Material: UV Resistant Nylon, Self-
locking design

300.00

145.00

no bid submission

rol

Nylon/Tansi, Strong Smooth Cord, Size: 1.00mm

200.00

180.00

no bid submission

offer:

Nylon/Tansi, Strong Smooth Cord, Size: 8omm x 37
meters

38.00

21

pc

PVC Pipes, Size: 4", thick type

1,300.00

no bid submission

offer:

PVC Pipes, Size: 4", thick type, Series 1000, Atlanta

1,200.00

PVC Pipes, Size: 4", thick type, x1000 S, Orange
Atlanta

1,306.00

13

pc

Paint pan

130.00

60.00

73.00

no bid submission

14

gal

Quick Dry Enamel Black

1,000.00

600.00

no bid submission

offer:

Quick Dry Enamel Black, Boysen

504.00

gal

Quick Dry Enamel White

1,000.00

745.00

1o bid submission

offer:

Quick Dry Enamel White, Boysen

674.00

pc

Quick Spring Clamps, Tips Tool Clip Jaw Opening
Replace, Size: 2", Maximum opening width:
3omm/1.18"

100.00

395.00

no bid submission

17

pc

Sewing/Tailoring Shears/ Tailor Scissors, High
quality Heavy duty fabric scissor, Ideal for cutting
fabric and cloth, Size: 9"

1,500.00

1,400.00

no bid submission

18

Pc

Stainless Steel Metal S-Hooks, Anti-rust and smooth
shoulders without notches, for safe to use,
size:4"/10cm, Color: mainly silver

30.00

ot

30.00

no bid submission

With delivery fee of
P600.00

Prices subjected to
change without prior
notice.

DOCUMENTARY REQUIREMENTS:

Mayor's/ Business Permit:

complied

complied

Omnibus Sworn Statement:

complied

complied

PhilGEPS Registration:

complied

complied

Mode of Procurement:

ACTION TAKEN:
For items no. 2, 3,6, 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 17 and 18, WI-AL CONSTRUCTION BUILDERS is the lowest calculated and most responsive bidder.

/pa

Small Value Procurement

PhilGEPS Registration no.: 8599094

For items no. 1, 4, 5 and 16, NO AWARD. For review of approved budget for the line item and/or technical specifications.

ALU GENERAL MERCHANDISE is non-compliant to the general conditions stated in the RFQ specifically number 4. (Price validity shall be for a period of 90
calendar days.)
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Committee on Bids and Awards:

SANTOS JQSE O. DACANAY

Chair, Bids ahd Awards Committ, A/
< —

EL M. ADDAWE CECI FE S. ABALOS
Vice Chair ember
fvé'(/l/f .
GRAZIELLE K. MICKLAY GLORIA Q. ROI@IGUERA
Member Membe:

ACTION OF THE HEAD OF THE PROCURING ENTITY: )

Dr. CORAZON L. ABANSI
UP Baguio, Chancellor

MENT QOFFICE (SPMO)
LI P BAGUIO
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