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27 May, 2022

MALOU YUSONGCO

Sales Executive

Republic of the Philippines

UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

HEXACOM ENTERPRISES
Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City
Tel. No:74.442.0198

Dear Ms. YUSONGCO:

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the Supply and Delivery of IT Accessories for College of Science under
RFQ No. 2496 dated 20 April, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to Four Thousand Nine
Hundred Seventy Pesos (Php 4,970.00) as follows:

QUANTITY

UNIT

PARTICULARS

UNIT COST

AMOUNT

2

set

USB Headset-Noise-Cancelling Microphone, Plantronics

3220

2,485.00

4,970.00

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of

Award.

Very truly yours,

oL

CORAZON L. ABA

Chancellor

Conforme:

Date:

(Name of Representati’\'/yeﬂ_cif' 3iddey)
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF
VARIOUS IT EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES

Canvass no. PC22.04.100 (RFQ No. 2496) Date: 02 May, 2022
NIU.COM
ITEM TAIPAN HEXACOM
No. | QTY | unIT PARTICULARS UNIT PRICE co::g;ren MARKETING ENTERPRISES
Book scanner - Overhead, simplex Color, Grayscale,
Monochrome, Automatic (color/ grayscale/ Monochrome
1 .
1 pc detection) Lens reduction optics / Color CCD x 1 (white 43 SH0.00 S
LED +lens illumination)
OFFER:
Book Scanner, Fujitsu SV600 0.00:}  48,500.00
Ergonomic Mouse 4000 dpi; Connectivity: Wireless,
2 3 pc |Bluetooth, USB; rechargeable;Black color; Compatible 4,000.00 NO BID NO BID
devices: Windows and 10S
OFFER:
Ergonomic Mouse, Logitech G502, MX-Master 25 3,400:00
Ergonomic Mouse, Logitech G502, MX-Master 3 5,300.00
Ergonomic Mouse pad with wrist support; Black color;
3 ¢ ? N
5 pc Non-slip base and stitched edges; medium size 1,000.00 He Jib s
OFFER:
Ergonomic Mouse pad with wrist support, Vic Tsing
4 2 box |LAN Cable Cat5E 305m 1000ft Color Gray 7,000.00 NO BID
OFFER:
LAN Cable, Cat5E UTP 24 AWG PVC Solid Cable - 5 500.00
305M/roll, Blue Color i
LAN Cable, Belden, 305m
Professional digital microphone condenser; USB
s D NO BID
2 5 pc Connector; Cardioid; black color 500,004 i
OFFER:
Professional Digital Microphone Condenser, Shure
.00
MOTIV MV5 AR T

Smart Managed Gigabit Desktop/Rackmount Switch at
least 16x RJ45 10/100/1000Mbps (Auto Negotiation/
6 1 un |Auto MDI/MDIX);at least 32Gbps;at least 23.8Mpps;at 9,000.00 NO BID
least 100-240V AC, auto-voltage, 50/60Hz;Metal with
mounting features and fanless

OFFER:
Smart Managed Switch, TPLink TL-SG1016DE y
Smart Managed Switch, TPLink TL-SG2218 8,200.C0
USB Headset-Noise-Cancelling Microphone, Padded
# 2 set |Headband and Plush Earpads, In-Line Volume and Mute 2,500.00 NO BID NO BID
Controls-Black
OFFER:

USB Headset-Noise-Cancelling Microphone,
Plantronics 3220

Wifi Router AX3000 Dual Band, Gigabit, 2T2R MU-MIMO,
WiFi 6, OFDMA ; at least 4x RJ45 10/ 100/ 1000Mbps;
at least one each for 2.4Ghz and 5Ghz; at least upto
2402Mbps (5Ghz), upto 574Mbps (2.4Ghz)

OFFER:

Wifi Router, TPLink Archer AX55 5,500.00 |
USB-C VGA MULTI-PORT ADAPTER connections: usb,
usb-c, vga compatible for mac os 10
OFFER:

USB-C VGA MULTI-PORT ADAPTER, Ugreen CM179 10

in-1, USB 3.0 x 3, HDMI, Card Reader, VGA/LAN
Dongle 10 in1 usb-c hub - 100W Power Delivery - 4K
UHD Visual Feast - 5Gbps Data Transfer - Input: 1xUSB-
C Male, 1xUSB-C Female - Output: 3 x USB 3.0, 1xHDMI
Port, 1XVGA Port,

OFFER:

Dongle 10-in-1, Apple 4,500.00

Dongle, Ugreen CM179 i
liumeric Keypads 35 keys wireless Bluetooth connection
cornpatible with Mac 0S
OFFER:

Numeric Keypads, Elecom 2,500.00

Numeric Keypads, Amorus N970 42:30070004"

7,500.00 NO BID

5,195:00)

4,500.00 NO BID NO BID

10 5 pc 3,200.00 NO BID NO BID

11 2 pc 3,500.00 NO BID NO BID
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Canvass no. PC22.04.100 (RFQ No. 2496) Date: 02 May, 2022
NIU.COM
ITEM TAIPAN HEXACOM
No. | QTY | UNIT PARTICULARS UNIT PRICE co::g;en MARKETING ENTERPRISES
USB C HUB 11-in-1 connection with VGA, HDMI
12 ' 4 BID
1| PC |ethernet, USB - C, USB, and Jack. e g i
OFFER:
USB C HUB 10-in-1, Ugreen CM179 2,950.00
-rxx Nothing Follows xxx-
Delivery Terms: NOT APPLICABLE |30CD 30CD
Documentary Requirements:
Mayor's/Business Permit NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED COMPLIED
Philgeps Registration Number 84481 29874 52877
Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement NO SUBMISSION [COMPLIED COMPLIED

Mode of Procurement: NP - Small Value Procurement
PhilGEPS Ref. No.: 8614810 -

Canvassed by: James B

RECOMMENDATION:

For Items 1 & 6, TAIPAN MARKETING is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder. /
For Items 2, 3, 4,7, 8,9, 10 & 11, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
For Items 5 & 12, no award, for review of technical specifications and approved budget for the contract. /

Committee on Bids and Awards:
<

S}ETOS JOSE O. DACANAY{IL]II 3 g Oéi M. ADDAWE
Chair w Vice Chair
W ,i /{,\ GJORIA Q. R GUERA
‘/b ember (/
CECILIA FE S. ABALOS ICKLAY
Member Me r

Action of the Head of the PPocuring Entity: APPROVED

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor

MLy 20 2022

—..__.
-

! MENT 27FICE (SPMO)
U.P BAGUIO
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