Republic of the Philippines
sy UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

S Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
> Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.upb.edu.ph

otice of Award

14 June, 2022

MALOU YUSONGCO

Sales Executive

HEXACOM ENTERPRISES

Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City
Tel. No:74.442.0198

Dear Ms. YUSONGCO:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the Supply and Delivery of Photographic Accessories for College of
Science under RFQ No. 2529 dated 13 May, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to

Seventy Nine Thousand Eight Hundred Pesos (Php 79,800.00) as follows:

QUANTITY UNIT PARTICULARS UNIT COST AMOUNT
6 un Magic Arm Kit, Manfrotto 143 10,000.00 60,000.00
Portable Dry Box, Andbon B-10 Portable Dry Box Kit
4 un with Dehumidifier 4,950.00 19,800.00

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of

Award.

Very truly yours,

oL

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor

Conforme: CRLTE

No._{ Adivay Ridy Honifacio S, Baguio City
e e P4 01 93
oJlu] o2

fdeh

page 1of 1




BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF

PHOTOGRAPHIC EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES

Canvass no. PC22.05.126 (RFQ No. 2529) Date: 27 May, 2022
ITEM RYNAV ULY TECH HEXACOM
No. | QTY | unIT PARTICULARS UNITPRICE | . NrERPRISES TRADING ENTERPRISES
Action camera Type: Compact Digital Camera Effective
Pixels (Megapixels): 23.9 million image processing may
1 5 un |reduce the number of effective pixels Image Sensor: 14,999.00 NO BID
CMOS X2 Sensor Size: 1/2.3-In. type Total Pixels: 21.14
million X2
OFFER:
Action Camera, SICAM SJ10 Pro 14,985.00
Action Camera, SICAM SJ8 Pro 14,200.00
Action Camera, Nikon Keymission 360 17,600.00
Magic Arm Kit Weight: 95.23 oz Arm Length: 20.87 in
Attachment (bottom): 1/4” thread female, 5/8” (16mm)
2 5 NO BID NO BID
6 un stud Top Attachment: 3/8” thread female, 5/8” (16mm) 18 A00-00
stud Color: Black Superclamp Compatible: Yes
OFFER:
Magic Arm Kit, Manfrotto 143
Portable Dry Box Holds Photo, Electronic, and Other
Gear Renewable Desiccant Humidity Protection
3 { NO BID
4 un Hygrometer Displays Relative Humidity Silent Operation 500000
Size : 295*238*224mm
OFFER:
Portable Dry Box, Andbon B-10 Portable Dry Box Kit 4,950.00 | -
with Dehumidifier S e
-nxx Nothing Follows xnx-
Delivery Terms: NOT APPLICABLE [30CD 30CD
Documentary Requirements:
Mayor's/Business Permit NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED COMPLIED
Philgeps Registration Number 274767 163904 52877
Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED COMPLIED
Mode of Procurement: NP - Small Value Procurement
PhilGEPS Ref. No.: 8665901 “ e .
Canvassed by: James Be| sic
RECOMMENDATION:
For Item 1, no award, for review of technical specifications and approved budget for the contract.
For Item 2, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES is the sole and responsive bidder,
For Item 3, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
Committee on Bids and Awards:
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