

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

**ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION ON PRICE FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF
VARIOUS CONSTRUCTION SUPPLIES FOR THE UNIVERSITY**

Canvass no. PC 22.05.144

May 27, 2022

Item No.	PARTICULARS		ABC PER ITEM	WI-AL CONSTRUCTION BUILDERS	WILCONSTRUCT ENTERPRISE	JSC HARDWARE	
	QTY	UNIT					
1	2	pc	AXE: fireman, wooden handle, 2kg, cutting edge: 3 inches, type: double blade, overall length: 600mm	4,000.00	2,000.00	1,800.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
2	1	L	Black Latex Paint	200.00	200.00	190.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
3	1	gal	Chocolate Brown Latex	700.00	700.00	690.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
4	2	pc	Clear Glass 1/8"x11"x13"	70.00	98.00	70.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
5	3	pc	Clear Glass 24" x 40" x 1/4"	1,040.00	1,240.00	960.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
6	1	pc	Concrete Drill Bit 1/4" or 3/16"	100.00	140.00	100.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
7	4	pc	Cork sheet 2ft x 3 ft. x 1/4" thick	450.00	450.00	450.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
8	12	set	Dual lockset, doorknob w/ bolt, heavy duty	2,000.00	1,850.00	1,650.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
9	20	rol	Dust Tape ; Cloth Type ; Size 48 mm c 25 m : Color (Red / Burgundy Only)	150.00	245.00	150.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
10	2	set	Electrical Outlet Plate 2Gang, Surface Type, With Screws	180.00	-	180.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
			offer:				
			Electrical Outlet Plate 2Gang, Surface Type, With Screws, Surface type		70.00	-	-
			Electrical Outlet Plate 2Gang, Surface Type, With Screws, w/ plate		150.00	-	-
11	4	pc	Electrical PVC Moulding 3/4"X8" or 25mm x 16mm x 2.44m	400.00	100.00	120.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
12	1	pc	Electrical Tape, Black	100.00	50.00	60.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
13	10	m	Electrical Wire THHN #12	40.00	30.00	40.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
14	1	pc	Exhaust Fan, Air Ventilator, 12"	1,800.00	1,550.00	1,800.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
15	2	pc	Flap Disk #36 HYM	50.00	70.00	50.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
16	1	gal	Gloss latex	620.00	730.00	620.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
17	6	pc	LED Tube light T8, 4ft, Day light	220.00	-	220.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
			offer:				
			LED Tube light T8, 4ft, Day light, Tube only		220.00	-	-
18	2	L	Lacquer sanding sealer	260.00	260.00	260.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
19	5	btl	Lacquer thinner 350ml/bot	70.00	50.00	70.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
20	2	btl	Lubricant Oil 360 ml, Spray Type	450.00	450.00	450.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
21	2	pc	Lumber, Pine (S4S) 2"x2"x10ft	215.00	200.00	215.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
22	3	pc	Lumber, Pine (S4S) 2"x4"x8"	385.00	320.00	385.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
23	1	pc	Marine Plywood 1/4"	450.00	450.00	450.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
24	3	L	Oil wood stain (mahogany)	230.00	210.00	230.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
25	2	pc	Paint Brush 1"	35.00	30.00	30.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
26	10	pc	Paint Roller Cloth with handle 4"	45.00	70.00	45.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
27	4	pc	Paint Roller Cloth with handle 7"	70.00	90.00	70.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
28	4	pc	Plastic paint pan, Paint Tray	35.00	50.00	35.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
29	2	pc	Ply wood 3/4"x4'x8' (Marine)	1,400.00	1,300.00	1,400.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
30	1	L	Poly reducer	235.00	235.00	235.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
31	2	L	Polyurethane top coat varnish w/ catalyst	500.00	400.00	500.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
32	2	gal	QDE White, Gloss It	1,300.00	820.00	880.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
33	2	L	Quick drying enamel	220.00	220.00	220.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
34	3	btl	Rugby (contact cement)	160.00	100.00	160.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
35	4	m	Sand Paper Rough #100	90.00	200.00	90.00	NO BID SUBMISSION

36	2	m	Sand paper rough #80	200.00	240.00	200.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
37	1	m	Sanding Paper #120 grit	260.00	200.00	260.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
38	35	pc	Sanding paper, No. 240 grit	20.00	20.00	20.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
39	1	TB	Silicon Sealant Clear	180.00	240.00	180.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
40	2	set	Sliding glass lock, heavy duty	320.00	300.00	320.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
41	1	set	Sliding glass tract set for 1/4" glass (analok)	1,400.00	1,400.00	1,400.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
42	4	pc	Universal Outlet Element	120.00	-	120.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
			offer:				
			Universal Outlet Element (element only)		70.00	-	-
43	2	set	Utility Box, Surface Type, White, with Tox screws	170.00	60.00	120.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
44	1	pc	Wall Fan, 3 variable coolness Levels	1,500.00	2,400.00	1,500.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
45	10	kg	White glue (Adhesive white glue, water based synthetic resin emulsion developed for bonding wood to wood, sets fast, dries clear, bonds strongly, non-toxic and non-flammable)	214.50	210.00	200.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
46	30	pc	Cood daylight Led Bulb 7W	100.00	100.00	100.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
47	6	pc	Universal Outlet Extension Cord 6 Gang with master Switch; 1.83 meter cord length, 2500W, 10A, 250V	600.00	-	600.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
			offer:				
			Universal Outlet Extension Cord 6 Gang with master Switch; 1.83 meter cord length, 2500W, 10A, 250V, Omni		900.00	-	-
48	10	pc	Universal Socket Adapter, 10A, 250V	65.00	65.00	65.00	NO BID SUBMISSION
			DOCUMENTARY REQUIREMENTS:				
			Mayor's Business Permit:		complied	complied	-
			PhilGEPS Registration:		complied	complied	-

Mode of Procurement: Small Value Procurement
PhilGEPS Registration no.: 8677517

ACTION TAKEN:

For items no. 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 37, 38, 40, 41, 43, 46 and 48, **WLAL CONSTRUCTION BUILDERS** is the lowest calculated and most responsive bidder.

For items no 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 8, 9, 15, 16, 17, 18, 26, 27, 28, 35, 36, 39, 42, 44, 45 and 47, **WILCONSTRUCT ENTERPRISE** is the lowest calculated and most responsive bidder.

Committee on Bids and Awards:

SANTOS JOSE O. DACANAY III
Chair, Bids and Awards Committee

JOEL M. ADDAWE
Vice Chair

GRAZIELLE K. MICKLAY
Member

CECILIA FE S. ABALOS
Member

GLORIA Q. RODRIGUERA
Member

ACTION OF THE HEAD OF THE PROCURING ENTITY:

Dr. CORAZON L. ABANSI
UP Baguio, Chancellor

APPROVED

PROCURING ENTITY
JUN 10 2022
OFFICE OF THE CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER (SPMO)
UP BAGUIO

JUN 13 2022