

Republic of the Philippines University of the philippines baguio

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600 Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484 www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

23 June, 2022

MALOU YUSONGCO Sales Executive **HEXACOM ENTERPRISES** Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City Tel. No: 74.442.0198

Dear Ms. YUSONGCO:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the Supply and Delivery of IT Accessories for Office of the Vice Chancellor for Administration under RFQ No. 2538 dated 18 May, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to Thirty Four Thousand Nine Hundred Fifty Pesos (Php 34,950.00) as follows:

QUANTITY	UNIT	PARTICULARS	UNIT COST	AMOUNT	
1	set	NAS Diskstation 2x 3.5/2.5" SATA HDD/SSD Drive Bays, 2xGigabit Ethernet port, 2GB of DDR4 RAM, 2.0 Ghz Dual-Core processor, 2x4 TB 5900 rpm NAS Storage	34,950.00	34,950.00	

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of Award.

Very truly yours,

CORAZON L. ABANSI

of alus

Chancellor

Conforme:

(Name of Rupres Andrews) Bright Confidence of Rupres Andrews Bright Confidence of Rupres Andrews (074) 442-0198

0/24/2022

page 1 of 1

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

University of the Philippines Baguio Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF VARIOUS IT EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES

Canvass no. PC22.05.133 (RFQ No. 2538)

1 1 × 5

Date: 02 June, 2022

ITEM NO.	QTY	UNIT	PARTICULARS	UNIT PRICE	NIU.COM COMPUTER SHOP	TAIPAN MARKETING	HEXACOM ENTERPRISES
1	1	рс	5 port Gigabit Wireless dual chain, dual-band router with POE in and out Architecture: ARM 32bit CPU: IPQ-4019 CPU core count: 4 With Router OS See Attached for additional specifications	9,000.00		NO BID	
			OFFER:				
			5 port Gigabit Wireless dual chain, Asus Tuff Gaming AX3000		8,800.00		
			5 port Gigabit Wireless dual chain, Mikrotik RB952UI- 5AC2ND-TC				7,950.0
2	200	рс	Flash drive 16gb Interface: USB 3.0 interface Backwards compatibility: Compatible with USB 2.0 devices	370.00	+	316.00	
	14.55		OFFER:		1		
			Flash drive, 32GB 3.0 USB Drive, Apacer		360.00		
			Flash drive, 32GB 3.0 USB Drive, Hikvision		360.00		
			Flash drive, 16GB 3.0, Sandisk				280.0
3	2	un	Heavy-duty 1U Home Router with USB 3.0, 1G and 2.5G Ethernet and a 10G SFP+ cage, Architecture: ARM 64bit, CPU: 88F7040, CPU core count: 4, CPU nominal frequency: 350-1400 (auto) MHz, RouterOS license: 5, Operating System: RouterOS (v7 only), Size of RAM: 1 GB, Storage size: 1 GB, Storage type: NAND, MTBF: Approximately 200'000 hours at 25C, Tested ambient temperature: -40°C to 60°C, LAN ports: 7x 10/100/1000Mbps, 2.5G ports: 1x, SFP+ port: 1x, USB port: 1x USB3.0 type A, With power adapter and complete accessories	18,000.00		NO BID	
			OFFER:		, and a second of		
			Heavy-duty 1U Home Router with USB 3.0, TPLink C5400X, AC5400 Mu-Mimo, Triband		17,495.00		
			Heavy-duty 1U Home Router with USB 3.0, Mikrotik RB4011 Router				18,000.00
4	4	set	Ink Jet Printer, Type: All-in-one, Print Scan, Copy, Fax, Color Inkjet w/ADF, CISS Print Speed: at least upto 33ppm (black)/20ppm (color) for Draft A4 (Please see attached Specifications)	29,000.00		NO BID	NO BID
			OFFER:				
			Ink Jet Printer, Epson L6490, Print, Scan, Copy, fax with ADF		27,500.00		
5	3	рс	Memory card micro SD card, 512GB	6,500.00	NO BID	4,750.00	5,600.00
6	1	set	NAS Diskstation 2x 3.5/2.5" SATA HDD/SSD Drive Bays, 2xGigabit Ethernet port, 2GB of DDR4 RAM, 2.0 Ghz Dual-Core processor, 2x4 TB 5900 rpm NAS Storage	36,000.00		NO BID	34,950.00
			OFFER:				
			NAS Diskstation, DS220+, 2 Bay Diskstation with One (1) WD Ultrastar HC310 4TB HDD		35,495.00	-	
7	1	рс	Portable external Drive; 2TB	6,000.00		4,500.00	5,194.00
			OFFER:			1,500.00	3,194.00
			Portable external Drive; 2TB, WD		5,350.00		
			Portable external Drive; 2TB, Transcend		5,350.00		
			-,,		. 3,330.00		
			-¤¤¤ Nothing Follows ¤¤¤-				
+			Dolivony Torms				
	-		Documentary Requirements:		30CD	30CD :	30CD
+	-		Mayor's/Business Permit		COMBINE		
+			Philgeps Registration Number				COMPLIED
			Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement				52877
					JOIN LILD	COMPLIED	COMPLIED

Mode of Procurement: NP - Small Value Procurement

PhilGEPS Ref. No.:

8678936

Canvassed by:

RECOMMENDATION:

For Items 1 & 3 no award, for recanvass.

For Items 2 & 6, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.

For Item 4, NIU.COM COMPUTER SHOP is the sole and responsive bidder.

For Items 5 & 7, TAIPAN MARKETING is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.

Committee on Bids and Awards:

GLORIA Q. RUDRIGUERA

APPROVED

Action of the Head of the Procuring Entity:

CORAZON L. ABANSI Chancellor

RTY

THE DEFICE (SPYO)

0.01.A.j 1)