Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.upb.edu.ph

Noti Pro d

August 05, 2022

Nick Son D, Jara

Authorized Representative

Belman Laboratories

Belman Building, 78 Cordillera St, cor. Quezon Avenue

Quezon City, Metro Manila
(02) 712-0201/ (0917) 190-1907

Dear Mr. Jara:

Notice is hereby given to Belman Laboratories represented by its Authorized

Representative, Nick Son D. Jara, that work may commence on the Supply and
Delivery of La S lies for the College of Science effective on
or day/s after the receipt of this notice.

Upon receipt of this notice, you are responsible for performing the services under the
terms and conditions of the Agreement and in accordance with the Implementation

Schedule.

Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by signing both copies in the
space provided below. Keep one copy and return the other to the University of the
Philippines Baguio.

Very truly yours,

DYMPHNA N. JAVIER
Dean, College of Scie

Conforme:

(Mr.) Nic:%

(Name of Representative of Bidder)

Date: AUgUSt 12, 2022
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Supply & Property Management Office
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
VAT Reg. TIN: 000-864-006-00007

UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

PURCHASE ORDER
College of Science.
Supplier i Belman Laboratories PO No: SPMQ-T_F-22-08_~143 (2769)
Address: Belman Building 78 Cordillera St. cor. Quezon Avenue, Quezon City, Metro Manila Date:  5-Aug-2022
Telephone No. (02) 712-0201/(0917) 190-1907 Maode of Procurement:
E-mail: romeol 130@gmail.com, nickson.d.jara@gmail.com, belmanlab@gmail.com NP - Small Value Procurement
TIN: 000-391-662-000 PR Nox 16525, 16563
Gentlemen:
Please furnish this Office the following articles subject to the terms and conditions contained herein:
Place of Delivery: Supply and Property Management Office (SPMO), UP Baguio Delivery Term: : : :
Contact Person: Brian D. Lumague EQ.B. - Destination (IP Baguio)
Contact Address: Governor Pack Road, Baguic City Payment Term:
20 calendar days
Contact #/ Email: (074] 442-3484/ bdlumague@up.eduph Date of Delivery:
S Unit Description Qty. | UnitCost Amount
Property No.
Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Supplies for the College of
Science
Carousel Stand for 6 Pipettes, Fortuna; no pipette holder; 10 ul
sterile, RNASE, DNASE, rack, 96 tips, Biologix; 200 ul sterile,
RNASE, DNASE, rack, 96 tips, Biologix; 1000 ul sterile, RNASE,
seE DNASE, rack, 100 tips, Biologix; 0.5-10uL pipette, Biologix; 10- i F31,08000 $o1,00000
100uL pipette, Biologix; 20-200uL pipette, Biologix; 100-1000uL
pipette, Biologix 3 :
btl  |Absolute Ethanol, 2.5L/btl, Labscan 1 LUAR1069-P 10 P 2,136.00 ?21,360.00
btl  [Mueller Hinton Agar, 500g/btl, Titan Media 1 ™mTM330’ ok ?2,579.00 £ 2,579.00
btl  |Sodium Chloride, 1kg/btl, Labscan | UAR1167-P 2 #837.00 P 1,674.00
***Nothing Follows***
Tunit  x KBO1-2101 MicroPette Plus Single-channel Adjustable Volume 0.5-10u1 6,300.00/unit
Tunit  x KB01-2102 MicroPette Plus Single-channel Adjustable Volume 20-200! 6,300.00/unit
Tunit x KBO1-2104 MicroPette Plus Single-channel Adjustable Volume 10-100pl ,300.00/unit
lunit x KBO1-2110 MicroPette Plus Single-channel Adjustable Volume 100-1000y! 6,300.00/unit
1unit x KF -01 Carousel Stand for 6 Pipettes 4,725<00/un|t
rack x KB21-D010A Pipet tips, 1851. Racked, Sterile, RNase& DNase Free, Clear, 96 Tg:sfﬁ, ck 385.00/rack
lrack x KB21-0200A  Pipet tips, 200l Racked, Sterile, RNase & DNase Free, Yellow, 96 Tipg/Rack 385.00/rack
lrack x KB21-1000A  Pipet tips, Tml Racked, Sterile, RNase & DNase Free, Blue, 100 Tnps}:i ck 385.00/rack
Canvass no. PC-22-06-150
(Total Amountin Words): Fifty Six Thousand Six Hundred Ninely Three Pesos P 56,693.00

shall be imposed on the undelivered item/s.

In case of failure to make the full delivery within the time specified above, a penalty of one-tenth (1/10) of one percent for every day of delay

DYMPHNA N. JAVIER

Very truly yours,

Conforme:

{Mr.) hiick '86n Jara

Signature over Printed Name of Su
August 12, 2022
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Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No, 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

July 28, 2022

Nick Son D. Jara

Authorized Representative

Belman Laboratories d
Belman Building, 78 Cordillera St. cor. Quezon Avenue ;Y
Quezon City, Metro Manlila il g g
(02) 712-0201/ (0917) 190-1907 d

Dear Mr. Jara:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the execution for the Supply and
Delive f Laboratory S lies for th Il of Science under Abstract of

Quotations No. PC-22-06-150 dated June 20, 2022 is hereby awardec to you at a
contract price equivalent to Fifty Six Thousand Six Hundred Ninety Three Pesos
(Php 56,693.00).

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within ten (10) calendar days upon
receipt of this Notice of Award.

Very truly yours,

CORAZON L. ABANSI

Chancell%

Conforme:

(Name of Representative of Bidder)

e August 5, 2022
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ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR THE
LABORATORY SUPPLIES FOR

Canvass no. PC-28-06-180

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Eack Road, Baguio City

UP BAGUIO

Date: 20 June 2022

Item

Unit Cost

Noveaulub Asia
Coxrp.

ahemlina
Helentific
Corporation

Diamed
Enterprise

Belman
Laboratories

QTY

UNIT

Supply and Delivery of Laboxatory Supplies

(RFQ No. 8541)

10

: bl

Absolute Ethanol, 2.51/btl

3,000,000

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Absolute Ethanol, 2.6L/bt], Merck 1008832511

3,000.00

Abgalute Bthanot, 2.6L/bt], Labscan

: bl

Agar Bactericlogy, BO0g/btl

5,800.00

no bid

1o bid

no bid

Offer:

Agar Bactariology, 00g/bt], Titan Modia

¢ pok

Agarose, Moleoular Biclogy Grade, 1008

2,600.00

{ nobid

Offer:

%,638.00

no bid

15t Bage BI0-1000-100g Agarcse, Bictechnology Grade

4,113.00

Agarose, Molecular Biclogy Grade, 100g, TPC 39301

7,200.00

Dbl

Bromocresol gresn, 26g/btl

3.600.00

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Bromecresol green, 25g/bsl, TPC 24000

Bromocresol green, 2Bg/btl, Lobie Chemia

10,872.00

Bromthymol blus, 100g/bil

10,300.00

no bid

no bid

bkl

Offer:

Abcam abl46293 Bromothymol blue, pH indicator 5¢

3,800.00

Bromthymo! blue, 26g/btl, TPC 24008

Bromthymol blue, 26g/btl

3,820.00

Buffer 7.0 pH

900.00

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Buffar 7.0 pI, Ajax

Buffer 7.0 pH, Labscaa

924.00

: sab

DIY Agar Laboratory Kits

80,000.00

10 bkl

o bid

- 1o bid

no bid

Nutrient Agar Kib

10/ pack nutrient agar plate Som Slayer package

sl

Di-potassium Hydrogen Orthophosphate (anyhydrous) USP grads,
B00g/bLL .

1,300.00

10 bid

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Di-potassicm Hydrogen Orthophosphate (anyhydrous) USP grads,
BO0g/bt, TPC 32616

. bl

Ferric Amnmonium Citrate, 500g/btl

3,600.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

10

16

. set

Foldscops Assembled Classroom Kib (10 Assemnbled Foldscope Paper
Microscopes),

4,600.00

no bid

no bid

ne hid

The Kit includes:

1 Welcome Latber f Instruction Sheet

10 Nylon Carrying Pouches

10 Agsembled Foldscope Paper Microscopes

10 Microprint Slides

10 Field Guide Cards

10 Blide Boxes (1 pre-made slide, 2 blank gass slides)

10 LED Magnifiers

10 Tweezers

10 Eppendorf Tubes

10 Pipsattes

10 Ancessory Bags - Stickers (each containing):

1 Phone Couplar

1 Pramotional Sticker

7 Oheota of Ring Stickers

2 Sheote Clear Stickors

6 Paper Sddes

1 Legson Plan Booklet*:

11

bitl

Qlyuerine /Glyceral 98.6% Reagent Grade, 2.5L/btl

3R260.00

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Glycerine /Glycercl 90.5% Reagent Grade, 2.5L/btl, Scharlau
GLOD262500

Giycerine /Glycercl 89.5% Reagent Grade, 2.5L/bt], Loba, Chemie

4,318.00

12

htl

Luria Bertani Agar, RB0g/HEl

5,880.00

no bid

1o bid.

no bid

Offer:

Luria Bertani Agar, B00g/btl, Pronadisa 1083




Canvass no. PG-23-06-150 Date: 20 June 2022

Chemline Di
It;:. Unit Cost “émc‘f‘: Asta u:z?:j:l:n nn$:u x.-::l:;‘:iu
QTY |:UNIT
i Supply and Dellvery of Laboratory Supplies
13 1 : byl |Muellar Hinton Agar, 500g/btl 5,500.00 no bid no bid
: Offer: '
Musller Hinten Agar, G00g/bt], Hi Media 173 3,800.00
Musller Hinton Agar, BO0g/btl, Titan Media
14 1 |; st |Multi-channsl pipettor kit (8 channsls) 60,000.00 no bid no bid no bid
: Kit Contains:
-0.5-10nL: (1)
-10-100uL (1)
-30-300ul, (1)
Offer:

DLAB MicroPetta Plus Multi-channel Pipette

DLAB 7030303004, MicroPette Plus Multi-charme? Pipetts, 8

channel, 0.6 to 10 1l

DLAB 7030303008, MicroPette Plus Multi-channel Pipette, 8

channsl, B to BO pl

DLAB 7030303012, MicroPette Flus Multi-channel Pipette, 8

channsl, 5O to 300 nl

15 1 : un |PCRXIt 8,000.00 no hid no hid 30 no bid
100 app of 2X Taq Master Mix (with Tag DNA Polymerase
[C.0Byl/ul), 0.4mM, dNTPs, 5.0mM MgCI2 , 2X ViBuffar A)
1ml of 5OmM MgCl12

1ml of 6X Loading Dye

3ml of Nuclease-Free Water

. 26ug of 100bp Flug DNA Ladder

16 1 ' un | PGenomic DNA Isclation Kit, 60 Praps 18,000.00 : 1o bid ${0[0.0 no bid

+ Isclate gonomio DNA from animal tissues, cells, bodily fiuids,

viruses and swabs

+ Rapid and convenient spin column procedure

+ Purified DNA is of the highest quality and integrity

Offer;
Promega ARZ360, Wizard® SV Genomic DNA Purification System,
: 50 preps 14,423.66
17 1 i bbl  |[Phenol red, 26g/btl 1,000.00 no bid no bid no bid
. Offer: )
. Fhenol red, 25g/btl, Loba Chemie ) 2,514.00
18 1 {: un (Plasmid DNA Extraction Kit (RNase A included), B0 props 7,000.00 nobid 1o bid AL no bid
18 1 . w1 |Potassium chloride, SO0/ /bt 550,00 no bid 116 bid no bid
Offer:

Pobassium chloride, 500/, Labscan 282.00
20 1 ., btl | Bafranine, 2Bg/btl 1,760.00 _ nohid no bid
Ofler:

Safranine, 26g/btl, TPC 37087

Bafranine, 26¢/btl, Loba Chemie 2,280.00
Rl 3 " st |Single-chanmsl pipettor kit: 40,000.00 no hid
i The Kit ingludes:

Micropipettor stand

Fipette holder

Optifit Tip rack (0.1-10 4, 0.5-200 pl, 10-1000 pl)

0.B-10pL pipette

10-100nL pipetite

20-2001L pipatte

100-1000pL pipstte

Offer:

DLAB HiPette, Premiurmn Mechanical autoclavable pipette 39,210.60 32,000.00
DLAB 7030511004, HiPette Prermium mechanical autoclavable
pipstte 0.5 to 10 nl
DLAB 7030511008, HiPsette Pramium mechanical autoclavable
pipstte 10 to 160 ul
DLAB 030511000, HiPstte Pramium mechanical autoclavable
pipsette 20 to 200 ul
DLAB 7030511014, HiPette Premium mechanical autoclavable
pipatte 0.1-1.0 ml
DLAB 7030000088, Linear stand, holds 6 pipettes

Carousel Stand for 8 Pipettes, Fortuna; no pipette holder; 10 ul
sterile, RNASE, DNASE, rack, 96 tips, Biologix; 200 ul sterile,
RIVASE, DNASE, rack, 96 tips, Biologix; 1000 ul sterile, RNASE,
DN ASE, rack, 100 tips, Blologix; 0.5-10pL pipette, Biologix; 10-
100ul: pipetts, Biologix; 20-200pL pipette, Biologix; 100-1000uL
pipette, Biologix R

22 1 |: bl |Skirn Milk for microbiology ,Millipors Y0168, BOOg/bt 4 350,00 no bid no bfdn/ o bid

CERTIFIEP TROE COPY
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Canvass no. PC-22-068-180

Date: 20 June 2022

Chemlina
Item Noveaulah Asix Diamed Belman
Uit Cost : Helantif]
No. Corp. Gurp':n ﬁ:n Entarprise Labvoratories
QTY | IUNIT
: Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Supplies
23 1 w1l | Sodiam Acetate, BOOg/btl 750,00 1o bid no bid
Offer:
Sodium Acstate, 500g/btl, TPC 35105 9x0
; Sodium Acetate, 500g/btl, Loba Chemie 1,143.C0
24 2 ibtl | Sodivm Chloride, 500g/btl 200000 1,89B.C0
. Offer:
1st Baga BIO-1110-1kg Sodtum Chloride, Biotechnology Grade, 1kg 4,492.00
1st Base BIO-1110-600¢g Sedium Chloride, Biotachnology Grade, 3.380.00
BOOg ’
Sodium Chloride, 500g/btl, TPC 33127 750.00
. Sodium Chioride, 1kg/bil, Labscan
2B 2 ‘L Sodium Hypochlorita Technical grade 800.00 ‘no bid
26 1 iptl | Sedium phosphate (monobasic), BOOg/btl 1,500.00 no bid
Dffer:
Sodium phosphats (moncbasic), 500g/btl} TPC 35133
: Sodium phosphate (mongbasic), 500g/bk, Loba Chemie 1,906.00
av 1 btl  |Sodium phosphate (tribasic), 500g/btl 1,800.00 ‘nobid no bid ne bid no bid
Documentary Requirements:
Mayor's/ Business Permit i comply comply comply comply
FPhHGEPS Registration Classification i Flatinum Flatinum Red Platinum
FPhllGEPS Registration Number i 195829 80821 0448 2291
Omnibug Sworn Statement (for ABCs above Fhp 50,000}
Mode of Procurement: NP - Small Value Procurament !
PhilGEPS Reforence No.: 8882370
Canvacssed by: : umague
REGOMMEH'DATION.
N FGI‘ items 1,13,21,24, Belman Laboratories is the loweat calculated and responsive bidder.
For items 2,17,19,23, for review of technical speciﬁca.tions and approved budget for the items.
Fer items 3,18, Diamed Enterprise iz the regponsive bidder.
" |
Far itoms 4,5,8,11,20,23,26, Chemline Scientific cfrx-porauon is the lowest caleulated and responsive bidder.
For itoms 7,9,10,27, for re-canvass. i
Far items 8,12,25, Chemline Scientific Corporatioh i the sole and responsive bidder,
|
Fm'j item 14, Noveaulab Asia Corp. is the sole and #esponsiva bidder,
For items 16,18, Diamed Enterprise is the sole and Eresponsive bidder.
Committee on Bids and Awards:
%
JOEL M. ADDA
Cheir
( iap ot A o/
A FE 8.M, .A.'BAI.OS
Member
ARIS GINALDO
iber
Action of Head of the Procuring Entity:
CORAZON L, .AJBAHEI Do _-1
Chancellor Jul 25 2{}?2 CERTIF] UE COPY
OF THE ORIGINAL
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