Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No, 442-3888/442-3484

www,upb.edu.ph

Noti Procee

August 05, 2022

Rolen Ramirez
Technical Sales Representative

Diamed Enterprise
10683 Elon-Elon St., Sta Fe Subd., Batong Malake, Los Bafios, Laguna

(02) 584-4762/ (049) 536-0625/ +639955591059

Dear Mr. Ramirez:

Notice s hereby given to Diamed Enterprise represented by its Techr ical Sales
Representative, Rolen Ramirez, that work may commence on the Sunp v and

Delivery of Laboratory Supplies for the College of Science effective on

or day/s after the receipt of this notice.

Upon receipt of this notice, you are responsible for performing the services under the
terms and conditions of the Agreement and in accordance with the Implementatlon

Schedule.

Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by signing both copies in the
space provided below, Keep one copy and return the other to the Umvers:ty of the

Philippines Baguio,

Very truly yours,

DYMPHNA N. JAVIER
Dean, College of Science
Conforme:

Folen LY Ramirez

7

(Name of Representative of Bidder)

Date: 12 August 2022

fbyt
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? .m UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO
* ‘ Supply & Property Management Office
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
VAT Reg. TIN: 000-864-006-00007
PURCHASE ORDER
college of Science:
Suppler: Dlamed Enterprise PO No: SPMO-RF-22:08:046 (2771)
Addiess : -10683 Elon-Elon §t., Sta Fe Subd, Batong Malake, Ligs Bafios, Laguna’ Dite:  5-Augs2p22
Telephone No.: (02) 584-4762/ (049} 536:0625/+639955591055 Mode of Procu‘rerrent.
E-mall; enquirles@diamed-ph.com; diamed.ent@gmail.com, rolen@diamed-phi.com NP - Small Value Procurement
TIN: .150-319-922-000 PR No:;. 16523
Génﬂémen: )
EP]ease furnish thig Office the following articles subject to the terms ‘and conditions contained herein:
Plai:e of Delivery:  Stupply and Property Managemerit Office {SPM0), UP Baguio Delivery Term: | S ‘
Contact Person: Brian D, Luriague ‘ EQR. - Destination (UP Baguio).
Contacl: Address:  “Governor Pack Road, Baguio City’ Payment Term:
Contar:t #/ Email: (074) 442-3484/ balumague@up.eduph Date of Delivery:
sm:k/ } . - L ’
Properly No. | Unit Description Qty. Unit Cost. Amount
Supplyand Delivery of Laboratory Supplies for the Collegeof
. |Science.
; pck  {Agarose; Molecular Biology Grade, 100g 1 F7,140.00 ¥ 7,140.00
‘ un PCRKit 1 P8,760.00 ?8,760.00
! 100 app:of 2X Taq Master Mix [w1th Taq’ DNA Polymerase
[0i05ul/ul), 0 4mM, dNTPs, 3.0mM MgCI2,, 2X ViBuffer A)
1ml of 50mM MgCI2 '
i imlof 6X Loading Dye
| 3mi.of Nuclease-Free Water
{ 25ug of 100bp Plus DNA Ladder .
! un PGenomic.DNA Isolation Kit, 50 Preps 1 #:15,730,00 #15,730.00
» Isolate. genomic DNA from animal tissues, cells, bodily:fluids,
viruses.and swabs
| s Rapid-and:convenient spin column procedure
; » Purified DNA is of the highest quality-and integrity |
: un P]asmld DNA Extraction Kit {RNase Aincluded), 50 preps 1 P 6,405.00 $6,405.00
f **Nothing Follows***
Canvass no, PC-22-06-150
{Tofal Amiountin Words): Thirty Eight Thousand Thirly Five Pesos ¥ 38,035.00

Conforme;

olen LY Ramirez

Signature over Printed Nanie of Suppller
12 Auqust 2022
Date

ln case of failire to niakethe full delivery within the time specified above, a penalty of one-tenth (1/1 0} of one percent for every day of delay
shal’l bie imposed on the undelivered item/s, '

Very‘trti]y yours; S

DYMPHNA N. JAVIER

Dean, College of -Scier%g

05206441 & PO LAB

ORS/BURS Nog: 0Z2-20G4t}1-2022 -0 - |44
Date of the ORS/BURS; pE - 08-2030

T peigt

s T T IRTY| Amount: 22, 3D -
O
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Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

July 28, 2022

Rolen Ramirez
Technical Sales Representative

Diamed Enterprise
10683 Elon-Elon St., Sta Fe Subd., Batonc Malake, Los Bafios, Laguna

(02) 584-4762/ (049) 536-0625/ +639955591059

Dear Mr. Ramirez:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the execution for the Supply and
Deliv f rato lies for the Colle f Scienc under Abstract of

Quotations No, PC-22-06-150 dated June 20, 2022 is hereby awardea to you at a
contract price equivalent to Thirty Eight Thousand Thirty Five Pesos (Php

38,035.00).

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within ten (10) calendar days upon
receipt of this Notice of Award.

Very truly yours,
CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor

Conforme:

ﬁmmrez

(Name of Representative of Bidder)

Date: 5 August 2022

Mgt
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
TUniversity of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR THE

LABORATORY SUPPLIES FOR UP BAGUIO

Canvase no. PC-22-06-180

Date: 20 June 2022

Item

Uoit Cost

Noveaulab Asin
Carp.

Ghemling
Belentinic
Corporation

Diamed
Enterprise

Balman
Lakoratories

QTY

TNIT

Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Supplies

(RFQ No. 2541)

10

bEl

Absclute Ethanol, & 8L/btL

3 000.00

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Absolute Ethanol, 2,51/btl, Merck 1009832511

| 3,000.00

Absolute Ethanol, 8.BL/btl, Labscan

bhl

Adar Bacteriology, 500g/btl

2,800.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

Offar:

Agar Bactariology, BOOg/btl, Titan Media

Agarose, Molecular Biology Grade, 100g

7,600.00

{ nobid

Qffor:

5,858.00

no bid

18t Base B10-1000-100g Agarose, Biotechnology Grade

4,113,00

Agaroge, Molecular Biology Grade, 100g, TPC 30301

ol

Bromooresol gresn, 26g4/btl

&600.00

no bid

1o bid

Offer:

Bromocrezol grean, 25g/btl, TPC 24000

Bromocresol green, 26g/btl, Lobie Chemie

10,872.00

btl

Bromthymel blue, 100g/btl

10,30.00

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Abcarn abl468293 Bromothymol blue, pH indicator 5¢

6,800.00

Bromthymol blue, 25g/bti, TPC 24006

Bromthymol bluse, 25g/btE

,329.00

Buffer 7.0 pH

800.00

no bid

no bid

Offor:

Buffer 7.0 pH, Ajax

Buffer 7.0 pH, Labscan

924.00

set

DIY Agar Laboratory Kite

30,000.00

no bid

no bid

- nobid

no bid

Nutrient Agar Kit

. 10/ pack nutrient agar plate Bem S-layer package

bl

Di-potassium Hydrogen Orthophosphate (anyhydrous) TSP grade,
500g/b .

1,300.00

10 bid

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Di-potassium Hydrogen Orthophosphate (anyhydrous) USP grade,
500g/btl, TPC 32616

btl

Farrie Amnmonium Citrate, 600g/btl

860000

no bid

| nobid

no bid

no bid

10

18

gat

Foldscope Assembled Classroom Kib (10 Assembled Foldscope Faper
Microscopes)

4.600.00

no bid

noe bid

1o bid

no bid

The Kit includes:

1 Welcoma Letter / Instruction Sheat

10 Nylon Carrying Pouches

10 Assembled Foldscope Faper Microscopes

10 Microprint Slides

10 Field Guide Cards

10 Slide Boxes (1 pre-mads slide, 2 blank glass slides)

10 LED Magnifiers

10 Twgezers

10 Eppendorf Tubes

10 Pipsttes

10 Accessory Bags - Stlckers (each containing):

1 Phone Coupler

1 Promotional Sticker

3 Bheets of Ring Stickers

2 Sheete Clear Stickers

6 Paper S.ddes

1 Lesson Plan Booldlet*:

11

bl

Glycarine /Glycerol 89.6% Reagent Grade, 2.5L/bt)

3.260.00

T bid

no bid

Qifer:

@lycerine /Glycerol 99.6% Roagant Grade, 2.6L/btl, Scharlau
GLG0RB2600

Glycerine /Glycerol 99.8% Reagent Grade, 2.6L/bitl, Loba Chemie

4,318.00

12

htl

Turie Bertani Agar, 260g/btl

5,860.00

no bid

no bid

Offar:

Taria Bertanl Agar, 500g/btl, Pronadisa 1083

CERTIFIER 4

ORIGINAL puge1ars



Canvass no. PC-28-06-150

: 20 June 2022

Item

Unit Cost

Noveanlab Asla
Corp.

ChemIine
Bolentific
Corporation

Dlaxed
Enterpriss

Balman
Laboratorjes

QTY

UNIT

Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Supplies

13

bkl

Muellor Hinton Agar, 500g/btl

5,600.00

no bid

ne bid

Offer:

Musller Hinton Agar, B00g/btl, Hi Media 173

| &,600.00

Mueller Hinton Agar, B00g/tl, Titan Media

14

set

Multi-channsl pipattor Idt (8 channals)

60,000.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

Kit Contains:

-0.5-10p% (1)

-10-100uL (1)

~B0.G00NL (1)

Offer:

DLAB MicroPette Flus Multi-channel Pipette

DLAB 7030303004, MioroPette Flus Multi-channel Pipette, 8
channel, 0.5 to 10 1l

DLAB 7030303006, MicroPette Plus Multi-channsl Pipette, 8
channel, 6 to B0 pl

DLAB 7030303012, MioroPetts Plus Multi-channsl Pipette, 8
channel, B0 to 3001l

16

un

PCR Kib

5,000.00

no bid

| mobid

100 app of X Taq Master Mix (with Taq DNA Polymsrase
[0.0Bpl/ul), 0.4mM, dNTPs, 3.0mM MgCIR , RX ViBuffor A)

1rnl of 50mM MgCl2

1l of 6X Loading Dye

3l of Nuclease-Frea Water

285ug of 100bp Plus DNA Ladder

16

PGenomic DNA, Isclation Kit, 50 Praps

16,000.00

nio bid

+ Igolate genomic DNA from animal tissues, cells, bodily fluids,
viruses and swabs

no bid

» Rapid and ¢onvenlent spin column procedure.

- Purified DNA i§ of the higheat quality and integrity

Offer:

Promega ARBE0, Wisard® 8V Genomic DNA Purification System,
80 preps

14,423.66

17

il

Phenol red, ABg/btl

1,000.00

. mobid

| mobid

no bid

Offer:

Fhendl red, 26g/btl, Loba Chemie

18

un

Flagmid DN A Extraction Kit (RNase A included), 50 preps

7,000.00

no bid

no bid

bil

Potasstum chloride, 500g/btl

5850.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

2,814.00
no bid

Qffer:

Potassium chloride, S00g/bt], Labscan

982.00

20

bhl

Bafraning, 2Bgmtl

1,750.00

no bid

no bid

Offer:

Bafranine, R5g/MEL, TPC 37087

Safranine, R6g/btl, Loba Chemie

2,280.00

21

sst

Single-channel pipettor kit:

40,000.00

no bid

The Xit ingludes;

Micropipettor stand

Pipette holder

Dptifit Tip rack (0. 1-10 pl, 0.5-200 i, 10-1000 pl)

0,5-10pL pipette

10-100uL pipette

20-2001L pipetta

100-1000uL pipette

Offer:

DLAB HiPette, Premium Mechanical autoclavable pipsette

59,210.00

52,000.00

DLAB 7030511004, HiPette Premium mechanical autoclavable
pipette 0.5 to 10 ul

DLAB 7030511008, HiPatte Premiwm mechanieal autoclavabla
pipetts 10 to 100 pl

DLAB 7030611008, HiPetta Premium mechanical autoclavable
pipetto R0 to 20011

DLAB 7030511014, HiPette Premium mechanical autoclavable
pipette 0.1-1.0 ml

DLAB 7030000086, Linear stand, holds 8 pipettes

Carousel Btand for 6 Fipettes, Fortuna; no pipette holder; 10 w1
sterile, RNASE, DNASH, rack, 08 tips, Biclogix 200l sterile, .
RNASE, DNASE, rack, 95 tips, Biologix; 1000 ul sterile, RNASE,
DNASE, rack, 100 tips, Blologix; 0.5-10uL pipette, Blologix; 10-
1001, pipstte, Biologix: 20-200uL pipstte, Bicloghs 100-1000uL
pipette, Biologix

R2

bbl

Sidm Milk for microbiology ,Millipore Y0188, 600g/btl

4,.360.00

. nobid

no bid

8,517.00

CERTIFT
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Canvass no, PC-R2-06-150 Date: 20 June 2022
Chemline
Item Noveaulab Asia I Diamed Bslman
Uit Cost : Bclentifie
No. Cory, u‘i""“’“ tion Enterprise Labvoratoriea
QTY | UNIT i
Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Supplies |
23 1 bl |Sodium Acetate, 500g/btl 7E0.00 0o bid | 1o bid
Offer: ' ' |
Bodlum Acetats, BOOg/bt]l, TPC 33105 2
Sodiurn Acetate, B00g/btl, Loba Chemie 1,143.00
24 2 btl |Sedium Chloride, BOOg/MHEL 2,000.00 1,805.00
Offer:
1st Base BIQ-1110-1k¢ Scdium Chlorids, Biotechnology Grade, 1kg 4,492.,00
1st Base BIO-1110-600g Sodium Chiloride, Biotechniology Grade, 3 380.00
500¢ AR
Sodiurn Chloride, 500/t TPC 33127 750.00
Sodiumn Chloride, 1kg/bil, Labscan |
2B 2 L Sodium Hypochlorite Technical grade B00.00 "no bid 21310116, no bid no bid
28 1 Ml |Sedium phosphate (moncbasic), BOOZ/HE 1,800.00 1o bid | no bid
Offer:
Sodium phosphate (moenobasie), BO0g/btl) TPC 33133
Sodium phoephate (monohasic), B00g/MHLl] Loba Chemie 1,908.00
R_Y 1 bl |Sodium phosphate (tribasic), BOOg/ bt i 1,200.060 1o bid |no bid o bid no bid
i I
Doocumentary Requiremants:
Mayor's/ Business Permit ‘eomply comply comply comply
PhilGEFS Registration Clagsification Platinumm FPlatinum Red Platinum
Fhil@EPS Hegistration NJumber 195829 |80821 9448 2291
Omunibus Sworn Statement (for ABCs above Php 60,000)
i
|
Mode of Procuremsent: NP - Small Value Procurement i
PhilGEPS Referance No.: 8682370
Canvassad by: wmagus i
RECOMMENDATION: X .
~ For items 1,13,21,24, Belman Luboratories 15 the lowest caloulated and responsive bidder,
For ttems 2,17,16,28, for review of technival speoiﬁc‘a-tions and approved budget for the items.
|
For items 3,18, Diamed Enterprise ic tha respcmsivje biddar.
For jtems 4,5,8,11,20,253,26, Chemline Scientific Gé:x'puration is the Jowast calculated and respensive bidder,
For ltems 7,9,10,27, for re-canvass, :
Yor items B8,12,26, Chemline Sclentific Corporation is the sole and responsive bidder.
]
12"01'| item 14, Noveaulab Asia Corp. is the sole and responsive bidder.
For iterns 15,18, Diamed Enterprise is the sole and responsive bidder.
Committee on Bids and Awards:
4—%-»(1&,,
JOEL M, ADDA’
® |
o pu—— WAt nALS
DRIA Q. R GUERA i A I‘El 8.M. ABALOS
Mermber
ICKLAY ARIS INALDO
ber
Action of H;Ze(l’mnyﬂn( Entity: , OVED . SRTY
L f i
CORAZON L, ABANSI [ jUA
Chancellor [ B L CERTIFIER GRUE COPY
: N ) OF THE ORIGINAL
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