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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF

VARIOUS IT EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES

Canvass no. PC22.06.157 (RFQ No. 2565)

Date: 13 June, 2022

ITEM

No. | @Y

UNIT

PARTICULARS

UNIT PRICE

TAIPAN
MARKETING

COMPUTER

NIU.COM

SHoOP

ENTERPRISES

HEXACOM

un

16-Port Gigabit Switch

ype: Gigabit Desktop/Rackmount
Switch

LAN Ports: at least 16x R145
10/100/1000Mbps (Auto
Negotiation/Auto MDI/MDIX)
Switching Capacity: at least 32Gbps
Packet Forwarding Rate: at least
23.8Mpps

MAC Address Table: at least 8K
Power Supply: at least 100-240v AC,
auto-voltage, 50/60Hz

Jumbo Frames: at least 10KB
Network Media: at least 10BASE-T:
UTP cat. 3, 4, 5 cable (upto 100m),
100BASE-TX/1000BASE-T: UTP cat.
5, 5e or better (upto 100m)
Transfer Method: at least Store and Forward
Chassis: at least Metal with mounting
features and fanless design

Other: at least 12 months
manufacturers warranty

5,500.00

OFFER:

16-Port Gigabit Switch, TPLink TL-SG1016 DE

5,500.00

16-Port Gigabit Switch, TPLink SG 1016, 16 Port
Switch, Gigabit

5,450.00

un

2000 VA (1200W) UPS with 6x
universal outlets

High quality, Line-Interactive UPS
with MPC, built-in AVR, universal
outlets, LED display/indicators,
audible alarm

at least 2000VA / 1200w

at least six (6) universal outlets

at least Microprocessor based digital
control

at least LED display or LCD display
at least with buck and boost voltage
stabilizer

at least with wide input voltage range
(165-295V AC), frequency autosensing
at least with wide output voltage
range (200-240V AC), frequency
auto-sensing

at least 2x 12V/9Ah, sealed,
maintenance-free. 6-8Hr recharge
at least with built-in safety fuse or
circuit breaker, over charge, over
discharge, surge, short, overload
protections

8,500.00

OFFER:

2000 VA (1200W) UPS, AWP/AID 2000,
2000VA/1200W, Battery 2 x 12V /9AH, 6 Socket

7,500.00

8,295.00

2000 VA (1200W) UPS, Kstar 2000VA

6,200.00

pc

6 outlet power extension cord with individual switch
Surge protector powerstrips w/ individual switch 6
outlet 2 meters,350] surge protection
component,2200W max load for overload circuit
protection (pls. see attached for add'| specs)

780.00

NO BID

OFFER:

6 outlet power extension cord with individual switch,
Panther 0818, individual Switch, 6 Outlet, 1,75
meters

995.00

6 outlet power extension cord with individual switch,
Omni

2,300.00

Zdeb

JU

N 29 2027
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Eanvass no. PC22.06.157 (RFQ No. 2565)

Date: 30 June, 2022

ITEM

no. | Y

UNIT

PARTICULARS

UNIT PRICE

TAIPAN
MARKETING

NIU.COM
COMPUTER
SHoOP

HEXACOM
ENTERPRISES

un

AX3000 WIFI 6 Dual-band Router

Type: AX3000 Dual Band, Gigabit,

2T2R MU-MIMO, WiFi 6, OFDMA

LAN Ports: at least 4x RJ45
10/100/1000Mbps

WAN Ports: at least 1x R145
10/100/1000Mbps

WiFi: at least 802.11 b/g/n/a/ac/ax
Antennas: at least 4x external omnidirectional, beam-
forming, high-power FEM

Power Supply: at least 12V 2A, autovoltage
Signal Rates: at least upto 2402Mbps
(5Ghz), upto 574Mbps (2.4Ghz)

Firewall / Security: at least DoS, SPI,

IP and MAC address binding, ALG

Wireless Security: at least WPA2

(PSK and enterprise)

WAN Types: at least Dynamic IP,

Static IP, PPPoE, PPTP, L2TP

Management: at least with webbased Access Control,
Local Management,

8,000.00

OFFER:

AX3000 WIFI 6 Dual-band Router, TPLink Archer
AX72, Dual Band AX5400

7,500.00

7,100.00

AX3000 WiFI 6 Dual-band Router, TPLink AX3000

AX3000 WIFI 6 Dual-band Router, TPLink AX55,
AX3000

7,850.00

box

Cat5E UTP Lan Cable, full copper CAT5e (200MHz), 4-
Pair, U/UTP-unshielded, Riser-CMR, Premise Horizontal
cable, 24 AWG solid bare copper conductors, polyolefin
insulation, ripcord, PVC jacket (pls. see attached for
add'l specs)

7,200.00

NO BID

OFFER:

Cat5E UTP Lan Cable, Belden

6 100

pc

RJ-45 Network LAN Ethernet Connector PASS THROUGH
RJ45,8P8C RJ-45 Connector (8-pin
connector),Compatible with all CAT and UDP

cable, Through Hole PCB mount socket (pls. see
attached for add'l specs)

5.00

NO BID

7,200.00

5.00

OFFER:

RJ-45 Network LAN Ethernet Connector PASS
THROUGH RJ45, Tyco, 100's

pc

Universal socket adapter for UPS/iMac 10A, 250V

75.00

NO BID

box

UTP LAN Cable Cat5e AWG24 8C
305m

- Paired - DataTwist Category 5e
200Mhz

- 4 Pair UTP, color-coded standard
- 8C, 24 AWG Solid Bare Copper,
Polyolefin Insulation, PVC Jacket,
with Rip Cord

- Sequential Markings at two (2) foot
Intervals

- 305m/1000ft per box

- Gray color

6,800.00

NO BID

OFFER:

UTP LAN Cable Cat5e AWG24 8C 305m, Belden

6,595.00

UTP LAN Cable Cat5e AWG24 8C 305m, Dlink

Eininrs

-rux Nothing Follows mux-

Delivery Terms:

NOT APPLICABLE

30CD

30CD

Documentary Requirements:

Mayor's/Business Permit

COMPLIED

COMPLIED

COMPLIED

Philgeps Registration Number

29874

84481

52877

Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement

COMPLIED

COMPLIED

COMPLIED

Mode of Procurement:
PhilGEPS Ref. No.:

Canvassed by:

/deb

NP - Small Value Procurement
8727688 -

~

Bagsic
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RECOMMENDATION:

For Items 1, 5 & 6, NIU.COM COMPUTER SHOP is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
For Items 2, 4, 7 & 8, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
For Item 3, no award, for review of technical specifications and approved budget for the contract.

Committee on Bids and Awards:
—

j £ 2 '__VCW.W/F’
JOEL M.
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air

Member
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Member Nembar
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Action of the Head of the Procuring Entity: APPBOY ey
CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor
. in (.
[ i -.!:-"i i
b lisad TIWRT ATEICE (P D)
i i "_'_'.Ulo
JUN 28 2072
it page 3 of 3



