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05 July, 2022

RONALYN BILLONES

Store Manager
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Republic of the Philippines

UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

SAVERS ELECTRONIC WORLD INC.
2/F Metro Pines Inn, Otek St., cor, Rizal Park Rd. 1, Bagulo City
Tel, No:074.619,1446

Dear Ms. BILLONES:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the Supply and Delivery of Various Appliances for the University under
RFQ No. 2571 dated 08 June, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to Forty Nine Thousand
Pesos (Php 49,000.00) as follows:

QUANTITY UNIT PARTICULARS UNIT COST AMOUNT
Coffee Maker Automatic Drip Coffee, Hnabishi

2 un HCMA5GCM 1,500.00 3,000.00

1 un Digital Microwave Oven, Hanabishi HMO-23MSSD 6,000.00 6,000.00

4 i z\éact:r Dispenser, Hanabishi HFSWD-1900BL, No Safety 10,000.00 40,000.00

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of

Award.

Very truly yours,

CORAZON L. ABANSI

Chancell%{

Conforme:

Rona@mnes

(Name of Rybr{esentative of Bidder)

Date: July 11,2022

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/inbox/FMfcgzGpGnNsDZBKPZTQrcBWRrjGsnfj?projector=1&messagePartid=0.1
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF
VARIOUS APPLIANCES

Canvass no. PC22.06.165 (RFQ No. 2571) Date: 17 June, 2022

ITEM
NO.

QTY

UNIT

Tss COSTSAVER'S SAVERS

PARTICULARS UNIT PRICE SUPERMARKET | ELECTRONIC
CORFORATION INC. WORLD INC.

un

2 in 1 Air purifier with dehumidifier 7000 high density
plasmacluster ions and fan purification,auto
dehumidifying function,3-step filtering system 180
degrees airflow movement,mold proof virus inactivated

22,500.00 NO BID

OFFER:

2 in 1 Air purifier with dehumidifier, Sharp DW-E16FP

w 20,150.00

un

Coffee Maker Automatic Drip Coffee, 8 to 10 cups
Simple & Easy to Use 1000 Watts Reusable Filter
Basket with Handle Thermo-glass Carafe Dual Water 1,800.00
Level Indicator Keep Warm Heater Plate ON & OFF
Switch w/ Light Indicator

OFFER:

Coffee Maker Automatic Drip Coffee, Imarflex
ICM700S, 700W 1,705.00 1,700.00

Coffee Maker Automatic Drip Coffee, Hnabishi
HCM45GCM

un

Digital Microwave Oven 23 Liters,10 power

levels, Defrost setting,Glass turntable,Pull out handle b 000

OFFER:

Digital Microwave Oven, American Home AMWG- "~

GC23LS 6,385.00

Digital Microwave Oven, GE JEI2560SPSS, 25L . 6,400.00

Digital Microwave Oven, Hanabishi HMO-23MSSD

un

Refrigerator-Smart Inverter Compressor,Semi-
Autodefrost,Tempered Glass Shelves,Single Door,5.0 !
cu. Ft,525 x 1135 x 555 mm,Platinum Silver,160L 19,200.00 NO BID
(Freezer 26L Ref!,134L) 169L Gross (pls. see attached
for additional specs)

OFFER:

Refrigerator, LGC Ref GR-Y201SLZB, 6 cu.ft. 16,150.00

pc

water container 5 gallon round 230.00 1169.00 NO BID NO BID

un

Water Dispenser Free standing water dispenser Bottom
loading Hot, normal and cold Compressor type cooling
Hot water safety lock 585W | (L-12.25" W-12.5" H-
41") - :

12,500.00 10,640.00

% : R o
OFFER: r Sl

Water Dispenser, Hanabishi HFSWD-1900BL, No | .+~
Safety Lock A3 U 10,750.00

-uxx Nothing Follows xxx-

Delivery Terms: 30CD " [30cD 30CD

Documentary Requirements:

Mayor's/Business Permit NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED COMPLIED

Philgeps Registration Number 279139 71663 153576

Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED COMPLIED

Mode of Procurement:
PhilGEPS Ref. No.:

Canvassed by:

/dcb

NP - Small Value Procurement
8740677 .
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RECOMMENDATION:

For Items 1 & 4, COSTSAVER'S SUPERMARKET INC. is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
For Items 2, 3 & 6, SAVERS ELECTRONIC WORLD INC. is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder.
For Item 5, no award, for recanvass.

Committee on Bids and Awards:
=

_ . a—
El.5 M. ADDAWE . q/ LORIA Q. RQDRIGUERA
C(,VL. [Py 4~ A/\. A Vice Chaire/

CECILIA FE S. ABALOS
Member

ICKLAY ) ARIS A. ALDO
Memb, Member

Actio%f the Procuring Entity: APPROV

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor
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