Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph
Notice of Award
July Ei 2022
Peter Ang
Proprietor
LASER MARKETING

#26A Mabini Street, Baguio City

074-442-5854

Dear Mr. Ang:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the supply and delivery of JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR
3RD AND 4TH QRTR for the University of the Philippines Baguio under RFQ number 2349 is hereby
awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to Eleven Thousand Two Hundred Eight Pesos Only. (Php
11,208.00)

You ate hereby required to enter into the contract within the (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice
of Award.

Very truly yours,

orats

Dr. CORAZON L. ABANSI

UP Baguio, Chancello%q{

Date: o7 /iq- ST
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION ON PRICE FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR THE UNIVERSITY
Clﬂnvass no, PC 22.07.197 : JULY 7 ,2022
Ttem PARTICULARS ABC PERITEM |  Laser Markeing TSB BAZAAR Baguio Prince
No. Enterprises
QTY [ UNIT
1| 24 mal  [ALCOHOL, ethyl, 68%-72%, 1 Gallen P 450.00 450.00
2] 38 btl |ALCOHOL, isopropyl, 68%- 72%, scoml (-5ml) P 1
3| 45 gal JALCOHOL, iscpropyl, 68%-72%, scented, 3,785 liters 4
4] 6 pc_ IBath towels bl
5] 37 gal |Bleach, liguid lemon scent P
5] 93 pc_ |BREOOM, soft (tambo) b
7] 114 | pe |BROOM, Stick (Ting-ting), usable length: y6omm min | P
sl ar bil CLEANER, TOILET BOWL AND URINAL, 9ooml- B
1000mi cap
9] 35. oo |CLEANSER, scouring powder P
CLEANSER, scouring powder, 500£
10 71 pe  |DETERGENT BAR, 140 grams as packed P
DETERGENT BAR, 125 ¢
it| 128 | pck |DETERGENT FOWDER, all purpose, 1kg r
12 11 cn__|Di-t and Stain Remover d
i3] 65 pe | Dishwashing Scrub with Foam i
T4 23 pc__|Door mat, braided P
15| 69 cn f:.nRNu URE CLEANER, acrosol type, 3o0oml min per P
16| 97 pr__ [Gloves knitted with rubber padding (palm side) P
offer:
Gloves knitted with rubber padding (palm side), Huel
Rubber Medium
17] 49 pr__|Gloves, ritbber, large P
18 36 cn  (INSECTICIDE, aerosol type, net content: 600ml min r
19( 11 cn _|Insecticide, waterbase spray, 6coml P
ol 2 - gal Liguid dye wax, red, easy dry, stainfree after dry, r
odorless
Licuid dye wax, red, easy dry, stainfree after dry,
odorless, "1000 m]" P 490.00
21] 64 btl JLIQUID HAND SOAP, soomL bid 150.00 || P 148.00 P 135.00
22 16 | box |Mask, Face magk P 150.00 0L P 120.00
offer:
Mask, Face mask, "Indoplas” P 155.00 -
23F 15 box |Mask, Surgical Disposable Face mask, 3-ply, Earloop I d 150.00 P 120.00
offer:
']I\vIa.sk, Su::'glcal Disposable Face mask, 3-ply, Barloop, P 126,00
Indoplas .
Mop, magic mop, adjustable handle, stainles
g4y 6 pe steal+PP+PVA, PVA sponge mop head, 120x28 cm F 25000 NO BID
offer: .
Mop, magic mop, adjustable handle, stainles
steel+PP+PVA, PVA spenge mop head, 120x28 cm,
"Alaminum"
Mop, magic mop, adjustable handle, stainles
steel+PP+FPVA, PVA sponge mop head, 120x28 cm, .
"8pin Mop Heavy Duty” P 1,495.00
25 4 pc  |MOPHANDLE, heavy duty, plastic, snap-on type P 300.00 || P 425.00 NO BID
offer:
MGPHANDLE, heavy duty, plastic, snap-on type,
' *Aluminum / Stainless"
26 2 btl  |Muriatic acid/Hydrochloric acid, 500ml P 150.00 | P 85.00
271 29 | bun |RAGS, all cotton, 32 pieces per kilogram min . P 8s00 | P 135.00
281 45 pck  |SCOURING PAD, 5 pieces per pack P 115.00
offer:
SCOURING PAD, 3 pieces per pack P 160.00
29 32 pc_ |Serubbing pad without foam, heavy duty jid 7000 || B 82.00 f
30 - 83 pc__[Soap, bath, antibacterial, gogms P 40.00 || P 35.00
31| 55 btl |Soap, Dishwashing pel, antibacterial, 250ml P 80.c0
offer:
Soap, Dishwashing liquid, antibacterial 1 liter P 110.00
32] 35 btl [Spap, Dishwashing gel, 1liter P 90.00
offer:
Soap, Dishwashing liquid, 1 liter P 116.00 ]
33| 46 pe  |Tile brush, for laundry sink ! P 70.00 NO BID . P 70.00
Ml T2 pc_ |Toilet deodorant cake P 65.00 NO BID P 65.00
) offer:
Toiiet deodorant cake, sograms
. Toeilet deodorant cake, 100grams :
35] 25 bun ' |Trash bag, 37" x 40", black, 100cs./bundle jid 750.00
| offer:
| Trash bag, Medium 25's P 78.00
36| 42 | pck |Trash bag, 37" x 40", black, 1opes./pack P 00.00
oifer: —
Trash bag, Medium 25's P 78.00 _
DOCUMENTARY REQUIREMENTS: ) .
Mayor's/ Business Permit: comply coinply comply
PhilGEPS Registration Number: 263718 52066 46383 )
Mode of Procutement:  Shopping (B) 00?‘{
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N . PhilGEPS Registration no.: 8338512

ACTION TAKEN:
For items no. [, 3, 11, 22 and 23, LASER MARKETING is the lowest calculated and most tesponsive bidder.

Foritems no. 2, 4,5, 6, 7, 8, 9,12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 21, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35 and 36, TSB‘ BAZAAR is the lowest caleulated and most
responsive bidder.

Fot item no. 10, LASER MARKETING is the most responsive bidder.
For item no. 20, NO AWARD for review of approved budget for the line item.

Commjittee on PBids and Awards:
—

OEL K ADDAWE

Chair, Bids and Awards Committee
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Member
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ACTION OF THE HEAD OF THE PROCURIMNG ENTITY: )
L APPROVED
Dr. CORAZON L. ABANSI
UP Baguio, Chancellor
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