Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888 /442-3484
www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

July 75 2022
Peter Ang

Proprietor

LASER MARKETING
#26A Mabini Street, Baguio City

074-442-5854

Dear Mr. Ang:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the supply and delivery of INK CONSUMABLES for the
University of the Philippines Baguio under RFQ number 2349 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price
equivalent to Twenty Four Thousand Five Hundred Thirty Pesos Only. (Php 24,530.00)

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within the (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice
of Award.

Very truly yours,

%M,\

Dt. CORAZON L. ABANSI

UP Baguio, Chancellw

A3

2 abini Street, Baguio A

Tel Nos. 442-5854; 446-0117
Iolefay 4431788

(Name of Representative of Bidder)

Date: ©7 /)21y /22

sey



At

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION ON PRICE FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY or

| INK CONSUMABLES FOR THE UNIVERSITY

3
Canvass no. PC 22.07.196 ! JULY 7, 2022
Item PARTICULARS ABCTERITEM|  TSBBAZAAR LASER BAGUIO PRINCE
No. MARKETING ENTERFRISES
QTY | UNIT ;
1l 1 crt |Brother MFC L3770 CDW, Drum Cart - 263CL ¥ 1,500.00 7,206.40 11,650.00 NO BID
2 2 crt |Brother MFC L3770 CDW, Toner TN-263, Black P 1,600.00 3,579-60 3,800.00 NO BID
3| 2 crt |Brother MFC L3770 CDW, Toner TN-263, Cyan P 3,600.00 3.579.60 3,800.00 NOQ BID
4] 2 crt |Brother MFC L3770 CDW, Toner TN-263, Magenta * 1,600.00 3,579.60 3,800.00 NO BID
5 z ert |Brother MFC L3770 CDW, Toner TN-263, Yellow P 1,600.00 3,579.60 3,800.00 NO BID
6l 4 crt |[INK CART, EPSON C13TA64200 (16642}, Cyan P 300.00 290.00 285.00
T 6 cri |INK CART, EPSON C13T664300 (T6643), Magenta P 300.00 200,00 285.00
8 = ot |INK CART, EPSON C13T564400 (TE644), Yallow 2 300.00 290.60 285.00
o[ 10 btl |INK CART, EPSON T673, Black P 550.00 540.54 (08 NO BID
19 6 bil {INK CART, EPSON T673, Cyan P 550.00 £40.54 NO BID
1] 4 bil |INK CART, EPSON T673, Magenta P 550.00 540.54 NO BID
12§ . 4 bil [INK CART, EPSDN T673, Yellow P 550.00 540.54 fo NO BID
138 1 ert |INK CART, HP CF237A, Black P 11,100.00 NO BID NO BIP NO BID
14| 2 crt {INK CART, HP CNE92AA, (HP704), Black b4 500.00 735.00 575.00 675.00
15] 1 crt |INK CART, HP CNG93AA, (HP704), Tri-color r 500.00 .00 575.00 675.00
16 et |Ink Cartridge for Brother MFC-J23300W, LC3617-Black P 5,000.00 [} 760,00 NO BID
17 4 et [Ink Cartzjdge for Brother MFC-J2330DW, LC3617-Cyan ? 2,000.00 625.00 NO BID
18 4 crt  |Ink Cartridge for Br_other MFC-J2330DW, L.C2617-Magenta || P 2,000.00 f25.00 NO BID
19 4 et (ink Canﬁdge for Brother MFC-J23300W, LC3617-Yellow P 2,000.00 625.00 NO BID
R Bl |Ink Cartridge, MUHS4AE (HPGT52), Cyan P 315.00 324.80 310.00
21 1 bl |ink Carridge, MOHSSAE {HPGT52}), Magenta P 315.00 324.80 310.00
72 1 bl |ink Cartridge, MOHS6AE (HPGT52), Yellow P 315.00 324.80 310.00
23] 1 bil |Ink Cartridge, MOH57AA (HPGTS1]}, Black P 315.00 324.80 310.0¢
24| 19 bl |Ink, Epson L3150, 003, Black P 280.00 273.76 270.00
25| § Wl |Ink, Epson, 001, Black id 500.00 80,2 .00
26 5 ttl |Ink, Epson, 001, Cyan P 500.00 2 320.00 320.00 |
27| § bl [Ink, Epson, 0, Magenta P 500,00 320.00 320.00
28| 5 btl |Ink, Epson, 001, Yellow P 500.00 ; 20.00 20.00
29| 13 btl |Ink, Epson, L3150, 003, Cyan P 205.00 200.00 286.00 Féfagiola
39 13 btl |Ink, Epsén, L3150, 003, Magenta P 295.00 240,00 286.00 813
31 19 bt] |Ink, Epson, L3150, 003, Yellow by 295.00 260.00 286.00
3z] 2 crt  |[TONER CART, HP CE285A (HP85A), Black P 3:500.00 000.00 4,000.00 YA
33| 1 el |TONER CART, HP Q2612A, Black P 4,600.00 % : 4,900.00 3,200.00
34| 1 crl  {Toner Cartridge for Brother Printer TN-2260 P 2,300.00 2,200.00 3,375.00
35| 10 crt  §Toner Cartridge for Brother Printer TN-2360 P 2,300.00 2,200.00 NO BID
36) 1 crl_|Toner Cartridge, HP GF217A (HP17A) Black Laser Jet P 3,800.00 NO BID 600.00 ]
37 8 crt  |Toner Carlridge, HP CF280A, LaserJet Pro M401/M425 P 6,200.00 ? 6,300.00 00.00
38 1 crt | Toner Carlridge, HP CF281A (HPB1A) Black LaserJet P 10,700.00 NO BID 3 NGO BID
39 1 crt  |Toner Cefurtridga, HP CF400A {HP201A} Black LaserJet P 4,500.00 NOBID 4,900.00
401 1 crt  |Toner Carlridge, HP CF401A (HP201A} Cyan b 4,500.00 NO BID 4,500.00 35
41 1 crt_|Toner Carlridge, HP CF402A (HP201A! Yellow P 4,500.00 NO BID 4,500.00 FROLIE
42| 1 crt  |Toner Cariridge, HP CF4C3A (HP201A} Magenla P 4,500-00 NO BID 00,00
43| 2 btl | Toner carridge W1103A, Black P 950.00 NO BID NO BID
DOCUMENTARY REQUIREMENTS:
Mayor'sA Business Permit: cotnplied complied complied
PhilGERS Registration: complied comgplicd complied

Mode of Pracurement:

| Shopping (B)

PhilGEPS Registration no.: 8671823

ACTION TAKEN:

For items no. 16, 17, 18, 19, 26, 27, 28, 33, 34, 35 AND 37, TSB BAZAAR has the lowest calculated bid and is the responsive biddet.

For items no. 9, 10, L1, 12, 38 AND 43, LASER MARKETING has the lowest calculated bid and is the responsive bidder, /

Far items no. 6, 7:. 8,120,121, 22,23, 24, 25, 29, 30,31, 32, 36, 39, 40, 41 and 42, BAGUIO PRINCE ENTERPRISES has the lowsast caleulated kid and is the

responsive bidder,

For items no. 1, 1, 3, 4,5, 14 and 15, NO AWARD, for review of the approved budget for the line item.

For item no, 13, MO BED, for recanvass.
I

Committee on Bids and, ﬂw&nﬁ:
- .

EL M. ADDAWE
Chair, Bids and Awards Commit|

ACTION OF THE HEAD OF THE PRQK

i 5
:Dr. CORAZON L. ABANSI
i UP Baguio, Chancellor
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