Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

July | 2022

Peter Ang

Proprietor
LASER MARKETING

#26A Mabini Street, Baguio City

074-442-5854

Dear Mrt. Ang:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the supply and delivery of Office Supplies for the University of
the Philippines Baguio under RFQ number 2349 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to
Nine Thousand Nine Hundred Eighty Three Pesos Only. (Php 9,983.00)

You ate hereby required to enter into the contract within the (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice
of Award.

Very truly yours,

P ULoes

Dr. CORAZON L. ABANSI

UP Baguio, Chancello/rg(

(Name of Reerescntative of Bidder)

Date: 677 /Q.q ]z

sy



BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguic
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION ON FRICE FOR THE SUFPLY AND DELIVERY OF
VARIOUS OFFICE SUPPLIES FOR THE UNIVERSITY

Canvass no, J'C 22.07.188 IULY 5,2022
) R THE STABLE
Item PARTICULARS ABC PER ITEM TSE BATAAR LASE EDUCATIONAL
Ne. MARKETING,
SUPPLY
OTY [ UNIT
1 6 pe - L;g:ﬁaggfgzﬁz:rpaﬂhle for HP Colar Laser Jat Pro 6,500.00 5,850:00 NO BID
2 2| pe %;l;z}ia;;rg:;?:’faume for HP Color Laser Jet Pro 6,500.00 ik 5.950.00 NO BID
3 al e ;%;Zrdiaggffin (;:emfl:llble for HP Color Laser Jet Pra 6,500.00 : 5,950.00 NO BID
4 2| pe '&%Erdaa;grgzs::paubla for HP Color Laser Jet Pro 6,500.00 5,050.00 NO BID
5 [| rol [Madpetic plasiic cover, gauge#d 2,100.00 2,485.00 2,650.00
3 1| rol |Plastic cover, yaugeds 2,100.00 2,100.00
7 20| pek EZﬁEEn(:wels' §00% virgin pulp, 175 sheets or pulls, 18mm 165.00 53.90 165.00
F] 50| box |16-color crayons 75.00 44.68 48.00
5 50| pc |Ad ceriflcate holder 65.00 41.24
10 20| pck |Ad consiruction paper, assorted colors, 160 gsm 60.00
offer:
9x12 size construction paper, assored colors, 80 gsm 16.00
11 2| box_|ballpeint gel pen, 0.3mm, black 750.00 ]
offer- *
peint gel pen, 0.3mm, black,"PILOT C3" 727.20
12 2| box [ballpoidl gel pen, 0.3mm, blue 750.00
cffer: -
ballpoind get pen, 0.3mm, blue, "FILOT C3° - 727.20
13 1] box ballgulnlnhei pen, 0.3mm, pink 750.60 417.00
14 2| box_|[ballpolnt g& pen, 0.3mm, rad 750.00
offer;
ballpoint gel pen, 0.3mm, red, "PILOT C3" 737.20
15 2| mn  [Legal size folder, brown 700.00 500.00 414.00
offer
L egal size folder, brown 100 pes
16 2| mm__|Letter size folder, brown 500.00 400.00 402,00
offer;
Letler size folder, brown 100 pes
17 10} pc jLiguid glue, 200mL 150.00
oifer; .
Liguid gluse, "240g™
13 10| rol fscotch tape, clear, 1" size ) 25.00
15 10 pek [8.5"x 13" beard paper {specialty paper), white, 200 gsm 90.00
20 6] rm [8.5" x 13" bond paper, B0 gsm 450.00
21 1] mm [A3 paper, 80 gsm 650,00
22 10{ pck |Ad board paper (specially paper}, white, 200 gsm 7580
23 6| 1 |Ad bond paper, 80 gsm . 400.00
24 5} pck [Ad photo paper, glussy, 15G gsm 125.00
offer:
A4 phole paper, glessy, 180 gsm {20's)
25 2| bl |in¥ balite for Epson L1455 printer, black, 140mL 550.00
offer: :
ink bottle for Epson L4155 # 001
26| 3| bl _|ink bottle for Epson L1455 printer, cyan. 70mL 300.00
offer:
Ink botila for Epson L4155 # 001
27 3| bt fink boitle for Epson L1455 arinter, magenta, 70mL 300.00
offer:
ink bottle for Epson L4165 # 001
28 3| bil [ink bottle for Epson L1455 printer, yeliow, 70mL 300.00
cffer: .
ink bollle for Epson L4155 # 001 313.20
DOCUMENTARY REQUIREMENTS:
Mayor's/ Business Permit: complied complied complisd
PhilGEPS Registration: complied complied complisd

Moade of Procurement: Shopping (E
Phi{GEPS Registration no.: 8671823

ACTION TAKEN:
For ftems ho. 1, 2, 3, 4, 6, and 24, TSB BAZAAR has the lowest caleulated bid and is the responsive bidder.

Fer items no. 10, L1, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 20, 21, 23, 26, 27, and 28, LASER MARKETING has the lowsst caleulated bid and is the responsive bidder.

For itemns no, 7, 8, 9, 17, 18, 19, 22 and 25, THE §T; WY LY has the lowest caleulated bid and is the responsive bidder.

For item no. 5, NO AWARD, for review of the approved budget for the line item.

Committee on Bids and Atwards:
—
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EL M. ADDAWE
Chair, Bids and Awards Committee
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JIERA CECILIA FES. ABALOS
Mgmber -~
ICKLAY ARIS EGINALDO
Membert -0 -RTY

ACTION OF THE HEAD OF ENTITY: . . - . .; -
Dr. CORAZON L. ABANSI ‘ Jt o 2[}22 lﬁ
UP Baguio, Chancellor S ’ .
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