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Repubilic of the Philippines

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

04 August, 2022

RONALYN BILLONES

Store Manager

SAVERS ELECTRONIC WORLD INC.

2/F Metro Pines Inn, Otek St., cor. Rizal Park Rd. 1, Baguio City
Tel. N0:074.619.1446

Dear Ms. BILLONES:

UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the Supply and Delivery of Various Appliances for College of Science
under RFQ No. 2633 dated 07 July, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to Forty Four

Thousand Three Hundred Seventy Five Pesos (Php 44,375.00) as follows:

QUANTITY UNIT PARTICULARS UNIT COST AMOUNT
2 un Industrial Fan, Hanabishi H1SF24 7,400.00 14,800.00
1 un Stand Fan, Hanabishi CA-16SF 1,580.00 1,580.00
4 un Tower Fan, Hanabishi HTOWF-14005S 4,725.00 18,900.00
1 pc Water Dispenser, Toshiba RWF-W1664TF (W) 9,095.00 9,095.00

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of

Award.

very truly yours,

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor

Conforme:

Rona@?gi%o/_nes

(Name of Rexf'e{entative of Bidder)

Date: August 10,2022
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF
VARIOUS APPLIANCES

Canvass no. PC22.07.205 (RFQ No. 2633) Date: 25 July, 2022
—— ; 156 COSTSAVER'S SAVERS
NO QTY | UNIT PARTICULARS UNIT PRICE CORPORATION | SUPERMARKET | ELECTRONIC
: : INC. WORLD INC.

Industrial Fan 280 watts power 3 fan speed control w/
oscillation 330m per minute air volume with built-in
thermal fuse adjustable height up to 183cm 30inch
blade size

OFFER:
Industrial Fan, Asahl PF-2601 (26 inches Blade) 9,500.00
Industrial Fan, Hanabishi H1SF24

10,000.00 NO BID

Stand Fan Durable Transparent Blade Rotary switch
2 1 un  [Knob Oscillation Control Thermal Fuse Protected Motor 2,000.00 NO BID
Adjustable Stand Height LxWxH: 45cmx42.5cmx127cm

OFFER:
Stand Fan, 3D Fantasy 3,100.00
Stand Fan, Hanabishi CA-16SF &

Tower Fan 3-speed settings 60-minute timer powerful
3 4 un  (air delivery double air-intake design washable filter 5,000.00 NO BID NO BID
stable base double-insulated power cord

OFFER:
Tower Fan, Hanabishi HTOWF-1400SS

Water Dispenser: Type: Freestanding, Bottom loading,
Compressor Type Cooling, Hot water safety lock;

4 s
1 i Features: Hot Water, Normal, Cold Water; Wattage: 14,999.00 e

500W; Capacity: 19L; Input Voltage: 220V

OFFER:
Water Dispenser, Hanabishi HFSWD 1900BL 11,000.00
Water Dispenser, Toshiba RWF-W1664TF (W)

-uxx Nothing Follows mxx-

Delivery Terms: NOT APPLICABLE [30CD 30CD

Documentary Requirements:
Mayor's/Business Permit NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED COMPLIED
Philgeps Registration Number 279139 71663 153576
Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement NO SUBMISSION |[NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED

Mode of Procurement: NP - Small Value Procurement

PhilGEPS Ref. No.: 8818746 . -
Canvassed by: James B'F agsic
RECOMMENDATION:

s S S A v/
For Items 1, 2, 3 & 4, SAVERS ELECTRONIC WORLD INC. has the lowest calculated bid and is the responsive bidder.

Committes,on Bids and Awards:
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ORIA Q. RODRIGUERA *

(o n AN O

ce Chair
CECILIA FE S. ABALOS
Member
ARIS GINALDO
Membe
.(-
Action of the Head gf the Procuring Entity: Awemeep "“’?"’Tf?‘:f'; /
CORAZON L. ABANSI /

Chancellor
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