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Appendix 61

UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City, Benguet, CAR, PH
VAT Reg. TIN: 000-864-006-00007

PURCHASE ORDER

NSTP/ Pahinungod

Supplier HEXACOM ENTERPRISES P.O. No. : SPMO.RF.22.08.050 (2786)
Address Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City Date : 10 August, 2022
Contact#/Email 74.442.0198 Mode of Procurement : NP - Small Value Procurement
TIN : 941-765-748-000 PR No. : 16903; 17040

Gentlemen:

Please furnish this office the following articles subject to the terms and conditions contained herein:

Place of Delivery :

Supply & Property Management Office, UP Baguio

Delivery Term : FOB -Destination

Contact Person James Benedict E. Bagsic

Payment Term : 30 calendar days

Contact Address :

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City, PH

Date of Delivery : 30 calendar days

Contact #/Email :

074.442.3484 / spmo.upbaguio@up.edu.ph

upon receipt of Purchase Order

STOCK/
priapeRTV o0, | MOEE DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST AMOUNT
ALL IN ONE DESKTQP, Dell All-in-One, Intel Corei7
set [1255U, 16GB, 512GB, Windows 11Home, Office 1 74,115.00 74,115.00
2021, UPS 950VA
ALL IN ONE DESKTOP, Apple MEPH3PP/A, Apple
set |24", M1 Chip, 8 Core CPU & 8 Core GPU, 8GB, 256 1 99,800.00 99,800.00
GB + Office 2021 + UPS
LAPTOP, Dell 3910, Intl Core i7 12700, 16GB,
Set 1512GB SSD, Windows 11, Office 2021 2 69,200.00 139,000.00
MONOCHROME MULTIFUNCTION PRINTER, Fuji
ot 1552020 with Extra Set of Toner 1 LU0 102,000.00
-uxx Nothing Follows mxx-
Canvass no. PC22.07.215 (2637)
(Total Amount in Words): Four Hundred Fourteen Thousand Nine Hundred Fifteen Pesos 414,915.00

Conforme:

In case of failure to make the full delivery within the time specified above, a penalty of one-tenth (1/10) of one (1)
percent of every day of delay shall be imposed on the undelivered item/s.

Very truly yours,

—

o4

ROSEMARY M.ZUTIERREZ

Signature over Printed Name of Authorized Official

Date y]m})’?/

Signature over pfin,teicfnapbf_ﬂsupplier

Vice Chancellor for Academic Affairs A £
Designation o

Funds Cluster 03 20064 TP . oty ORS/BURS No. : 00 <20GY¢|-2022-(R-153
Funds Available & 1 — |Date of the ORS/BURS 0%-12-5p22
Ovanai e 8 gl
CE . DANGAWEN . | 611 zmlmount : {14,915
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Republic of the Philippines
UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600
Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.upb.edu.ph

Notice to Proceed

10 August, 2022

MALOU YUSONGCO

Sales Executive

HEXACOM ENTERPRISES

Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City
Tel. N0:74.442.0198

Dear Ms. YUSONGCO:

Notice is hereby given to HEXACOM ENTERPRISES, represented by its Sales Executive, MALOU YUSONGCO  that
work may commence on the Supply and Delivery of Various IT Equipment & Accessories for NSTP effective on
or calendar day/s after the receipt of this notice.

Upon receipt of this notice, you are responsible for performing the services under the terms and condition of the
agreement and in accordance with the implementation schedule.

Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by signing both copies in the space provided below.
Keep one copy and return the other to the University of the Philippines Baguio.

Very truly yours,

Vice Chancellor for Academ)j

W
ROSEMARY M. GUT RRW
airs

I acknowledge receipt of this Notice on: ‘
Name of Representative of Bidder: a4
Authorized Signature: ; |

/deb page 10f 1



Republic of the Philippines
=2 UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484

www.upb.edu.ph

Notice of Award

10 August, 2022

MALOU YUSONGCO

Sales Executive

HEXACOM ENTERPRISES

Stall No. 1 Adivay Bldg., 22 Bonifacio Street, Baguio City
Tel. N0:74.442.0198

Dear Ms. YUSONGCO:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the Supply and Delivery of Various IT Equipment & Accessories for
NSTP under RFQ No. 2637 dated 11 July, 2022 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price equivalent to Four
Hundred Fourteen Thousand Nine Hundred Fifteen Pesos (Php 414,915.00) as follows:

QUANTITY UNIT PARTICULARS UNIT COST AMOUNT
ALL IN ONE DESKTOP, Dell All-in-One, Intel Corei7
1 set 1255U, 16GB, 512GB, Windows 11Home, Office 2021, 74,115.00 74,115.00
UPS 950VA
ALL IN ONE DESKTOP, Apple MEPH3PP/A, Apple 24",
1 set M1 Chip, 8 Core CPU & 8 Core GPU, 8GB, 256 GB + 99,800.00 99,800.00

Office 2021 + UPS

LAPTOP, Dell 3910, Intl Core i7 12700, 16GB, 512GB
SSD, Windows 11, Office 2021

MONOCHROME MULTIFUNCTION PRINTER, Fuji
DSC2020 with Extra Set of Toner

2 set 69,500.00 139,000.00

1 lot 102,000.00 102,000.00

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice of
Award.

CORAZON L. ABANSI

Chancell%

Conforme:’s

(Name of Repre%‘#%?@ﬁéfﬁfdder)

Date: Qll '1 22

/deb page 1of 1
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\_/ BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE \_/

, . University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR FURNISHING & DELIVERY OF

VARIOUS IT EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES

Canvass no. PC22.07.215 (RFQ No. 2637) Date: 28 July, 2022

XWORKS SALES
& SERVICES,
INC.

ITEM INFOWORX, TAIPAN HEXACOM
No, | @TY | umIT PARFICULARS UNIT'PRICE INC. MARKETING | ENTERPRISES

1TB EXTERNAL PORTABLE SSD Capacity 1TB Up to
1 1 un |550MB/s read speeds Interface USB 3.1 Gen 2 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
Dimensions (L x W x H) 3,79" x 1.95" x 0.35"

OFFER:

External Portable SSD, Seagate STKG1000400 1TB
One Touch SSD V2 2.5SE USB3.1 Type-C Black

External Portable SSD, 1TB, Sandisk

2TB Portable Hard Drive USB 3.0 or higher Capacity:
2TB Dimensions Length:113.50mm Width: 76.00mm

OFFER:

2TB Portable Hard Drive, Western Digital
WDBYVG0020BBL-WESN 2TB My-Passport Blue

8,185.00

4,000.00 NO BID

3,825.00

2TB Portable Hard Drive, Verbatim 2TB External

2TB Portable Hard Drive, Seatgate 5,315.00

4-BAY NETWORK ATTACHED STORAGE; WITH FOUR
3 1 lot |PIECES 4TB INTERNAL HARD DRIVES *see full 80,000.00 NO BID NO BID
specifications attached

OFFER: ,
4-BAY NETWORK ATTACHED STORAGE, Qnap TS-664-

4G 4-Bay Desktop NAS, Seagate ST4000NE0OO1 4TB 75,905.00
Ironwaolf Pro 7200RPM 256MB HDD -

4-BAY NETWORK ATTACHED STORAGE, Synology
DS420] + Seagate 4TB Ironwolf

ALL IN ONE DESKTOP *High Performance Desktop
Profile, at least 4C/8T or 6C/6-12T, 4-8MB cache, up to
4 1 set |3-4 Ghz, at least 8-16 GB DDR4, at least 512GB SSD 84,000.00 NO BID
M.2 2280 PCle 3.0 NVMe, at least 23.8" LED IPS FullHD
1080p

74,300.00

OFFER:

ALL IN ONE DESKTOP, Dell 5410 AIO i7-1255U 16GB
512GB SSD 23.8" Iris Xe Win11 w/ H&S

70,665.00

ALL IN ONE DESKTOP, Acer Aspire TC 1750, i7-
12700, H610 Chipset, 16GB, 512GB PCI-E SSD, 1 TB 73,830.00
7200 RPM, Nvidia GeForce GT 730 with 2GB of DDR3 ‘ V4

ALL IN ONE DESKTOP, Dell All-in-One, Intel Corei7
1255U, 16GB, 512GB, Windows 11Home, Office
2021, UPS 950VA
ALL IN ONE DESKTOP *With Mac OS or High
Performance Desktop Profile, at least M1 8C with 16C
neural engine, at least 8GB unified memory, at least
256GB S5D, at least 23.5" 4.5 K Retina Display

OFFER:
ALL IN ONE DESKTOP, Apple MEPH3PP/A, Apple 24",

M1 Chip, 8 Core CPU & 8 Core GPU, 8GB, 256 GB +
Office 2021 + UPS

all-in-one ADF PSC printer -FUNCTION: print, scan,
copy -printer type: inkjet printer - PRINT SPEED: 17
(Mono) / 16.5 (Col) ipm ; FPOT: 6 (Mono) / 6.5 (Col)
seconds

OFFER:

all-in-one ADF PSC printer, Epson L6270 3 in 1
Wireless/Duplex with ADF Printer

all-in-one ADF PSC printer, HP 615

branded, high quality, CAT Se UTP LAN cable, AWG24
8C, gray color, 305M

OFFER:

5 1 set 100,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

16,800,00 NO BID NO BID

16,800.00

7 1 box 6,800.00 NO BID

UTP LAN Cable, Belden Cat 5e UTP Cable Grey Indoor

PN: 1583A 305 meters 6,405.00

UTP LAN Cable, DLink Cat5e UTP 25 AWG PVC Solid
Cable -305m/roll, Blue Color

Dongle 10 in 1 USB-C Hub; 100W Power Delivery; 4K
UHD Visual Feast; 5 Gbps Data Transfer; Input: 1x USB-
C Male, 1x USB-C Female; Output: 3x USB 3.0, 1x
HDMI Port, 1x VGA Port

5,700.00 5,580.00

5,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

OFFER: .
- Dongle 10 in 1 USB-C Hub, Ugreen 10-in-1

HDMI cable, 10M.=18 Gbps bandwidth support
3840*2160 @60Hz High Dynamic Range (HDR) video
dynamic QK@GOHZ gaming -Dolby True HD 7.1 audio
and 3D_resolution up to 1080P Full HD at 120 Hz

OFFER:

sdeb AUG U q Zﬂzz page 1of 3
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Canvass no. PC22.07.215 (RFQ No. 2637) \ )

\ Date: 28 July, 2022
N =~ WORKS SALES
X
LIEM INFOWORX, TAIPAN HEXACOM
No, | @Y | vy PARTICULARS UNET PRICE INC. MARKETING | ENTERPRISES | & SE&‘::'.CES'
HDMI Cable, Generic HDMI-HDMI 10meters 1080P 610.00
HDMI Cable, 10M, Ordinary 780.00
HDMI cable, 5M -Flat (Blue Black Head flat Cable): -
Two-cokor injection plug Douvle shielded cable body NO BI
B 1 2 | P [HoMt 14 varsign “Resohsiicry 1050PO0% - B reRE RRGED s
AWG:30AWG
OFFER:
HDMI cable, Generic HDMI-HDMI Smeters 1080P 255.00
Inkjet printer with scanner printer type: print, scan,
copy, fax with ADF Print method: On-demand inkjet NO'BI NO BID
. 1 un (Plezoelectric) Printer Language: ESC/P-R, ESC/P 14,293.00 ——
Raster
OFFER:
Inkjet printer with scanner, Epson L5290 4 in 1 w/
ADF Wireless Printer 1300
Inkjet printer with scanner, HP 615
LAPTOP *Sleek, Performance Laptop Profile with 16 GB
DDR4 RAM; 256 GB SSD plus 1TB HDD or 512 GB SSD NO BID
= 2 set M.2 PCle 3.0 NVMe; and licensed with at least Windows 85,000.00 NOBID
10
OFFER:
LAPTOP, Gigabyte GS-A5-K1-APH1130SB Ryzen 5 59.325.00
5600H 16GB 512GB SSD 15.6" RTX3060P 6GB W11 ) i o
LAPTOP, Dell 3910, Intl Core i7 12700, 16GB, 512GB ':;‘
SSD, Windows 11, Office 2021 /
MONOCHROME MULTIFUNCTION PRINTER *Std.
Function: Copy, Print, Scan *User Interface: Console
13 1 lot  |with LCD Touch Screen Full color panel control; with 110,000.00 NO BID
Duplex automatic document feeder *see full
specifications attached
OFFER:
MONOCHROME MULTIFUNCTION PRINTER, Epson
M15140 EcoTank Monochrome A3 Wi-Fi Duplex 3in 1 35,115.00
Ink Tank Printer
MONOCHROME MULTIFUNCTION PRINTER, Fuji oten0 003
DSC2020 with Extra Set of Toner 4
MONOCHROME MULTIFUNCTION PRINTER, Canon 103,500.00
Image Runner 2425, with metal Pedestal i
MONOCHROME MULTIFUNCTION PRINTER, FujiFilm
Apeos 2560 CPS AAmORA.L0
NETWORK ATTACHED STORAGE (NAS) CPU -CPU
Model: Realtek RTD1296 -CPU Architecture: 64-bit -
14 1 pc |CPU Frequency: 4-core 1.4 GHz Storage -Drive Bays: 4 21,600.00 NO BID NO BID
Compatible Drive Type: 3.5" SATA HDD ; 2.5" SATA
HDD ; 2.5" SATA SSD
OFFER:
NETWORK ATTACHED STORAGE (NAS), Synology 23.710.00
D2720+ 2-Bay 2GB NAS s
NETWORK ATTACHED STORAGE (NAS), Synology 23.950.00
DS420], 4 Bay ; )
NETWORK ATTACHED STORAGE (NAS), Synology 16,500.00
DS220, 2 Bay i
NETWORK ATTACHED STORAGE (NAS) HDD w/ agile
array -Capacity: 8TB -Dimensions: H x W x D: 26.11
15 4 pc |mm/1.028 in x 101.85 mm/4.01 in x 16,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
146.99mm/5.787in -Interface: SATA 6Gb/s - Max.
Sustained Transfer Rate OD (MB/s): 210MB/s
OFFER:
NETWORK ATTACHED STORAGE (NAS) HDD, Seagate . 0%*5%**
STBOOOVNOD43S, Ironwolf ?
16 | 10 | pc |power adapter for wireless router, DC 12V 2A, 5.5mm 300.00 NO BID NO BID 00:005, NO BID
17 1 pc |Solid State Drive (SSD),.256GB 6,000.00 NO BID NO BID
OFFER:
SSD, Kingston SKC600/256G 256GB SATA 2.5" 2.190.00
Internal SSD el
SSD, Seagate 256GB 3,300.00.,
SSD, WD 256GB 3,500.00
Switch/Hub, 16 Port Gigabit -Standards and Protocols:
IEEE 802.3i, IEEE 802.3u, 1EEE 802.3ab , IEEE 802.3x -
1812 | PC linterface: 16 10/100/1000Mbps RI45 Ports (Auto 2:800:90 ReEID No:me
Negotiation/Auto MDI/MDIX)
OFFER:
Switch/Hub, D-Link DGS-1016C 16-Port Gigabit 2.835.00
Ethernet Unmanaged Switch i
Switch/Hub, TPLink TL-SG1016D
Switch/Hub, 8 Port Gigabit -Standards and Protocols :
IEEE 802.3i/802.3u/ 802.3ab/802.3x -Interface : 8
9|2 | PS 110/100/1000Mbps RI45 Ports AUTO Negotiation/AUTO A800:00 HeRm
MDI/MDIX
OFFER:
Zdeb page 2of 3
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Canvass no. PC22.07.215 (RFQ No. 2637) | ) -\- ; Date: 28 July, 2022

; el
XWORKS SALES
MTEM INFOWORX, TAIPAN HEXACOM

o | @Y | unir PARTICULARS UNIT PRICE e wakkeciie | eariasoics | & selmces,

Switch/Hub, D-Link DGS-1008A 8-Port Gigabit Switch 1,205.00

Switch/Hub, TPLink TL-SG1008D 1,850.00

USB 3.0 hub, multi-function -USB 3.0 2.0 HUB 6 Ports 6

20 4 pe in 1 OTG USB to Micro B SD TF USB 3.0 High Speed 750.00 NO BID NO BID 980.00 NO BID

Charging Docking Station, -INTERFACE TYPE:
USB3.0*3/Micro-B/TF/SD

USB C to VGA adapter - USB C TO HDMI+VGA
(supporting the same display)+ 3.0HUBx3+
21 4 pc  [AUX3.5mm+ TF+ SD+ network card (Gigabit)+PD, 3,000.00 NO BID NO BID
Size: L123xW52xH19(mm), net length: 15cm - Input:
1xUSB-C Male ; 1xUSB-C Female

OFFER:
USB C to VGA adapter, Ugreen CM179 10in1 USB-C
to 3*USB 3.0 A+HDMI+VGA+RI45+SD/TF+3.5mm 2,270.00
Audio+PD #

USB C to VGA adapter, Ugreen

USB KVM switch, 2 port HDMI - INTERFACE TYPE: 2 in
1 Out HDMI KVM Switch - Transmission Direction: HDMI

221 1] P |3 IN to HDMI 1 OUT - Resolution: 4K@30Hz Resolution {  2-400-00 i e e
Transmission Up to 28M
OFFER:
USB KVM switch, Acasis
USB KVM switch, 2 port VGA - INTERFACE TYPE: VGA
23 1 pe Female/USB-B Female/USB2.0 A Female - Transmission 1,400.00 NG BiD NO BID WG BIB NO BID

Direction: VGA 2 IN 1 OUT - Resolution:
1920*1440@60Hz Resolution - Transmission Up to 28M

Wireless Router -Wi-Fi 6: IEEE 802.11ax/ac/n/a 5 GHz ;
IEEE 802.11ax/n/b/g 2.4 GHz -AX5400: 5 GHz; 4804
24 | 10 pc |Mbps (802.11ax, HE160) ; 2.4 GHz: 574 Mbps 7,200.00 NO BID
(802.11ax) -Processor: 1 GHz Dual-Core CPU -Ethernet
Ports: 1x Gigabit WAN Port

OFFER:
Wireless Router, Archer AX72 "AX5400 Dual-Band Wi- 6,990.00 6,500.00 480.00.
Fi 6 Router e
-unn Nothing Follows nnn-
Delivery Terms: 30CD 30CD 30CD 30CD
Documentary Requirements:
Mayor's/Business Permit COMPLIED COMPLIED COMPLIED COMPLIED
Philgeps Registration Number 3798 29874 52877 35171
Notarized Omnibus Sworn Statement NO SUBMISSION |COMPLIED COMPLIED COMPLIED

Income/Business Tax Return NO SUBMISSION [COMPLIED COMPLIED COMPLIED

Mode of Procurement: NP - Small Value Procurement
PhIIGEPS Ref. No.: 8826564

Canvassed by: James Ber

RECOMMENDATION:

For Items 1, 6, 11 & 24, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES has the lowest calculated bid and is the responsive bidder.
For Item 2, TAIPAN MARKETING is the responsive bidder. o o

For Items“??, 9 & 10, no award, for recanvass. P Loy e Gom L ongl e

For Items 4/ 12, 13,17, 18, 19 & 21, HEXACOM ENTERPRISES is the responsive bidder.

For Items 5, 8, 15, 16 & 22, 'HEXACOM ENTERPRISES is the sole and responsive bidder.
For Item 14 & 20, no award, for review of technical specifications and approved budget for the contract.

For Item 23, no bid, for recanvass.

Committee on Bids and Awards:
—

’%Wﬁ@'“

JORL M. ADDAWE = LORIA Q. RO GUERA

ﬂ‘,\,ﬁ ((L/ \L/o\ a/ ice Chair

CECILIA FE S. ABALOS

Member

ICKLAY ARIS A. NALDO
Member
TY
APPROVED . =

Action of the Head i_fthe Procuring Entity:

CORAZON L. ABANSI
Chancellor

-

TNT OFFICE (5PR.0)
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