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3% Hydrogen Peroxide, 200 mL

500.00

MO BID

OFFER:

Hydrogen Peroxide 3% (1vol), per bottle

bt

Absolute Alcohol, 100%, 2.5lit/bot

2,787.30

NO 81D

OFFER:

Absolute Alcohol,100%, 2.5lit/bot, Chem Supply

bt!

Absolute Ethanol, pure, 99.9%, 2.5L

2,787.30

OFFER:

Absolute Ethanol, pure, 99.9%, 4L, JT Baker

btl

Ammonium sulfate, 500g, reagent grade, with no less that
3yrs expiration date from the date of purchase

OFFER:

4,250.00

935.00

Ammonium sulfate, 500g, reagent grade, with no less that
3yrs expliration date from the date of purchase, HI Medla

990.00

bt

Benzoic acid, 500g,with no less that 3yrs expliration date
from the date of purchase

NO B0

6,500.00

1,375.00

btl

Blood Agar base, 500g

3,720.25

kg

Borax

OFFER:

2,500.00

A

i)

1,500.00

Borax, Technical

btl

Bovine serum albumin, 25g, heat shock fraction, pH 7,
298%,with no less that 3yrs expiration date from the date
of purchase

OFFER:

Bovine serum albumin, 10ml, heat shock fraction, pH 7,
298%,with no less that 3yrs expiration date from the date
of purchase, per Vial

930.00

Bovine serum albumin, 50g, heat shock fraction, pH 7,
298%,with no less that 3yrs expliration date from the date
of purchase, Si-Al #A9647

bt

Castor OIl (500mi/btl)

NO BlD

340.00

10

N

pck

Citric acid (500g/pack)

NO BID

920.00

21,360.00

NO 81D

770.00

OFFER:

Citric acld (500g/pack), Food Grade

11

btl

Coconut OIl (500mL/btl)

12

cby

Denatured alcohol, 20L carboy

180.00

950.00

2,400.00

1,800.00

13

bt

Diethyl ether, 2.5L, with no less that 3yrs expliration date
from the date of purchase

NO BID

14

NI W N[N

cby

Ethanol, 95%, technical grade, carboy

4,008.75

m
o 810 Iy

15

Glycerine

O BID

OFFER:

419800700

2,500.00

i

1,467.00

Glycerine, Technical

380.00

btl

Hydrogen Peroxide 30%,500m|/bot

MO 81D

NO BID

3,700.00

OFFER:

Hydrogen Peroxide 3%, 1L/bot

950.00

btl

LB Broth with Agar, 2509

MO BID

OFFER:

LB Broth with Agar, 250g, Si-Al #2897

18

bt

Mcconkey Agar, 500g

3,350.00

OFFER:

100}

Mcconkey Agar, 500g, Titan Media

2,180.00

19

btl

Napthaleen Acitic Acid

NO BID

OFFER:

Napthaleen Acitic Acid, 100g

2,420.00

btl

Nuclelc aclid stain (non-carcinogenic), 1ml tube

NO BiD

NO BID

btl

Nutrient Agar ,500g/bot

3,925.00

NO BID vﬂ(

o=

TB50700.

OFFER:

Nutrient Agar ,500g/bot Titan Medla

2,255.00

btl

Olive Oil (500mL/btl)

650.00 [/

/deb
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23

bt

Petroleum ether, reagent grade, 4L, with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase

NO BID

OFFER:

Petroleum ether, reagent grade, 4L, with no less that 3yrs
expiration date from the date of purchase, JTB

4,450.00

Petroleum ether, reagent grade, 4L, with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase, Labscan

24

bt!

Phenol Detached Crystals-500g, crystalline form, with no
less that 3yrs expiration date from the date of purchase

NO BID

NO BID MO BID

OFFER:

Phenol Detached Crystals-500g, crystalline form, with no
less that 3yrs expiration date from the date of purchase,
Loba Chemie

25

bt

Phenolphthaleln solution (60ml/bottle)

NO iD

OFFER:

%’,‘ﬂ/ ﬂaﬂ“o 3
(ERREI R i 5

260.00

Phenolphthaleln solution (100ml/bottle), SI-Al #219236

2,775.00

26

kg

Potassium carbonate

1,085.00

OFFER:

Potasslumcarbonate, Technical

Potassium carbonate, 500g

975.00

27

kg

Potassium Hydroxide Solution

OFFER:

Potassium Hydroxide Flakes

Potassium Hydroxide Solution, 100mI

00060]

28

bt

Potassium lodide, 500g, with no less that 3yrs expiration
date from the date of purchase

4,990.00

OFFER:

R

200.00

Potassium iodide, 500g, with no less that 3yrs explration
date from the date of purchase, Labscan

29

Propylene glycol

NO BID

30

bt

Sodium bicarbonate, reagent grade, 500g, with no less that
3yrs expiration date from the date of purchase

5,170.00

480,01 1,925.00 o

NO 8ID

OFFER:

.

i

Jy

Sodium bicarbonate, reagent grade, 1 kg, with no less that
3yrs expliration date from the date of purchase, Labscan

1,375.00

31

11

btl

Sodium hydroxide pellets,500g, with no less that 3yrs
expliration date from the date of purchase

NO BID

NO

L

OFFER:

Sodium hydroxide pellets,500g, with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase, Technical

380.00

Sodium hydroxide pellets, 1 kg, with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase, Labscan

32

kg

Sodium Lauryl Sulfate

OFFER:

950.00

Sodium Lauryl Ether Sulfate Tech

480.00

Sodium Lauryl Sulfate, Loba Chemle, 500g

33

bt

Sodium Nitrite-500g, reagent grade with no less that 3yrs
explration date from the date of purchase

NO BID

NO BID

OFFER:

1,050.00

Sodium Nitrite-500g, reagent grade with no less that 3yrs
expiration date from the date of purchase, Loba Chemie

34

kg

Stearic acld

OFFER:

4,400.00

Stearic acid, Technical

950.00

Stearic acld, Loba Chemle

1,700.00

35

kg

Stearyl Alcohol

387.00

OFFER:

Stearyl Alcohol, Technical

Stearyl Alcohol, Si-Al #0709

36

bt

6,932.00

r LIL, = '
with no less that 3yrs expiration date from the date of

nurcha

o8I0 2,800.00

OFFER:

Sulfuric acld-concentrated, 2.5L, 95-98%, reagent grade,
with no less that 3yrs expiration date from the date of
purchase, Labscan

btl

Triethanolamine (500mL/btl)

NO BID

OFFER:

Triethanolamine (500mL/btl), Technical

175000}

/dch
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