ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR THE

- BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

IT EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES OF UP BAGUIO

Canvass no. PC-20-10-1

Date: 13 October 2020

Item

PARTICULARS

Unit Cost

Tarilja
Enterprises

¥-Lira General
Merchandi

Niu.Com

Shop

QTY

UNIT

Supply and Delivery of IT Equipment and Accessories

(RFQ No. 1750)

10

Camera, Video Conferencing, Anti-glare, 16 MP, USB

1,000.00

896.00

880.00

no bid

Offer:

Camera, Video Conferencing, Anti-glare, 16 MP, USB, A4 Tech
PX810G

880,00 ' |

10

1L

extension wires - 6 gang, surge protector, 5 meters

500.00

860.00

3 no bid

[ 360.00

795.00 |

10

external hard drive, 1TB

3,000.00

3,608.00

2,980.00

N 72,100.00

Offer:

external hard drive, 1TB, Toshiba

2,980.00

10

Headset with microphone, on-ear, 3.5 mm

450.00

B880.00

Offer:

Headset with microphone, on-ear, 3.5 mm, Clever headset

420.00

Headset with microphone, on-ear, 3.8 mm, A4 Tech MK730

480.00

12

PC headsets. Driver unit: 2 x 40 mm; Frequency Response: 20Hz-
20kHz; Impedance: 320+10% @ 1kHz; Sound Pressure Level:
102+3dB/ lm W @ 1kHz; Rated Input power: 30m W; Maximum
Input Power: 40m W. Microphone: MIC Muting: yes; Frequency
Response: 100 Hz-10kHz; Impedance: 2,2kQ0+10% @ 1kHz;
Sensitivity: -51+8dB @ 1kHz 0dB~1V/Pa; Plug: 3.6mm x 2; Cord
length: 2.1m at least

&,000.00

no bid

Offer:

PC headsets, JBL T500

2,498.00

N

PC headsets, Plantronics 628

2,205.00

100

USB flashdrives, 16 GB

600.00

275.00

280.00

450.00

Offer:

U8B flashdrives, HP, 16 GB

376.00

12

USB web cameras with built-in mic. Full HD 1080p video calling (up
to 1920 x 1080 pixels); 720p HD video calling (up to 1280 x 720
pixels) with supported clients; 69° diagonal field of view; Autofocus;
1 omni-directional mic; Hi-speed USB 2.0 certified; UVC compliant
(no software installation required); Universal clip with 360° swivel;
PC and MAC compatible

3,600.00

no bid

Offer:

USB web cameras with bullt-in mic, Logitech BS25

3,895.00

USB web cameras with built-in mic, Genius ¥100 1080P wide
angle

2,8680.00

Desktop Computer, 23.8-in FHD (non-touch), Core 18-8250U, 4GB
RAM, 1TB, 930MX RGB, Winl0 with Back-UPS 1400VA, 230V, AVR

68,900.00

no bid

60,000.00

Offer:

Desktop Computer, All in One Desktop, Acer All in One C24 960
10th Gen i6. 10th Gen Intel® CoreTM 15-10210U Processor (1.6
Ghz, 6 MB cache, quad-core/8-thread, 15 W, Intel® UHD Graphics);
4GB soDIIM DDR4; 1TB 2.5-inch 5400 RPM, 7 mm high; 266 GB
M.2 2280 8olid State Drive; Intel® UHD Graphics 620; Integrated
1.0 MP HD high-sense webcam; Built-in stereo speakers; WLAN:
Wireless LAN 802.11ac + Bluetooth® 4.2 LE; LAN: Gigabit
Ethernet; USB wired keyboard & wired mouse; Size: 23.8" pre
loaded license Windows 10 Home 64-bit; with APC BX1400U-MS
700 watts, 1400V 230V, Line Interactive, (2) IEC 320 C13, (4)
Universal Receptacle (All Battery Backup) with AVR; Warranty:
1 year on parts and labor

Desktop Computer, Dell Inspiron 5490, A10, Win 10 Home, 15
102104, 8 GB, 1TB, 2GB nvidia, 23.8"

62,000.00 4

Delivery Period

30 days

30 days

30 days

ACTION TAKEN:

For items '1,8, ‘./l'nlpm Marketing is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder as to requirements, technical specifications and as per written
recommendation from the UP Bagulo BAC Technical Working Group.

£
For item 8, Tarilja Enterprises is the lowest caloulated and responsive bidder as to requirements, technical spec tions and as per written
recommendation from the UP Baguio BAC Technical Warking Group.

o
TFor items 5.3./416,'?,’ F-Lira General Merchandise is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder as to requirements, technical apecifications and as per
written recommendation from the UP Baguio BAC Technical Working Group.
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Item Tarilja Taipan ¥-Lira General Nin.Com
PARTICULARS
No. Unit Cost Enterprises Marketing Merchandise |Computer Shoj
QTY | UNIT
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