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- 1y BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Governor Pack Road, Baguio City
ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION FOR THE
PH RAPHIC AND AUDIO E NT OF B 0
Canvass no. PC-20-10-189 Date: 13 October 2020
Item X Tarilja Ulytech F-Lira General Rynav
No. PARTE 8 Uit Coss Enterprises Trading Merchandise | Enterprises
QTY | UNIT
Supply and Delivery of Photographic and Audio Equipment
(RFQ No. 1749)
1 1 set | 3200K-BB500K LED Video Lighting kit with batteries and Remote 25,000.00 35,000.00 18,000.00 no bid
Offer:
LED Video Lighting w/ Batteries and Remote, Set includes: 2 pes
Yongnuo LED video lights; 2 pes Battery Charger of NP-FE50 24.990.00
Battery; 4 pes Battery NP-FS50; 2 pe Light Stand 6ft.; 1 pe Jenbei ‘N
Bag for Video Lights
2 1 set |Mirrorless Digital Camera with 15-45mm lens 40,000.00 38,600.00 no bid
Offer:
Mirrorless Digital Camera with 15-45mm lens, Fuji X-T200 48,995.00
Mirrorless Digital Camera with 15-45mm lens, Fuji X-T100 39,990.00
3 1 pc |Triped 15,000.00 9,600.00 no bid
Offer:
Tripod, Benro TMA37A, 16 kgs max load 10,4985.00
Tripod, without ball head, Benro TMA47AL Long Series 4 14.990.00
Mach3 Aluminum Tiipod i i
4 1 pc |Wireless microphone 18,000.00 19,896.00 9,600.00 no bid
Offer:
Wireless microphone, Rode Wireless Go Compact Wireless 14,995.00
Microphone System i
Delivery Period 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
ACTION TAKEN:

For items 1-4, F-Lira General Merchandise is the lowest calculated and responsive bidder as to requirements, technical specifications and as per written

recommendation from the UP Baguio BAC Technical Working Group.
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