Republic of the Philippines

University of the Philippines Baguio
| Governor Pack Road, Baguio City

' Telefax No. 442-3888/442-3484
www.uph.edu.ph

Notice of Award

July g, 2022

Susan Galos
Sales Representative
TSB BAZAAR

#49-50 Magsaysay Avenue, Baguio City

074-619-2911

Dear Ms. Galos:

We are happy to notify you that your bid for the supply and delivery of INKK. CONSUMABLES for the
University of the Philippines Baguio under RFQ number 2349 is hereby awarded to you at a contract price
equivalent to Seventy Six Thousand One Hundred Ninety Five Pesos and Fifty Centavos Only. (Php

76,195.50)

You are hereby required to enter into the contract within the (10) calendar days upon receipt of this Notice

of Award.

Very truly youus,

oot

Dt. CORAZON L. ABANSI

UP Baguio, Chancel%

Conforme:

UAMTE, Pt

(Name of Representative of Bidder)

Date; leb‘ &4 "—2“2

sy
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BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
University of the Philippines Baguio
Gavernor Pack Read, Baguio City

INK CONSUMABLES FOR THE UNIVERSITY

ABSTRACT OF QUOTATION ON PRICE FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF

Canvass no, PC 22.07.1%6 ' JULY 7,2022
: LASER BAGUIO PRINCE
‘:;“ - PARTICULARS ABCPERITEM| TSBBAZAAR MARKETING ENTERPRISES
QTY [ UNIT i
11 1 crt |Brother MFC L3770 CDW, Drum Cart - 263CL P 1,500.00 7,296.40 11,650.00 NO BID
2] 2 ot |Brother MFC L3770 CDW, Taner TN-263, Black P 1,600.00 3,579.60 3,800.00 NOQ BID
3 2 crt  |Brother MFC L3770 COW, Toner TN-263, Cyan P  1,600.00 3.579.60 1.800.00 NQ BID
4 =z ert |Brother MFC L3770 CDW, Taner TN-263, Magenta P 1,600.00 3,579.60 3,800.00 NO BID
5 2 ert |Brother MFC L3770 CDW, Taner TN-263, Yallow P _1600.00 3,579.60 3.800.00 NO BID
6| 4 ot |INK CART, EPSON 137664200 (T6642), Cyan P 300.00 200.00 285.00
7l s ot |INK CART, EPSON C13T664300 (T6643), Magenta P 300.00 200.00 285.00
8] 5 ot |INK CART, EPSON C13T664400 (TEG44), Yellow P 300.00 200.00 285.00
9 1o btl [INK CART, EPSON T673, Black iid 550.00 540.54 } NOQ BID
10 & btl [INK CART, EPSCN T673, Cyan hid 550.00 540.54 NO BID
11] 4 btl _HNK GART, EPSON TE73, Magenta P 530.00 540.54 NQ BID
12f 4 btl  {INK CART, EPSON T673, Yellow bl 550.00 GA0.54 y{els NO BIP
13] 1 crt {INK CART, HP GF237A, Black ¥ 11,100.00 NG BID NO BID NO BIB
14| 2 crt  |INK CART, HP GN692AA, {(HP704), Black P 500.00 £535.00 575.00 675.00
150 1 crt  JINK CART, HP CN623AA, (HP704), Tri-calor T 500.00 .00 575.00 675.00
18] , et {ink Cartridgs for Brather MFC-123300W, LC3617-Black I 5,000.00 760,00 NO BID
17 4 ot |ink Carirjdge for Brother MFC-J2330DW, LC3817-Cyan i 2,000.00 625.00 NO BID
13 et [ink Cariridge for Brother MFG-J23300W, LC3617-Magenta | P 2,000.00 625.00 NO BID
19 4 atl {k Cadr;Idge for Brother MFC-J23300W, LC3617-Yellow P 2,000.00 625.00 NO BID
20 1 bil _|tnk Cariridgs, MOHS4AE (HPGT52), Cyan P 315.00 324.80 310.00 BIoT
21 1 bl |ink Carlidge, MOHS5AE (HPGT52), Magenta P 315.00 324.80 310.00
22| 1 btl  }ink Cartidge, MOHSBAE (HPGT52), Yellow r a15.00 324.80 310.00
23] 1 btl  |Ink Cariridge, MOBS7AA (HPGTS1), Black P 315.00 324.80 310,00 A
24| 13 btl [ink, Epsen L3150, 003, Black bl 280.00 273.76 270.00
25| 5 btl |Ink, Epson, G01, Black g 500.00 80.2. Q.00
26| S btl [Ink, Epsen, 601, Cyan jid 500.00 13790 320.00 320.00 |
27 s btl [Ink, Epsan, 004, Magenta id 500.00 B ¢ 320.00 320.00
28] S btl [Ink, Epson, 001, Yellow P 500.00 C 20.00 20.00
29| 13 bl |Ink, Epsen, L3150, 003, Cyan P 205.00 200.00 286.00
30| 13 bil |Ink, Epson, L3160, 003, Magenta P 295.00 2006.00 286.00
31| 19 bil |Ink, Epscn, L3150, 003, Yellow P 205.00 290.00 286.00 CORIE
321 2 crt |[TONER CART, HP CE2B5A {HP85A), Black P 3,500.00 000.00 000.00 folsHel
33 1 cri_ |TONER CART, HP 026124, Black P 4,600.00 i 4:000.00 3,200.00
) crt__|Toner Garridgs for Brother Printer TN-2260 B 2,300.00 2,200.00 3,375.00
35| 10 crt | Toner Carridge for Brother Printer TN-2360 P 2,300.00 i 2,200.00 NO BID
36 1 crt_|Toner Carridge, HP CF217A [HP17A) Black Laser Jeot s 3,800.00 NO BID 600.00 [
3 e crt | Toner Cartridge, HP CF280A, Laserfet Pro MA01/M425 P 6,200.00 00 6,300.00 00.00
8] 1 ¢t |Taner Carfridge, HP CF281A {HPB1A) Black Lasertet P 10,700.00 NQ BID 3 2 NQ BID
3% ert  |Toner Cartridge, HP CF400A {HP201A; Black Laserdet P 4,500.00 NO BID 4,900.00
4 1 crt  |Toner Cartridge, HP CF40-A (HP201A} Cyan by 4,500.00 NQ BID 4,500.00
41] 1 et |Toner Cariridge, HP CF402A (HP201A} Yellow P 4,500.00 NQ BiD 4,500.00
42 1 crt |Toner Cartridge, HP CF403A (HP201A} Magenta P 4,500.00 NO BID 00.00 ‘
431 2 btl _[Toner cdrtidge W1103A, Black P §50.00 NO BID NO BID
DOCUMENTARY REQUIREMENTS:
Mayor's# Business Permit: complicd complied complied
PhilGERS Registration: cemplied complied complied

Mode of Procutement:

| Shopping (B)

PhilGEPS Registration no.: 8671823
ACTION TAKEN: '
For items no. 16, 17, 18, 19, 26, 27, 28, 33, 34, 35 AND 37, TSB BAZAAR has the lowest calculated bid and is the responsive bidder.

For items no. 9, 10, 11, 12, 38 AND 43, LASER MARKETING has the lowest caleulated bid and is the tespensive bidder.

Fot items no. 6, 7, 8, 20, Z1, 22, 23, 24, 25, 19, 30,31, 32, 36, 39, 40, 41 and 42, BAGUILO PRINCE ENTERPRISES has the lowest calculated bid and is the

tesponsive bidder,

For items no. 1, ?.; 3,4, 5, 14 and 15, O AWARD, for review of the approved budger for the ling item.

For itein no. 13, O BID, for recanvass.

Committee on Bids and Awards:
-

EL M. ADDAWE
Chair, Bids and Awards Commil

'Dr. CORAZON L. ABANSI
© LIP Baguio, Chancellor

St

(i A Lo/

CECILIA FE 5, ABALO

T OYEICE (SPMQO)
AR

00"‘{
'\@ig\\*\"‘\'
?:‘\9\ ot
C,e 0? A
Page 1 of1



