



**UNIVERSITY OF THE PHILIPPINES BAGUIO**

Governor Pack Road, Baguio City 2600

Telefax No.: (074) 442-3484 /446-9973

**RESOLUTION NO. 2023-017**

**BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING HEXACOM ENTERPRISES FOR LOT 1, VERA EQUINOX TECHNOLOGIES, INC. FOR LOT 2 AND 3, AND MASANGKAY COMPUTER CENTER FOR LOT 4 AS THE LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BIDDERS FOR THE PROCUREMENT PROJECT: SUPPLY, DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION OF VARIOUS GENUINE AND BRAND-NEW IT EQUIPMENT FOR UP BAGUIO with Bid Reference No. UPB-GOODS-2023-02**

**WHEREAS**, the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC) was created to ensure transparency in the procurement process and in the implementation of procurement contracts, with the end view of guaranteeing that contracts are awarded pursuant to the provisions of Republic Act 9184 and its Implementing Rules and Regulations, and that all procurement are conducted strictly according to specifications;

**WHEREAS**, the University of the Philippines Baguio through the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC) posted the Invitation to Bid for the Procurement Project: **SUPPLY, DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION OF VARIOUS GENUINE AND BRAND-NEW IT EQUIPMENT FOR UP BAGUIO** with a total Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) in the amount of **Two Million Seven Hundred Thirty Six Thousand Four Hundred Pesos Only. (PhP 2,736,400.00)** for the four lots, at the University of the Philippines Baguio website, the PhilGEPS, and in conspicuous places at the University of the Philippines Baguio continuously for at least seven (7) calendar days starting 21 April 2023;

**WHEREAS**, on 02 May 2023 at 9:00 AM, the BAC conducted a Pre-Bid Conference for the procurement project at the Chancellor's Board Room, University of the Philippines Baguio to discuss, clarify and explain, among other things, the eligibility requirements, and the technical and financial components of the contract to be bid in which were attended by a representative from prospective bidders namely: Infoworx, Inc., Vera Equinox Technologies, Inc., Joneco Tech Marketing Corp., and Hexacom Enterprises via zoom platform;

**WHEREAS**, pursuant to the said Pre-Bid Conference, the BAC issued two (2) Supplemental/Bid Bulletins announcing clarifications and amendments to the Bidding Documents on 24 April and 06 May 2023. A copy of the Supplemental/Bid Bulletins are hereto attached, marked as **Annex "A"**;

**WHEREAS**, five (5) prospective bidders purchased bid documents to wit:

	<b>Infoworx Inc.</b>	<b>Vera Equinox Technologies, Inc.</b>	<b>Masangkay Computer Center</b>	<b>Hexacom Enterprises</b>	<b>Xitrix Computer Corporation</b>
<b>LOT 1 (DESKTOP COMPUTERS)</b>	x	x	x	x	x
<b>LOT 2 (LAPTOPS AND TABLETS)</b>		x	x	x	
<b>LOT 3 (PRINTERS AND SCANNERS)</b>		x	x	x	
<b>LOT 4 (PROJECTORS)</b>		x	x		

**WHEREAS**, during the opening of bids held on 16 May 2023, five (5) suppliers, Infoworx Inc., Vera Equinox Technologies, Inc., Masangkay Computer Center, Hexacom Enterprises, and Xitrix Computer Corporation were declared compliant in both the Technical and Financial component during the preliminary examination of bids with the following financial proposals:

	Technical/ Financial Component	Infoworx Inc.	Vera Equinox Technologies, Inc.	Masangkay Computer Center	Hexacom Enterprises	Xitrix Computer Corporation
		Bid (as read and as shout out)	Bid (as read and as shout out)	Bid (as read and as shout out)	Bid (as read and as shout out)	Bid (as read and as shout out)
LOT 1	ELIGIBLE/ COMPLYING	962,400.00	1,205,300.00	1,180,225.00	<b>926,322.80</b>	1,084,851.00
LOT 2	ELIGIBLE/ COMPLYING	No Bid	<b>428,825.00</b>	464,212.00	471,297.12	No Bid
LOT 3	ELIGIBLE/ COMPLYING	No Bid	<b>329,600.00</b>	370,917 .66	361,096.32	No Bid
LOT 4	ELIGIBLE/ COMPLYING	No Bid	500,500.00	<b>447,668.40</b>	No Bid	No Bid

**WHEREAS**, the following bidders are found to be the **Lowest Calculated Bidder** to wit:

- Lot 1 (Desktop Computers) to **Hexacom Enterprises** in the amount of **NINE HUNDRED TWENTY-SIX THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED TWENTY-TWO PESOS & 80/100 ONLY (PhP 926,322.80)**;
- Lot 2 (Laptops and Tablets) to **Vera Equinox Technologies, Inc.** in the amount of **FOUR HUNDRED TWENTY-EIGHT THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED TWENTY-FIVE PESOS ONLY (PhP 428,825.00)**;
- Lot 3 (Printers and Scanners) to **Vera Equinox Technologies, Inc.** in the amount of **THREE HUNDRED TWENTY-NINE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED PESOS ONLY. (PhP 329,600.00)**;
- Lot 4 (Projectors) to **Masangkay Computer Center** in the amount of **FOUR HUNDRED FORTY-SEVEN THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED SIXTY-EIGHT PESOS & 40/100 ONLY (PhP 447,668.40)**;

**WHEREAS**, during the post qualification period on 17-29 May 2023, the Technical Working Group (TWG) presented through their report, the result of the post-qualification and reported that **HEXACOM ENTERPRISES FOR LOT 1, VERA EQUINOX TECHNOLOGIES, INC. FOR LOT 2 AND 3 and MASANGKAY COMPUTER CENTER FOR LOT 4** has complied with the technical specifications of the project and is responsive to all legal and technical documents for eligibility, marked as **Annex "B"**;

**WHEREAS**, the BAC unanimously agreed to declare the three (3) Bidders has the **Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRB)** for the following lots:

	Infoworx Inc.	Vera Equinox Technologies, Inc.		Masangkay Computer Center		Hexacom Enterprises		Xitrix Computer Corporation
	Bid (as read and as shout out)	Bid (as read and as shout out)	Bid (as calculated)	Bid (as read and as shout out)	Bid (as calculated)	Bid (as read and as shout out)	Bid (as calculated)	Bid (as read and as shout out)
LOT 1	962,400.00	1,205,300.00		1,180,225.00		<b>926,322.80</b>	<b>926,322.80</b>	1,084,851.00
LOT 2	No Bid	<b>428,825.00</b>	<b>428,825.00</b>	464,212.00		471,297.12		No Bid
LOT 3	No Bid	<b>329,600.00</b>	<b>330,100.00</b>	370,917 .66		361,096.32		No Bid
LOT 4	No Bid	500,500.00		<b>447,668.40</b>	<b>447,668.40</b>	No Bid		No Bid

**WHEREAS**, the following bidders are found to be the **Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder** to wit:

- Lot 1 (Desktop Computers) to **Hexacom Enterprises** in the amount of **NINE HUNDRED TWENTY-SIX THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED TWENTY-TWO PESOS & 80/100 ONLY (PhP 926,322.80)**;
- Lot 2 (Laptops and Tablets) to **Vera Equinox Technologies, Inc.** in the amount of **FOUR HUNDRED TWENTY-EIGHT THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED TWENTY-FIVE PESOS ONLY (PhP 428,825.00)**;
- Lot 3 (Printers and Scanners) to **Vera Equinox Technologies, Inc.** in the amount of **THREE HUNDRED TWENTY-NINE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED PESOS ONLY. (PhP 329,600.00)**;
- Lot 4 (Projectors) to **Masangkay Computer Center** in the amount of **FOUR HUNDRED FORTY-SEVEN THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED SIXTY-EIGHT PESOS & 40/100 ONLY (PhP 447,668.40)**;

**NOW, THEREFORE,** We the Members of the Bids & Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE as it is hereby RESOLVED:

- (a) To declare and award the contract to **HEXACOM ENTERPRISES FOR LOT 1, VERA EQUINOX TECHNOLOGIES, INC. FOR LOT 2 AND 3** and **MASANGKAY COMPUTER CENTER FOR LOT 4** as **Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidders** for the Procurement Project: **SUPPLY, DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION OF VARIOUS GENUINE AND BRAND-NEW IT EQUIPMENT FOR UP BAGUIO** with Bid Reference No. **UPB-GOODS-2023-02**;
- (b) To recommend for approval by the Head of the Procuring Entity, the Chancellor, the foregoing results.

**RESOLVED,** at the Board Room, University of the Philippines Baguio this 30<sup>th</sup> day of May 2023.

  
**JOEL M. ADDAWE**  
BAC Chairman

  
**GLORIA Q. RODRIGUERA**  
Vice-Chairman

  
**ARIS A. REGINALDO**  
Member

  
**GRAZIELLE K. MICKLAY**  
Member

  
**GIOVANNI R. RUALO**  
Member

Action of the Head of the Procuring Entity: **APPROVED** \_\_\_\_\_

  
**CORAZON L. ABANSI**  
Chancellor